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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
® Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Bill Hollander

| Amount: $6,125.00 Date: May 11, 2022

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Division of Community Forestry for weekly tree watering for 49 newly planted trees along
Frankfort Avenue. All trees in the right-of-way.

City Agency: Division of Community Forestry

Contact Person: garry Edgar

Agency Phone: (502) 574-3927

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

° E blu Pconme $6,125 511.1233—_

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: __Q-177-22 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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: Interagency Name: Division of Community Forestry
Program/Project Name: Weekly watering of 49 trees along Frankfort Avenue
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes

- Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Ld [ [

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

Ld [

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

 Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. Yes

L] L[]

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? ~ No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid ‘
estimate and description of cost? Yes E]
Submitted by: _ bule Hlwida Date: >/11/2022

1 L4 e——————

Revised May 2016
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Ethridge, Kyle

From: Edgar, Barry E.

Sent: Wednesday, May 11, 2022 7:56 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.

Subject: Re: FW: Watering trees this sumer on Frankfort Ave.

Will do, thanks!

Barry Elizabeth Edgar

Community Forestry Supervisor
ISA Certified Arborist KY-9868A
Tree Risk Assessment Qualified

Barry.Edgar@louisvilleky.gov

Office: (502} 574-3927

Cell: (502) 216-6768

LOUISVILLE

PARKS
AND RECREATION

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, May 10, 2022 3:50 PM

To: Edgar, Barry E. <Barry.Edgar@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: FW: Watering trees this sumer on Frankfort Ave.

Barry,
Thanks again! We've like to fund this watering. Will DCF accept these funds?

Thank you,
Kyle
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Louisville Grows

Frankfort Ave Tree Watering

Estimate #000001

Estimate date
May 10, 2022

Estimate expiration date
Never

Customer

Louisville Metro Division of Community Forestry
Barry.Edgar@louisvilleky.gov

9300 Whipps Mill Rd

Louisville, KY 40242

Message
We look forward to working with you.

Tree Watering $6,125.00
($245.00 ea.) x 25

Subtotal $6,125.00
Tax $0.00
Total $6,125.00

Louisville Grows
1641 PORTLAND AVE, LOUISVILLE, KY 40203-1459
502-791-0966



