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CIF061522SWMS02

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
» Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin

| Amount: $1,610.00

Date: 05/26/2022

installation.

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding of $1,610.00 from D-2 CIF to SWMS for the purchase of two metal trash cans. These
cans are to be placed at/near the bus stops at the intersection of E. Indian Trail and Unseld Blvd.
{nearest address is 4700 E. Indian Trail). Public Works will work with SWMS to ensure proper

Agency Phone: (502) 574-4362

City Agency: SWMS - Solid Waste Management Services

Contact Person: Antonio Baldon, Sr. ; Assistant Director, SWMS

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

2 é 4 gt; i/z @ $1,610.00 05/26/2022

District # Council Member Signature

Amount

Date

Print Form

Approved by:

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #: CIF061522SWMS02

Budget Revision #:

Appropriations Committee Chairman

Amended Amount:
To OMB:

Date

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Completion Date:

Actual Cost:

Funds Returned:
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Department/Project: Solid Waste Management Services/
Funding of $1,610.00 from D-2 CIF to SWMS for the purchase of two metal trash cans.

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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'NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

| Interagency Name: SWMS - Solid Waste Management Services
i I — S — —— P A

=

Program/Project Name: $1,610.00 from D-2 CIF to SWMS for the purchase of two metal trash cans. |

! Yes/No/NA
_____ S R - ]
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) '
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
|iequest Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of B
| the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
iﬁéc{uest Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they N N N
i disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
; Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
| own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
! funding source is probably NDF.
!Tﬂmding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have auseful R
| life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes ;
| Ordinance Required: Is the NDF récjuest to a Metro Agency g'reaiféi'ft}{a;lﬁ B R
i $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. Ne. NA !
Fﬁrdinanéﬁequired:ﬁlé the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? -
- If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? Ne. NA
Supporting Documentation: Docs the attachment include a valid
~estimate and description of cost? Yes
\
Submitted by: Caleb Howard Date: 05/26/2022

Revised May 2016
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Howard, Caleb A.

A — —
From: Shanklin, Barbara
Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2022 12:35 PM
To: Howard, Caleb A.; Brown, Jeffrey E
Cc: Baldon, Antonio J Sr; Axsom, Amy; Haines, Matthew R
Subject: Re: new trash cans for E Indian Trl

Caleb Howard has my permission to sign for 2 waste cans for the total of $1680480 to be placed on the corner of Unseld
Blvd and Indian Trail beside the bus stops. Thanks

Get Outlook for i0S

From: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2022 12:07:31 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>; Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines,
Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: new trash cans for E Indian Trl

Will do; thank you, Jeff (and everyone elsel!)
Dr. Shanklin, will you please respond to this email with your permission for me to sign for you for this CIF?

Thank you,

Caleb Howard

Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin
District 2

Louisville Metro Council

On May 26, 2022, at 12:01 PM, Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Go ahead and appropriate for the cans and PWA will figure out the installation

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2022 11:14 AM

To: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>; Howard, Caleb A.
<Caleb.Howard @louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R
<Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: new trash cans for E Indian Trl




There are concrete benches at both bus stops. I’'m sure the benches have concrete pads. Thanks

Get Outlook for i0S

From: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2022 11:03:09 AM

To: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom @Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Shanklin, Barbara
<Barbara.Shanklin@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: new trash cans for E Indian Trl

Yes, if concrete pads are needed this will increase the overall cost.

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S10e, an AT&T 5G Evolution capable smartphone
Get Qutlook for Android

From: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2022, 10:59 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E

Cc: Axsom, Amy; Shanklin, Barbara; Haines, Matthew R; Baldon, Antonio J Sr
Subject: Re: new trash cans for E Indian Trl

Hi Jeff,

Should | just go ahead and wait until next week to create an NDF for this? I’'m sure that if concrete pads
are necessary, that that will affect the cost.

Thank you,

<imageQ001.png>

Caleb Howard

Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Dr, Barbara Shanklin
District 2

Louisville Metro Council

On May 26, 2022, at 10:52 AM, Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@|ouisvilleky.gov>
wrote:

We haven't reviewed the locations yet

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S10e, an AT&T 5G Evolution capable smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2022 10:16:04 AM

To: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard @louisvilleky.gov>; Axsom, Amy
<Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R
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<Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: new trash cans for E Indian Trl

SWMS will accept funds for receptacles.
Jeff- Have the listed locations been approved and will concrete pads be needed?

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S10e, an AT&T 5G Evolution capable smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2022 10:09:04 AM

To: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Shanklin, Barbara
<Barbara.Shanklin@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R
<Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: new trash cans for E Indian Trl

Thank you for this response. Based upon this estimate, two cans would come out to
$1610.

If that sounds right, could someone please respond to this email indicating that Public
Works will accept the funding of $1610 from D-2 NDF for the two metal trash cans to be
placed near the bus stops at E. Indian Trail and Unseld Blvd. (closest address is 4700 E.
Indian Trail).

Thank you,

<image001.png>

Caleb Howard

Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin
District 2

Louisville Metro Council

On May 26, 2022, at 10:04 AM, Axsom, Amy
<Amy.Axsom@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Those are currently at $805 each which includes freight and today
the vendor tells me they are 8-10 right now for delivery.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, May 24, 2022 9:49 AM

To: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom @louisvilleky.gov>; Baldon, Antonio J Sr
<Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@louisvilleky.gov>; Howard,
Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard @louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R
<Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: new trash cans for E Indian Trl

Amy & Antonio,



CW Shanklin is interested in getting two trash cans for the bus stops at
Indian Trl & Unseld. Could you all let us know the current cost per can
so funds can be appropriated?

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director

Metro Public Works & Assets
444 S 5th St, 4th Fi

Louisville, KY 40202

Office 502-574-0065

Cell 502-773-3222
Jeffrey.Brown@LouisvilleKY.gov






