CIF083122PW02

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin B

| Amount: $2,475.00 Date: 08/11/2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding of $2,475.00 from D-2 CIF for the creation and installation of one additonal speed hump
and one speed hump sign between Jeanine Dr. and Forest Dr. on Glen Valley Rd. This speed
hump is necessary as there have been a high number of accidents at this intersection due to

speed in the recent past that have resulted in a lot of property damage for those living near the
street. This also includes a speed hump sign.

City Agency: Public Works and Assets
Contact Person: Greg Dow (Traffic Engineering)

Agency Phone: (502) 574-3882

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Meniber Si gnatﬁr Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _CIF083122PW02 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
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Revised May 2016

Page |



NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works and Assets

Program/Project Name: $2,475.00 from D-2 CIF for speed hump b/t Jeanine Dr. and Forest Dr.

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) —
Appropriating Funding? Yes i
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with —
account numbers in the request form description? NA i
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of -
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA L
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they —
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA %
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Ve EI

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ll

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. Na. NA

Ll

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No 3
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes 3
Submitted by: Caleb Howard Date: 08/11/2022

Revised May 2016
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DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND ASSETS
LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY

GREG FISCHER VANESSA D. BURNS

MAYOR Director
TO: Councilwoman Barbara Shanklin
District 2
FROM: Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering
DATE: August 11, 2022
RE: Cost of Speed hump/signage for Glen Valley Road

One (1) Speed hump x $2,215.00 =  $2,215.00
One (1) Speed hump sign x $260.00 $260.00

Total = $2,475.00

Please consider this letter as our official Statement of Cost for all speed hump related work.

Each speed hump, including markings is $2,215.00 and each speed hump sign is $260.00. One
additional speed hump and sign will be added between Jeanine Drive and Forest Drive. The total “not
to exceed” cost is $2,475.00.

Upon funding approval, the speed humps will be installed as schedule and weather permits.

Please let me know if you have any questions. You may contact me at 574-3882.

Sincerely,

e

Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

WWW . LOUISVILLEKY.GOV
METRO DEVELOPMENT CENTER 444 SOUTH 5™ STREET SUITE 400 LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY 40202
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Howard, Caleb A.

From: Shanklin, Barbara

Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 12:38 PM
To: Howard, Caleb A.

Subject: Re: Approval to sign for you

Caleb has my permission to sign for me on the CIF to add an additional speed bump on Glenn Valley road. The amount is
$2,475.00.
Thank you.

Get OQutlook for iOS

From: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 12:27:20 PM

To: Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Approval to sign for you

Dr. Shanklin, will you please respond to this email stating your approval for me to sign for you on the CIF for the
additional speed hump on Glen Valley, near Jeanine?

Thank you,

Caleb Howard

Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin
District 2

Louisville Metro Council



Howard, Caleb A.

From: Dow, Greg

Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 12:30 PM

To: Howard, Caleb A.

Cc: Shanklin, Barbara

Subject: RE: Speed hump location on Glen Valley Road
Caleb,

Public Works and Assets will accept D-2 CIF funding in the amount of $2,475.00 for the speed hump/signage installation
project for Glen Valley Road, between Jeanine Drive and Forest Drive.

Greg

From: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 12:26 PM

To: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Speed hump location on Glen Valley Road

Awesome! Will you please respond to this email with PW’s approval to accept D-2 CIF funding for this project?

Thank you!

Caleb Howard

Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin
District 2

Louisville Metro Council

On Aug 11, 2022, at 12:24 PM, Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@Iouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Caleb,

Please see attached statement of cost and speed hump/signage layout for Glen Valley Road.
If possible, drop the signatures off on my desk or chair if I’'m not here when you come in.
Thanks,

Greg

From: Howard, Caleb A. <Caleb.Howard@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 12:12 PM
To: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@Iouisvilleky.gov>




Cc: Shanklin, Barbara <Barbara.Shanklin@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Speed hump location on Glen Valley Road

Hi Mr. Dow,

Should | keep an eye out for an estimate for this additional hump today? | will put in a CIF for it once |
get it and your approval for the acceptance of funds.

Also, when | come downtown to create the CIF, | will be dropping a couple new signature sheets (Rustic
Way and Roederer Dr.) by your office—just so you know to keep an eye for them!

Thank you,

<image001.png>

Caleb Howard

Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin
District 2

Louisville Metro Council

On Aug 10, 2022, at 11:30 AM, Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@Iouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Councilwoman Shanklin,
Please see attached layout for one additional speed hump for Glen Valley Road near the
intersection of Jeanine Drive. If the location is good, | will send you a statement of cost

but If the speed location needs to be adjusted, please indicate location and send it back
to me.

Thanks,

Greg
<Glen Valley Road layout_8-10-22.pdf>

<SOClayout Glen Valley Road_8-11-22.pdf>



