CIF083122PW14

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler l

| Amount: $27,726.48 Date: 8-10-22 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Capital Infrastructure Funding will be directed to Louisville Metro Public Works for sidewalk repairs
at Appollo Lane from Alandale Dr. to Ponder Lane both sides - ($26,152.20), Across from 6602
Ashby Lane - ($867.60) and 1926 Taffeta Dr. - ($706.68) in District 14.

City Agency: Louisville Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Hackbart

Agency Phone: (502) 574-8824

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Print Form

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF083122PW14 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Louisville Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Sidewalk Repair - Appollo Ln., Ashby Ln. and Taffeta Dr.

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Ts the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA
 Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? ~ NA- No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted byi/%%ﬂm Date: S ’(0’22

Revised May 2016
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Thieneman, Cindx L

From: Hackbart, Jeff M

Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 3:03 PM

To: Thieneman, Cindy L; Haines, Matthew R

Ce Brown, Jeffrey E; Haines, Matthew R; Muhanuka, Thierry P.; Fowler, Cindi
Subject: RE: Contact Councilwoman Cindi Fowler [#1842]

Public Works will accept the funds.

From: Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 3:01 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>;
Muhanuka, Thierry P. <thierry.mahanuka@Imgky.onmicrosoft.com>; Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>;
Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Contact Councilwoman Cindi Fowler [#1842]

Hello Mr. Haines,

Would you office accept the funds of $27,726.48 to repair the following sidewalks
Appollo from Alanadale Dr. to Ponder Ln. - $26,152.20

Across from 6602 Ashby Lane - $867.60

1926 Taffeta Dr. - $706.68

Thank you,

Cindy Thieneman

From: Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2022 3:18 PM

To: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>;
Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@louisvilleky.gov>; Muhanuka, Thierry P.
<thierry.mahanuka@Imgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Subject: RE: Contact Councilwoman Cindi Fowler [#1842]

CM Fowler,

Appoll
Below are the sidewalk repair estimates forA-pPgl-loe(in. from Alandale Dr to Ponder Ln. (both sides) and the buckled
section of sidewalk across from 6602 Ashby Lane.

SR#
LOCATION Apallo Ln. from Alandale Dr to Ponder Ln. (both sides)
REQUESTED BY

RATE \

DATE SENT 7/18/2022

ESTIMATE BY jmh
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Thieneman, Cindx L

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Monday, July 18, 2022 9:39 AM

To: Hackbart, Jeff M

Cc Brown, Jeffrey E; Haines, Matthew R; Thieneman, Cindy L
Subject: Re: Contact Councilwoman Cindi Fowler [#1842]

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Jeff,

Mr. Bagley mentions other areas of concern on Apollo Lane. Can you please inspect the entire length for tripping
hazards while on site? | appreciate your assistance and effort.

Cindi

Sent from my iPad

OnJul 18, 2022, at 9:20 AM, Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Hello Gentlemen,

I hope you had a pleasant weekend.

We received the below email from our constituent.

Councilwoman Fowler would like to get a cost repair for these sidewalks.

We are still waiting for the cost repair on Ashby lane.

If you could send over both these estimates we would like to process with CIF funds.
Thank you,

Cindy

From: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler <no-reply@wufoo.com>

Sent: Sunday, July 17, 2022 6:11 PM

To: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>; Thieneman, Cindy L
<Cindy.Thieneman@®@]Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Contact Councilwoman Cindi Fowler [#1842]

Name Richard Bagley

Address |<image003.jpg>]

9911 Appollo Lane
Louisville, KY 40272

United States

Phone (502) 447-4390

Number

Email busmanl02@cs.com




Comments

I have been calling 311 since the summer of 2019 about the sidewalk that goes by our house on Appollo Lane. there is
1 spot where the sidewalk has dropped about 2 inches or maybe a little more than that. A lady with a walker has fallen
because of that drop in the sidewalk. I'm at my wits end on what to do to get this problem fixed so people can safely
walk around the neighborhood. Now there are 2 more sections that have started to sink and a section by my driveway
that has cracked and portions of it have started to stick up creating a hazard for any one walking on the sidewalk. I'm
hoping that you can find a solution to this problem before someone gets badly hurt and possibly ends up in the
hospital or worse if they fall and hit their head. | thank you in advance for any help you can provide with this problem.
Thankyou for your time.

Richard Bagley
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Thieneman, Cindy L

From: Thieneman, Cindy L

Sent: Monday, July 11, 2022 2:32 PM

To: Thieneman, Cindy L

Subject: FW: Ashby woods sidewalk on Ashby Lane
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

From: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, July 11, 2022 11:50 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Ashby woods sidewalk on Ashby Lane

All,

This has happened before in the same area of this sidewalk just west of the entrance to Ashby Woods subdivision on
Ashby Lane. The last time it was at the same time that we had extreme heat. | assume that is what it is from this time. |
appreciate your assistance in getting it repaired as soon as possible as this sidewalk is quite busy in such close proximity
to Sun Valley Park.

Thanks gentlemen, for your help, as always.

Cindi



Sent from my
B Mail 11:45 AM Mon Jul 11 w T 5aum
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Thieneman, Cindx L

From: Muhanuka, Thierry P.

Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 8:35 AM

To: Fowler, Cindi

Cc: Thieneman, Cindy L; Haines, Matthew R; Hackbart, Jeff M
Subject: D14 - 1926 Taffeta Dr sidewalk repair estimate

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

CM Fowler,

Below is the cost estimate to repair/replace the sidewalks in front of 1926 Taffeta Dr. No work is needed at 1927 Taffeta
Dr.

SR#
LOCATION 1926 Taffeta Dr
REQUESTED BY Councilwoman Fowler
RATE 4
DATE SENT 4/5/2022
ESTIMATE BY tpm
4'x5' of sw & 4'x12' of sw, seed and

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $706.68

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will require

re-inspection.

Please let me know if you have any questions.



Harward, Sonya

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

LA Thieneman,

Hackbart, Jeff M

Wednesday, August 31, 2022 9:06 AM

Thieneman, Cindy L

Fowler, Cindi; Bell, LaTonya J.; Harward, Sonya; Haines, Matthew R; Muhanuka, Thierry P.
RE: CIF Corrections - CIF083122P14

Please see the corrected spelling of Appollo Lane in my estimate below.

SR#
LOCATION Appollo Ln. from Alandale Dr to Ponder Ln. (both sides)
REQUESTED BY

RATE 5

DATE SENT 7/18/2022

ESTIMATE BY jmh

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS

250 sy of sw and 11 cy of dw, 3 tree insp on private property
and 1 stump removal

ESTIMATE AMOUNT

$26,152.20

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

Jeff Hackbart, P.E.

Engineer 11

Department of Public Works & Assets
444 South 5" St. Suite 400
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

Office: (502) -574-8824
Mobile 502-817-2686
Email: Jeff.Hackbart@L ouisvilleky.Gov

From: Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 12:13 PM
To: Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
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<Sonya.Harward@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: CIF Corrections - CIF083122P14

Good morning Mr. Hackbart,

When you submitted my quote for sidewalks on Appollo Lane from Alanadale to Ponder, the quote had misspelled
Appollo.

Could you please send me a correction, stating the correct spelling of Appollo per LaTonya Bell’s request? Please include
all persons in this email.

Thank you,

Cindy

From: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 12:06 PM

To: Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@I|ouisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: CIF Corrections - CIF083122P14

Importance: High

Sonya, please add 1926 Taffeta Drive and change the Apallo Lane to Appollo Lane in the 8/31/22 Appropriations
Committee Agenda description. Also, on the CIF Agency Request form please change the Apallo Lane to Appollo
Lane. Thank you.

Cindy, please obtain an email from Jeff M. Hackbart stating that Apallo Ln is spelled incorrectly in error on the sidewalk
repair estimates he provided to D14 and the correct name is Appollo Ln. Thank you.

From: Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 11:15 AM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: CIF Corrections - CIFO83122P14

Good Morning LaTonya,

| noticed on the Appropriations Agenda CIF083122P14 all the information is not on the Agenda. The correct spelling of
the street is Appollo as on my CIF application. Public Works misspelled it. | also notice on the same CIF Taffeta is left off
the wording. | want to make sure Public Works gets ALL the streets that this CIF is appropriated for.

Thank you,

Cindy Thieneman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p:502.574.1114 City Hall

e: cindy.thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
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