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CIF091422PWm

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
m Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Nicole George |

| Amount: $2,400 Date: 8/30/2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

$2,400 to mark the north side of the 300 block of W Evelyn Ave for on-street parking spaces.

City Agency: Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: gtyart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502.574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

21 [H el D $1,200 8/30/2022
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _CIF091422PWm To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works & Assets / 300 Block W Evelyn Ave Parking Spaces

Additional Signatures

I bave reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works & Assets

300 Block W Eveiyn Ave Parkmg Spaces

|
|

i
Program/Project Name:
Yes/No/NA™ |
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) 1 o ]
Appropriating Funding? ( Yes B |
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with | e |
account numbers in the request form description? NA E, l‘
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of T
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA B
| Request Form: If other funds are fo be used for this project, are they -
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA B
'Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville -
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the - B
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source; If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful |
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes B
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. NA EI
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid ]
estimate and description of cost? Yes B |
Rachel Roarx District 21 Legislative Aide Date: 8/30/2022

Submitted by:

Revised May 2016
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Roarx, Rachel G.

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 1:02 PM

To: Roarx, Rachel G.; Roades, Bonnie J; Brown, Jeffrey E; Luckett, Daniel R; George, Nicole A
Katz, Rebecca A.

Cc: Triplett, Kevin D.; Hughes, Susan; Johnson, Pat W; Hall, Barbara C

Subject: RE: W. Evelyn Ave parking spaces

Yes, we will accept the funds

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 1:02 PM
To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie J <Bonnie.Roades@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey

E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; George, Nicole A.

<Nicole.George@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca A. <rebecca.katz@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Ce: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Johnson, Pat W

<Pat.Johnson@louisvilleky.gov>; Hall, Barbara C <Barbara.Hall@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: W. Evelyn Ave parking spaces

Will Public Work accept the funds of $2,400 for the project?

Rachel Roarx | Legislative Aide
Office of District 21 Councilwoman Nicole George
City Hall | 601 W. Jefferson St. | 3™ Floor

Office: (502) 574-1121

Click here to sign up for the District 21 eNewsletter!

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 1:01 PM

To: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie J <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown,
leffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; George, Nicole A.

<Nicole.George @louisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca A. <rebecca.katz@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Johnson, Pat W

<Pat.Johnson@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hall, Barbara C <Barbara.Hall@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: W. Evelyn Ave parking spaces

Rachel,

| quote this project to run $2,400 to mark the north side of the 300 block of W Evelyn Ave. The roadway isn't wide
enough to mark on street parking on both sides of the road (north and south).

Thanks,
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Stuart

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 12:24 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie J <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey
E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; George, Nicole A.
<Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca A. <rebecca.katz@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Johnson, Pat W
<Pat.Johnson@louisvilleky.gov>; Hall, Barbara C <Barbara.Hall@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: W. Evelyn Ave parking spaces

Good Afternoon Stuart,

When should we expect to see the cost estimate for Evelyn? | am trying to plan when | need to complete the paperwork
in my schedule.

Rachel Roarx | Legislative Aide

Office of District 21 Councilwoman Nicole George

City Hall | 601 W. Jefferson St. | 3“ Floor
Office: (502) 574-1121

Click here to sign up for the District 21 eNewsletter!

From: Roades, Bonnie J <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2022 8:22 AM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Sparks,

Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>; Roarx, Rachel G.
<Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca A. <rebecca.katz@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>; Johnson, Pat W
<Pat.Johnson@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hall, Barbara C <Barbara.Hall@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: W. Evelyn Ave parking spaces

Wo 22sign-02789 has been created for the No Parking signs

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrev.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, August 15, 2022 3:52 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; George, Nicole
A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>; Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca A.
<rebecca.katz@louisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie J <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>; Johnson, Pat W
<Pat.Johnson@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: W. Evelyn Ave parking spaces

Stuart,
| drafted a quick plan for the layout, could you please provide a cost estimate for the striping?

Bonnie,
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Could you please go ahead and start a Work Order for 2 new No Parking signs? Both of the No Parking signs have been
removed. The sign nearest alley still has a tap-in base still in place that needs to be removed. See attached plan for the

signage and let me know if you have any questions.

Jeffrey Brown, PE
From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, August 2, 2022 2:01 PM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; George, Nicole

A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>; Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca A.

<rebecca.katz@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin.Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: W. Evelyn Ave parking spaces

Hi Jeffl
This is the La Pinata restaurant at 4028 S. 3™ Street Councilwoman George and | were speak of. She was contacted by

the business, | believe and | was contacted by numerous residents. In my opinion, to address all concerns | would
suggest parking “T's’ like seen below (3 pics below the map) and the hatch marking at the intersections. (All 8
intersections — 2 at 3" Street, 2 at Southern Parkway and 4 at the alley. This alley is used heavily by residents to access
their homes. In most cases it is their only access. That is why they stay upset at the businesses there, the restaurant and
the Volley Ball courts)

Parking “T's” would Identify where to park and the hatches hopefully will keep them out of the intersections. LMPD
can use these to easier Identify illegal parking. They have in other areas I'have-worked improved parking. There is no
guarantee they will stay out of the hatch marked areas, however, over in St. Joe’s it has worked wonders.

I can’t make the meeting the 11" but wanted to explain my thoughts. At the very least can we see if this area is a
candidate for all this and a cost estimate? In St. Joe's it was very reasonable. Thank you for your time and assistance in

this matter!
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