CIF110222PW03

Louisvilie Metro Council City Agency Request
' Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Keisha Dorsey

| Amount: $564 Date: Oct 19, 2022

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding seurces,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Appropriating money from District 3 for (3) honorary street signs to honor former Councilwoman
Mary C. Woolridge. $188 per sign x 3 = $564 '

To be placed at:

- corner of Wingfield Ln. and Beech St. (closest to her house)

- Wingfield Ln. and 23rd St.

- Wingfield Ln. and Dixie Hwy (going down Wingfield, not Dixie)

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

3 $564 Oct 19, 2022
District # Amount Date
Appreved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: __ CIF110222PW03 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Honorary Street Signs for Mary Woolridge

Program/Project Name:
bl Ves/No/NA

"Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes
"ﬁééﬂ(ééf Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they |
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville |

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.
‘Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NAL No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment mclude a valid V.

es

estimate and description of cost‘7

Submitted by: _Keturah Morrow

Date: Oct 18, 2022

Revised May 2016
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From: Hines, William

To: Morrow, Keturah; Brown, Jeffrey; Roades, Bonnie
Subject: RE: Honorary Street Signs

Date: Wednesday, October 19, 2022 9:50:13 AM
Attachments: image001.png

image002.png

Yes will.

William A. Hines II1

Labor Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Signs & Markings Division

3507 Newburg Rd

Louisville, KY 40218

Phone: (502) 794-6862

Fax: (502) 458-4868
https://louisvilleky.gov

From: Morrow, Keturah <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2022 9:50 AM

To: Hines, William <William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey
<Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie <Bonnie.Roades@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Honorary Street Signs

Will Public Works accept the $564 from our office for the signs discussed below?

| will work to get the resolution to PW as soon as possible. The unveiling will be on November 29t at
11am. If possible, can it read “Mary Collier Woolridge Lane” or Mary C Woolridge Lane”?

Keturah Movrow, MAOL

Legislative Assistant to Keisha Dorsey
Louisville Metro Council | District Three
601 W. Jefferson St. | Louisville, KY 40202

Email: Keturah.Morrow®] ouisvilleKY.gov
Office: 502.574-1103
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From: Hines, William <William.Hines@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2022 8:34 AM

To: Morrow, Keturah <Keturah.Morrow@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey
<Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Honorary Street Signs

Good morning Keturah,
$188 per sign will be the cost. So the total for (3) will be $564
Thanks,

William A. Hines III

Labor Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Signs & Markings Division

3507 Newburg Rd

Louisville, KY 40218

Phone: (502) 794-6862

Fax: (502) 458-4868
https://louisvilleky.gov

From: Morrow, Keturah <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2022 8:21 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hines, William
<William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Honorary Street Signs

Great, thank you so much! Monday is the last deadline for the year for the council. So if someone
could provide pricing as soon as possible that will be wonderfull

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2022 7:16:52 AM

To: Morrow, Keturah <Keturah.Morrow@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hines, William

<William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>
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Subject: RE: Honorary Street Signs
All of those locations would be acceptable

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Morrow, Keturah <Keturah.Morrow@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2022 3:55 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hines, William
<William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>; Roades, Bonnie <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Honorary Street Signs

All,

Keisha wants to honor former Councilwoman Mary C. Woolridge by doing honorary street signs on
Wingfield Lane. Is it possible to do 3 of them? One at the corner of Wingfield and Beech St (closest

to her house), Wingfield Lane and S. 23" Street and Wingfield Lane and Dixie. | know Dixie is a major
thoroughfare, so the sign would be going down Wingfield not on Dixie. | plan to submit the CIF
paperwork on Monday for the new business deadline so we can do a tentative unveiling November

29 or November 30t
Let me know if this is feasible and pricing.

Keturah Morrow, MAOL

Legislative Assistant to Keisha Dorsey
Louisville Metro Council | District Three
601 W. Jefferson St. | Louisville, KY 40202

Email: Keturah.Morrow@I ouisvilleKY.gov
Office: 502.574-1103
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Mary Collier Woolridge Lane Sign Positions

Wingfield Lane & Beech Street (Primary sign)

Wingfield Lane & Dixie Hwy/US 31
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Wingfield Lane & S. 23™ Street






