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From: Gowin, Dirk
To: Morrow, Keturah
Subject: RE: South 23rd & Becker Court Cost Estimate
Date: Thursday, October 20, 2022 10:44:50 AM
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Yes we will accept.
 
Dirk Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
502.574.5925
 

From: Morrow, Keturah <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2022 11:45 AM
To: Gowin, Dirk <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: South 23rd & Becker Court Cost Estimate
 
Dirk,
 
Will you accept $48,613 from D3’s CIF to complete this project?
 
Keturah Morrow, MAOL
Legislative Assistant to Keisha Dorsey
Louisville Metro Council |  District Three
601 W. Jefferson St. | Louisville, KY 40202
Email: Keturah.Morrow@LouisvilleKY.gov
Office: 502.574-1103

 Sign up for crime alerts
 
 
 

From: Gowin, Dirk <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, October 13, 2022 4:58 PM
To: Kurowsky, Steve <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Morrow, Keturah <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, Latonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: South 23rd & Becker Court Cost Estimate
 
Steve,
 
Putting this in your queue.  Thanks.
 
Dirk Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
502.574.5925
 

From: Dorsey, Keisha <Keisha.Dorsey@louisvilleky.gov> 
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Sent: Thursday, October 13, 2022 4:43 PM
To: Gowin, Dirk <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Morrow, Keturah <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, Latonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: South 23rd & Becker Court Cost Estimate
 
Approved, can you work with Keturah to get those funds allocated by end of year
 

From: Gowin, Dirk <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, October 13, 2022 4:35 PM
To: Dorsey, Keisha <Keisha.Dorsey@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: South 23rd & Becker Court Cost Estimate
 
CW Dorsey,
 
Here’s the estimate for making the intersection look roughly like the attached, taking from the northeast
corner.
 
Dirk Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
502.574.5925
 

From: Kurowsky, Steve <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, October 13, 2022 4:13 PM
To: Gowin, Dirk <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: South 23rd & Becker Court Cost Estimate
 
Dirk,
 

Please find below my cost estimate for South 23rd & Becker Court.  My footprint may be bigger than your
sketch anticipated.
I had estimates for 12” Base Failure repair, Mill & Pave throughout the entire intersection, a minimum for
thermo paint installation, Changeable Message Signs for advanced warning, etc.  The cost is approx. $50,000
for construction.
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Thanks,
 
Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government
Transportation Division
Metro Development Center
444 South 5th Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202
Tel (o): (502) 574-8743
Tel (c): (502) 565-7601
Steve.Kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov
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