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CIF120722PW12

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
x Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
l Primary Sponsor: Councilman Rick Blackwell/District 12 |

| Amount: 3241 Date: 11/14/2022 [

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding for the repair of sidewalk at 4700 Hawthorne Place Dr (On valley
College Dr side).

City Agency: Public works
Contact Person: Jeff Hackbart

Agency Phone: (502) 574-8824

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

12 T ?)YJMY . 11/15/2022

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public works/sidewalk repair on Hawthorne Place Drive

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Sidewalk repair on Hawthorne Place Drive

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA- No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: Heather Blazis Date: 11/14/2022

Revised May 2016
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From: Hackbart, Jeff M
To: Blazis, Heather; Muhanuka, Thierry
Cc: Haines, Matthew; Blackwell, Rick
Subject: RE: Sidewalk Valley College Drive Estimate
Date: Monday, November 14, 2022 8:46:48 AM
Attachments: image002.png

image003.png
LA Blazis,

Public Works will accept the funds.

Jeff Hackbart, P.E.

Engineer 11
Department of Public Works & Assets

444 South 5t St. Suite 400
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
Office: (502) -574-8824
Mobile 502-817-2686
il: Jef 7 isvi v

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 1:26 PM

To: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.mahanuka@Imgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M
<Jeff.Hackbart@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Blackwell, Rick <Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Sidewalk Valley College Drive Estimate

OK, I will work on the CIF for this. Will you accept $3,241 for this sidewalk repair?
Heather

Heather Blazis | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell/District 12
601 W._Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
p: (502) 574-1112 f:(502) 574-3363
wwwarickblackwell .com

From: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.mahanuka@Imgky.onmicrosoft.com>
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Sent: Tuesday, November 8, 2022 1:16 PM
To: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M

<Jeff Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>; Blackwell, Rick <Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Sidewalk Valley College Drive Estimate

If you want it to be repaired quickly you will have to fund it. Otherwise, | can add it to our sidewalk
backlog list awaiting funding.

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 8, 2022 12:58 PM

To: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.mahanuka@|mgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@|ouisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M
<Jeff.Hackbart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Blackwell, Rick <Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Sidewalk Valley College Drive Estimate

Thank you for this. Is this something that is expected that D12 will cover the cost of? It sounds like
there are some additional issues. Please let me know.

Thank you,

Heather

Heather Blazis | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
p: (502) 574-1112 f: (502) 574-3363
www.rickblackwell.com

From: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.mahanuka@Imgky.onmicrosoft.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 8, 2022 9:57:46 AM

To: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M
<Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Valley College Drive Estimate

LA Blazis,

Below is the cost estimate to repair/replace the sidewalk in front of 4700 Hawthorne Place Dr (On
Valley College Dr side). Please let me know if you have any questions.

SR#
LOCATION 4700 Hawthorne Place Dr (On Valley College Dr side)
REQUESTED BY LA Blazis

RATE R5

DATE SENT 11/8/2022

ESTIMATE BY ™
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MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 13'x4' of sw, seed and protection

ESTIMATE AMOUNT $3,241.00
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

Thanks,
Thierry M.

From: Kurowsky, Steve <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, November 2, 2022 11:50 AM

To: Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>; Muhanuka, Thierry
<thierry.mahanuka@Imgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Sidewalk Valley College Drive

Please see the following sidewalk complaint.

I think that there might be a bigger issue here. The pipe might be broken somewhere underneath the
sidewalk and thus may be in need of repair also. Can you check to see if this is already in your
database.

This whole location reeks of sidewalk related issues....

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 4:47 PM

To: Kurowsky, Steve <steve kurowsky@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Sidewalk Valley College Drive

Good afternoon, Steve. | followed up with the constituent regarding fixing the gap in the sidewalk on
Valley College. He was very thankful. | let him know that no area was detected for repair at this time
on the other side of Valley College as we discussed. He sent me these pictures. | told him | would

forward along. Apparently part of the issue is overgrown vegetation that is blocking the sidewalk and

then an area where it has collapsed.
Thanks,
Heather

Heather Blazis | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell/District 12
601 W._Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
p: (502) 574-1112 f:(502) 574-3363

wann rickblackwell .com




