NDF120722BS25

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
X Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Amy Holton Stewart |

| Amount: $1,990.00 Date: Nov 21, 2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

$1,990.00 to Brightside for a landscaping beautification project at Francell Court's pump station /
cul-de-sac. Installation of 3 - 6 foot Emerald Green Arborvitae with brown mulch.

TFunding-Seurce:

City Agency: Brightside

Contact Person: Lorri Roberts

Agency Phone: 574-4167

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

25 MM W $1,990.00 Nov 21, 2022

District # Courftil Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:

Reference #: _NDF120722BS25 To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:

Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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11/21/22, 11:57 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

Francell Court Beautification CIF

Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Mon 11/21/2022 11:52 AM

To: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Brian,
Please sign the Francell Court Beautification CIF for $1,990.00.

Thank you,

Amy Holton Stewart

District 25 Councilwoman
601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: amy.holtonstewart@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKAD c5ZDNiMjFhLWV]MmMINDYwYy04 OGEyLT|jYzJhMGVhYWVmMZQBGAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7Top8ESJ...  1/1



NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Brightside

Program/Project Name: Francell Court Pump Station Beautification
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

: Yes_ NA

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have auseful -
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA. No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: Brian Powell Date: Nov 21, 2022

Revised May 2016
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11121122, 11:57 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

RE: Estimate for Services

Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Mon 11/21/2022 11:18 AM

To: Powell, Brian <Brian.Poweli@louisvilleky.gov>;Bell, LaTonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>;Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>;0'Brien, Jeff
<Jeff.OBrien@louisvilleky.gov>

Yes we will.

Thank you,
Lorri Roberts
Director, Brightside Inc.

- .. U ' 4
- oneBrght Gy,
-

Br"@side

From: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 21, 2022 11:17 AM

To: Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>; O'Brien, Jeff
<Jeff.OBrien@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Estimate for Services

LaTonya,

Can we amend the NDF to CIF ordinance to fund this request as well?
We need to move an additional $1,990.00.

If we can do this, | will submit the CIF paperwork asap.

Lorri,
Will Brightside accept $1,990.00 from District 25 to fund this project?

Thank you,

Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant

Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart
District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: brian.powell@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

From: Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Sunday, November 20, 2022 6:27 PM

To: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@ louisvilleky.gov>; Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@ louisvilleky.gov>; O'Brien, Jeff
<Jeff.OBrien@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown®@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Fwd: Estimate for Services

Hello all,
Thank you for you patience while | kept on BLC to get this quote solidified. Attached you will find the quote we received to replace and remulch

the pumping station island.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKADcSZDNiMjFhLWV]MmMINDYwYy04OGEyLTIjYzZJhMGVhYWVmMZQBGAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7Top8ESJ...  1/2



Brownsboro Lawn Care Quote 3455
From Brownshboro Lawn Care
Bill To 444 S Fifth Street; Suite 200

Operation Brightside Louisville, Kentucky 40202
444 S Fifth Street; Suite 200

Louisville, Kentucky 40202

Service / Product Description Qty |Rate Total
Landscape Installation 6'-7' Emerald Green Arborvitae 3 $175.00 $525.00
Brown Dyed Mulch Brown Dyed Mulch 6 $47.50 $285.00
Landscape Installation Labor to install 3 Emerald Green Arborvitae, prep bed for mulch, 1 $1180.00 $1180.00

apply pre-emergent and install mulch

Total $1990.00



11121122, 11:13 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

Fwd: Estimate for Services

Roberts, Lorri <Lorri Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>
Sun 11/20/2022 6:27 PM

To: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>;Powell, Brian
<Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>:0'Brien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

ﬂ]l 1 attachments (67 KB)

Quote_Brownsboro Lawn Care.pdf;

Hello all,

Thank you for you patience while | kept on BLC to get this quote solidified. Attached you will find the
quote we received to replace and remulch the pumping station island.

It looks like the labor will be the most expensive piece which is not surprising. Please let me know your
thoughts.

Thank you,
Lorri Roberts
Brightside

Begin forwarded message:

From: Brownsboro Lawn Care <mail@serviceautopilot.com>

Date: November 20, 2022 at 6:18:00 PM EST

To: "Roberts, Lorri" <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Estimate for Services

Reply-To: Brownsboro Lawn Care <adam@brownsborolawncare.com>

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe

https://outlook.office.com/mailfinbox/id/ AAMKADc5ZDNiMFhLWVjMmMIND YwYy04 OGEyLTIjY zJhMGVhYWVmZQBGAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7Top8E9J...  1/2



11121122, 11:13 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

\’BROWNSBORO LAWN CARE\)'

LANDSCAPE DESIGN & MAINTENANCE ¢ LIGHTING ¢ PATIO ¢ FERTILIZATION * IRRIGATION
ALL YOUR LAWN & LANDSCAPE NEEDS
6405 REGENCY LN
LOUISVILLE, KY 40207
502-724-3619
adam@brownsborolawncare.com

www.brownsborolawncare.com

Hi,

Thank you for filling out an Estimate Request form. We will have an Estimator contact you
to discuss your needs and to set up a time to view the property. We look forward to working

for you.
Thanks,

Brownsboro Lawn Care

fIvloTin

httpsjlouﬂook.ofﬁce.corn/mailﬁnboxﬁd/AAMkADcSZDNiMjFhLWVjMmM!NDYwa04OGEyL'ﬂjYthMGVhYWVmZQBGAAAMADBchdeBTTopBEQJ... 212



11/21/22, 11:59 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>

Sun 11/13/2022 12:56 PM

To: Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>:Holton Stewart, Amy
<Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>;O'Brien, Jeff <Jeff. OBrien@louisvilleky.gov>
Lorri,

CW Holton Stewart asked that | follow up again to ask for the estimate and for a confirmation that
Brightside will accept the funds for this purpose. We need to submit the appropriation no later than
11/22/22 for this item to be on the Metro Council Agenda & have time to be approved. If we do not
receive the estimate and email prior to this date it will be too late for us to approve the appropriation.

Please provide the estimate as soon as possible.

Thank you,

Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant
Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart
District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: brian.powell@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

From: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 4:47 PM

To: Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown,
Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Lori,
Thank you for your email. Please let me know when we have an official estimate. | need the quote and a

confirmation from Brightside that you will accept the funds for the purpose of the estimate so we can
submit the Neighborhood Development Fund.

Thank you,

https:/foutiook.office.com/mail/ AAMKADCSZDNIMjFhLWViMmMINDYwYy04OGEYL T YZJhMGVhYWVmZQAUAAAAAAD BcHpXdxB7Top8EQJQIQVXA...  1/9



11/21/22, 11:59 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant

Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart
District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: brian.powell@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

From: Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 4:27 PM

To: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoItonStewart@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown,

Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

All,

| am still awaiting final coat estimate from our vendor but based on a similar project we did last spring
and adding a slight increase for labor and inflation you would likely be looking at an investment of
$750 to replace the damaged tree/shrubs a lay fresh mulch to help mitigate weeds next spring.

| will still flow up with the final official pricing as soon as | have it.

Thank you,
Lorri Roberts
Brightside

On Oct 25, 2022, at 9:04 PM, Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Thank you for the update and ensuring the contractor provides an estimate as soon as possible.

Thank you,

<Qutlook-zxbai0sq.png>

Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant

Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart
District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: brian.powell@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

https://outiook.office.com/mail/AAMKADCSZDNIMjFhLWVMMMINDYwYy04 OGEYLTIjYzJhMGVhYWVmMZ QAUAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7 Top8EQJQIQVXA...  2/9




11/21/22, 11:59 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

From: Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2022 9:00 PM

To: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>; IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Beeler, Vanesha
<Vanesha.Beeler@louisvilleky.gov>; Gribbins, Elizabeth <elizabeth.gribbins@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Hi Brian,

| followed up with our contractor this afternoon and and will follow back up with you tomorrow either
way. | understand the island is a priority for you and your constituents. | have unfortunately been
dealing with several issues surrounding planting events and utility markings that have diverted my
attention.

Thank you for your persistence in getting this resolved.

Thank you,
Lorri Roberts
Director - Brightside

Louisville Forward

444 S Fifth Street; Suite 200
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-4167

Cell: (502) 528-0084
Lorri.roberts@louisvilleky.gov

From: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2022 8:37:14 PM

To: IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>; Beeler, Vanesha
<Vanesha.Beeler@I|ouisvilleky.gov>; Gribbins, Elizabeth <elizabeth.gribbins@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Vanesha & Elizabeth,
Could you please assist our office in securing the below stated estimate?

Lorri called me to confirm that she was expecting an estimate back in September, but we have heard
nothing sense. We would very much like to spruce this cul-de-sac up for our community and neighbors.

Thank you,
<Outlook-ziaspvro.png>

Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant
Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart

https://outiook.office.com/mail/ AAMKADcSZDNIMjFhLWVIMmMINDYwYy04 OGEyLTIjYzJhMGVhYWVmZQAUAAAAAADBCHPXdxB7Top8ESJQIQVXA... 319




11/21/22, 11:59 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

District 25
601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: brian.powell@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

From: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 10:51 PM

To: [RVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Roberts, Lorri <lLorri.Roberts@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Christina Tomasulo
<christina.tomasulo@Ilouisvillemsd.org>; Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Lorri,
Following up again. Do we have a quote?

Thank you,

Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant

Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart
District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-1125

From: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 10, 2022 12:30 PM

To: IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Christina Tomasulo
<christina.tomasulo@louisvillemsd.org>; Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Lorri,
I am following up from last month's conversation regarding a potential Brightside landscaping

improvement project for the cul-de-sac of Francell Court, which hosts an MSD pumping station.
| understood we were expecting a quote for the cost of the improvements. Please provide the cost

estimate.

Mr. Sample,

Please note that Public Works states that each property owner is responsible up to the center line of the
road for their section of this grass/landscaped cul-de-sac. MSD has stated below that they are not
responsible for the landscaping/maintenance of the cul-de-sac.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/AAMKADCSZDNiMjFhLWVMmMND YwYy04 OGEyLTIjYzJhMGVhYWVmMZ QAUAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7 Top8E9JQIQVXA...  4/9



11/21/22, 11:59 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

If you are aware of a non-profit HOA or Neighborhood Association that we could provide Neighborhood
Development Funds to, we could support the financing of beautification project here. | have asked
Brightside if this is something they would be able to do for us. We cannot provide funding or write
ourselves checks to go to a store and do this work, we must appropriate it for specific projects to specific
non-profit organizations like a HOA or neighborhood organization for this purpose.

Are you aware of a non-profit HOA or Neighborhood Association for your area that we can fund an NDF
for the beautification?

Thank you,

<Outlook-10hgtp0j.png>

Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant

Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart
District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: brian.powell@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net> = B3
To: Holton Stewart, Amy Sun 10/9/2022 6:48 PM

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe

well, it's been more than two months and apparently nothing will be done. msd claims it is the
responsibility of the developer. i still call BS on this since the developer (john lawson) has been
dead for quite some time. thanks for looking into this but i am resigned to the fact that this is
just another issue unresolved in the neglected southwest area of jefferson county...

irvin b. sample jr

From: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, September 7, 2022 5:04 PM

To: Christina Tomasulo <christina.tomasulo@Ilouisvillemsd.org>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Roberts, Lorri A.
<Lorri.Roberts@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

https://outlook.office.com/mail/AAMKADC5ZDNIMjFhLWV]MmMINDYwYy04 OGEyLTIjYzJhMGVhYWVmMZQAUAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7Top8ESJQIQVXA...  5/9



11/21/22, 11:59 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Lorri,
Is this something we can provide funding to Brightside to complete a landscaping project to beautify this
cul-de-sac?

Mr. Sample,

Please note that Public Works states that each property owner is responsible up to the center line of the
road for their section of this grass/landscaped cul-de-sac. MSD has stated below that they are not
responsible for the landscaping/maintenance of the cul-de-sac.

If you are aware of a non-profit HOA or Neighborhood Association that we could provide Neighborhood
Development Funds to, we could support the financing of beautification project here. | have asked
Brightside if this is something they would be able to do for us. We cannot provide funding or write
ourselves checks to go to a store and do this work, we must appropriate it for specific projects to specific
non-profit organizations like a HOA or neighborhood organization for this purpose.

Thank you,

<Outlook-fdckOeca.png>

Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant
Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart
District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: brian.powell@Iouisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

From: Christina Tomasulo <christina.tomasulo@|ouisvillemsd.org>

Sent: Wednesday, September 7, 2022 3:42 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@Iouisvilleky.gov>; IRVIN
SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Roberts, Lorri A. <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Brian, per Jeremy Goodwin, MSD Collections System and Emergency Response Manager, he met with
Mr. Sample on site last month and advised MSD does not own this property and do not provide
landscaping services in easements. We will string trim around our equipment as needed.

https://outiook.office.com/mail/ AAMKADC5ZDNiMjFhLWVJMmMINDYwYy04 OGEyLTljY zJhMGVhYWVmZQAUAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7TopBEIJQIQVXA...  6/9



11/21/22, 11:59 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

Ms. Christina G. Tomasulo

MSD Operations Business Services Administrator
700 W. Liberty Street

Louisville, KY 40203

0 502.540.6422

M 502.216.2897

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey. Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, September 6, 2022 1:10 PM

To: Brian Powell <brian.powell@louisvilleky.gov>; IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>; Roberts,
Lorri A. <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>; Christina Tomasulo
<christina.tomasulo@louisvillemsd.org>

Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Each abutting property owner would be responsible up to the centerline of the street so each resident
would share in the maintenance

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@]ouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 5, 2022 10:20 AM

Roberts, Lorri A. <Lorri.Roberts@]Jouisvilleky.gov>; Christina Tomasulo
(christina.tomasulo@]ouisvillemsd.org) <christina.tomasulo@]louisvillemsd.org>
Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

Mr. Sample,

On 8/8/22, Christina Tomasulo with MSD stated:

"I spoke to Mr. Sample a little while ago and we discussed the landscaping around the pump station. I
advised him that MSD does not have a landscaper on staff or under contract for pump station properties
and our crews have priorities of sanitary treatment, flood protection, and storm water drainage. Saying
that, I have asked our Collections System and Emergency Response Manager (Jeremy Goodwin) to call
him to discuss what we can and cannot do to the site. We also discussed MSD service levels and how
they apply to all of Louisville Metro equally. Mr. Sample was appreciative of the information and he has
my contact information if he has any future questions or concerns."

Christina,
Can you please answer Mr. Sample's question below highlighted in orange?

Jeff,

Who is responsible for the landscaping/maintenance of the Francell Court cul-de-sac? MSD has a pump
station in the center of this cul-de-sac and has stated they are not responsible for the landscaping
maintenance.

Lorri,

https:/foutlook.office.com/mail/AAMKADC5ZDNIMjFhLWVJMmMINDYwYy04 OGEyLTIjYzJhMGVhYWVmMZ QAUAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7Top8ESJQIQVXA...  7/9



11/21/22, 11:59 AM Mail - Powell, Brian - Outlook

Is this something Brightside would be able to help us with? We would like to identify what landscaping
needs to be replaced and fund a NDF to address Mr. Sample's concerns.

Thank you,

<image002.png>
Brian Powell

Legislative Assistant
Councilwoman Amy Holton Stewart
District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 2nd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: brian.powell@]louisvilleky,gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

From: IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net>
Sent: Sunday, September 4, 2022 8:34 PM

To: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@]ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: MSD pumping station 1008-PS

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

well, it's been about three months since i contacted you about the above. last month i talked
with the msd rep and they stated it is an issue that should be handled by the developer. when
msd and our former metro council person (doug hawkins i believe) approached the neighbors
effected, there was no mention at all of the developer being involved. i call BS on this. the rep
stated they are responsible for the easement only. my question to the rep was why they pay a
lawn service to cut the entire grass area when they are only responsible for the easement.
feels like the royal run-around.....

please see if there is anything else your office can accomplish...

thanks for your help...

b.sample

On Monday, July 4, 2022 at 03:34:56 PM EDT, IRVIN SAMPLE <irvinsample@att.net> wrote:

councilwoman stewart....

i met you at the retirement lunch for chief recktenward of prpfd. my neighbors and myself are
having issues with the above MSD pumping station in the 4700-4705 block of francell court in
valley station. the location is in need of landscaping and there are several shrubs that were
storm damaged and removed by neighbor and one with remaining storm damage still remains.
the area has not had any landscaping done for several years. when i asked one of the MSD
workers about the condition of the area, he stated that if it were in the east end, it would have
already been taken care of.

please see if you can have this eye sore redone.....

thanks

irvin b. sample jr

cell #502-262-2650

https://outlook.office.com/mail/AAMKADC5ZDNiMjFhLWVjMmMINDYwYy04 OGEYLTIjYzJhAMGVhYWVmMZQAUAAAAAADBCHpXdxB7 Top8EQJQIQVXA...  8/9



Harward, Sonya

=z e T S B e e e e e T
From: Bell, LaTonya
Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 9:36 AM
To: Brown, Jeffrey; Holton Stewart, Amy; Roberts, Lorri; Harward, Sonya
Cc: O'Brien, Jeff; Powell, Brian
Subject: RE: Estimate for Services

Thank you all.

Sonya, please add this email to the NDF packet. Thank you.

From: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 9:31 AM

To: Bell, LaTonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>; Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>;
Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: O'Brien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@louisvilleky.gov>; Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
<Sonya.Harward@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Estimate for Services

The island they’ll be working on is definitely within the public right-of-way.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Bell, LaTonya <LaTonya.Bell2@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 9:27 AM

To: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@Ilouisvilleky.gov>;
Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: O'Brien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
<Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Estimate for Services

Thank you CM Stewart.

Due to the content in the supporting documentation in the NDF packet it appears unclear and that’s why we want Lorri
or Jeff to confirm it. Thanks.

From: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 9:22 AM

To: Bell, LaTonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>; Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey
<Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: O'Brien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
<Sonya.Harward@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Estimate for Services

Good Morning.

This areais in Metro’s right of way.
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Thank You,
Amy Holton Stewart

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Bell, LaTonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 8:19:39 AM

To: Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Iouisvilleky.gov>; O'Brien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Powell,
Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Estimate for Services

Good morning,

Please provide clarification, does Metro Government own the property where the lawn care services will be provided or
does Metro Government have the right of way to that property? Thank you.

From: Bell, LaTonya

Sent: Monday, November 21, 2022 2:01 PM

To: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>; Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>;
O'Brien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Estimate for Services

0-349-22 has been amended to add the $1,990.00. Thank you.

From: Bell, LaTonya

Sent: Monday, November 21, 2022 1:13 PM

To: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@louisvilleky.gov>; Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>;
O'Brien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Estimate for Services

I'll follow-up with you once | hear back from the Clerk’s office and OMB relating to the question below addressed to me.
Thanks.

From: Powell, Brian <Brian.Powell@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 21, 2022 11:17 AM

To: Roberts, Lorri <Lorri.Roberts@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya <LaTonya.Bell2@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Holton Stewart, Amy <Amy.HoltonStewart@louisvilleky.gov>;
O'Brien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Estimate for Services

LaTonya,

Can we amend the NDF to CIF ordinance to fund this request as well?
We need to move an additional $1,990.00.

If we can do this, | will submit the CIF paperwork asap.

Lorri,
Will Brightside accept $1,990.00 from District 25 to fund this project?
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