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CIF012623PW06
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
X Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
[ Primary Sponsor: M gxp0  (dWRC | INMSKRAUL D |
. i 4
[Amount: § % 22 C Date: |7 /)7 ]27 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

fund! wd W purdhafe addihonal traih
binsS W W. S Cathenre aAVéa.

City Agency: PUYOU( WOY ¥ §/ Solid Waste Management Services
Contact Person: ij AN 728 =

Agency Phone: o) - SAY— Q?ag’

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

Markus Winklor |
U [ hu 4%50C 1a|i]oo

District # ~Coungil Membér-Signature- Amount Date
Presidemrombetatf of vacamtCouncil District

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF012623PWO06 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

| Intei‘agency Name: Public Works/Solid Waste Management Services

Program/Project Name: N@\M NA TN Coun g %W W\f

| Yes/No/NA

' Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

. Appropriating Funding? - \y

' Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with |

' account numbers in the request form description? - N € Pr
- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

' the request exclude the matching fund amount? s N \ \A’
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

- disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? ~ N \ \Dr

. Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the g
funding source is probably NDF. %

' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. (_8( g

. Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. === N ‘ r,\,

| , i
| Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

' If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? et \‘E‘Q‘Q\No

' Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
- estimate and description of cost? - &MJ

i . 7 /
Submitted by: QQ\M\QWQ % %ﬁﬁ Date: L.i?[ﬁ/dlﬁ
) S /

Revised May 2016
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Tazlor, Shalanna

From: Baldon, Antonio

Sent: Monday, November 7, 2022 1:18 PM
To: Taylor, Shalanna; Farrow, Tyson

Cc: Axsom, Amy

Subject: Re: Garbage Can Order

Yes, SWMS accepts funds.

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S10e, an AT&T 5G Evolution capable smartphone
Get Qutlook for Android

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, November 7, 2022, 12:13 PM

To: Baldon, Antonio <Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>; Farrow, Tyson <Tyson.Farrow@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Garbage Can Order

Got it.

Do you accept the revised funds of $3,325 for trash can placement?

Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202

| Office: 502-574-1106 |

| Direct: 502-574-3910 |

| Cell: 502-724-3684 |

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: Baldon, Antonio <Antonio.BaldonSr@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 7, 2022 12:07 PM

To: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>; Farrow, Tyson <Tyson.Farrow@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Garbage Can Order

Yes, That will be black is the only difference.

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 7, 2022 11:17 AM

To: Farrow, Tyson <Tyson.Farrow@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Baldon, Antonio <Antonio.BaldonSr@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Garbage Can Order




Ok. And are we talking about the can pictured below?

‘l = r " ! £0. Box 1700 - Hendersonville, NC 28793 - Tel: (800) 633-8241 + [828) 693-8241
- GISIII'B c a INC. { Fax (B2B} 693-8777 - www.lelsurecraftinc.com - sales@leisurecraflinc.com

32 GALLON WELDED RECEPTACLE W SPUN METAL LID portable ~ Wt. 160 Ibs
photo

Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202

| Office: 502-574-1106 |

| Direct: 502-574-3910 |

| Cell: 502-724-3684 |

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: Farrow, Tyson <Tyson.Farrow@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 1:38 PM

To: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>; Baldon, Antonio <Antonio.BaldonSr@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Garbage Can Order

Good afternoon,

The vendor made a mistake on the price please see below, thank you.

-. Sorry about that. Thanks, Mark



\plationS -

1) 5th and W St. Catherine

2) 5th and Zane and 5th and Kentucky - there is a LOT of foot traffic in this area resulting in a lot of litter.
3) 8th and WSC

4) 7th and Oak

5) 7th and Oldham - lowest priority but again another place with a lot of litter.

We are requesting a total of 6 trash bins. Can you please provide a quote for us?

Thank you,

Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W._ Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202

| Office: 502-574-1106 |

| Direct: 502-574-3910 |

| Cell: 502-724-3684 |

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 3, 2022 12:41 PM

To: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Garbage Can Order

The plastic mushrooms don't bolt down only the iron receptacles can be bolted down.
Amy- Can you work with Shalanna on ordering another round of receptacles. Thanks

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S10e, an AT&T 5G Evolution capable smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 3, 2022, 12:35 PM

To: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Garbage Can Order

They do not need to be iron. The plastic ones that bolt to the ground are fine. Should | check with Amy since she handles
our last order?

Shalanna Taylor





