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NDF030923PW04B

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
® Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Jecorey Arthur |

| Amount: 1,049.40 Date: 2/27/23 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding will cover the 5-Year LGE lease for the streetlight on Drescher Bridge., and the cost

for the installation of a new pole.

City Agency: puyblic Works

Contact Person: jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502_574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

4 1,049.40 2/24/23
District # Council Member Slgnat Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference # _ NDF030923PW04B To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works/Dreshcer Bridge Street Light

Additional Signatures

1 have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpese.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Drescher Bridge Street Light

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

estimate and description of cost?

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid v
es

Submitted by:

Revised May 2016




From: Brown, Jeffrey

To: Wright, Brianna
Subject: RE: CLIFTON HEIGHTS INFRASTRUCTURE QUOTES
Date: Friday, February 24, 2023 10:38:25 AM

Attachments: ImageQ02.png

Public Works will accept funds for the Drescher Bridge street light lease.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Wright, Brianna <Brianna.Wright@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, February 24, 2023 10:13 AM

To: Brown, leffrey <leffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: CLIFTON HEIGHTS INFRASTRUCTURE QUOTES

We want to move forward with this. Will Public Works accept the funds?

Brianna

From: Brown, leffrey <Jeffrev. Brown®@®louisvillekv.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, February 8, 2023 7:58 AM

To: Wright, Brianna <Brianna. Wright@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: CLIFTON HEIGHTS INFRASTRUCTURE QUOTES

Brianna,
| don’t think I sent this cost estimate to you but the streetlight for Dreshcer Bridge would be $1,049.40 for the 5-Year LGE lease

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Gray, Michae! [Contractor] <Michael. Grav@lge-ku.com>
Sent: Wednesday, December 28, 2022 2:19 PM

To: Brown, leffrey <leffrev. Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: CLIFTON HEIGHTS INFRASTRUCTURE QUOTES

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Jeff,

$7.08 For a pole and $10.41 a month for the Type A Cobra, but there is a 250 W HPS Cobra across the street already.

Thank you

Business Use
From: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrev.Brown@louisvillekv.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 28, 2022 8:33 AM

To: Gray, Michael [Contractor] <Michael.Gray@|ge-ku.com>
Subject: FW: CLIFTON HEIGHTS INFRASTRUCTURE QUOTES



EXTERNAL email. STOP and THINK before responding, clicking on links, or opening attachments.

Michael,
| need to get a cost estimate for a new pole and streetlight on Drescher Bridge, near the point | marked in yellow on the map below.
This will probably be a Type A on a wood pole if that option is available.

Jeffrey Brown, PE
Assistant Director
Metro Public Works & Assets
444 S 5th St, 4th £l
Louisville, KY 40202
Office 502-574-0065
Cell 502-773-3222
frey.B ®Louisyi

From: Arthur, Jecorey <Jecorev Arthur@louisvilleky, gov>
Sent: Tuesday, December 6, 2022 10:50 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Wright, Brianna <Brianna Wright@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: CLIFTON HEIGHTS INFRASTRUCTURE QUOTES

Thank you so much. Let's move forward with the Light needed at Drescher Bridge Brightside Park.

From: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrev.Brown®|ouijsvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2022 10:05 AM



To: Arthur, Jecorey </ isvi >

Cc: Wright, Brianna <Brianna. Wright@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: CLIFTON HEIGHTS INFRASTRUCTURE QUOTES

$Bcw!&(B1919 Brownsboro Rd. - Sidewalk a few feet west of entrance to Stor-All - one section is severely
buckled, impassable for wheelchairs and a tripping hazard — This is a State sidewalk so I$Bc’QN(B checking if
it can be repaired through our KYTC agreement instead of Metro Council funded.

$Bcw!&(BSidewalk at corner of Brownsboro and Haldeman on Stor-All side at signal crossing post - This is a
State sidewalk so 1$Bc’ QN(B checking if it can be repaired through our KYTC agreement instead of Metro
Council funded.

$Bcw!&(BRepaint with markings the pedestrian walkway on both sides of Hite Avenue between Cleveland
Blvd. and Lindsay Ave — I sent this one to our Signs & Markings division for refreshing instead of Council
funded.

$Bcw!&(BLight needed at Drescher Bridge Brightside Park - very dark at night — There is an existing utility
pole on the west side of Drescher Bridge, opposite side as the park, which would cost $7.69/month which would
be $461.40 for the 5-Year lease. To install a light at the park would require a pole so the cost would be
$33.89/month which would be $2,033.40 for the 5-Year lease but it would better light the park.

$Bcw!&(BLight needed on Mt. Holly at Bil Jana Drive — There is an existing LED streetlight at this
intersection but there are limbs blocking the light. Checking with LGE to remove limbs to improve the lighting.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Arthur, lecorey <Jecorev Arthur@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2022 12:32 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrev.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Wright, Brianna <Brianna Wright@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: CLIFTON HEIGHTS INFRASTRUCTURE QUOTES

May we have quotes for this work?

$Bcw!&(B1919 Brownsboro Rd. - Sidewalk a few feet west of entrance to Stor-All - one section is severely
buckled, impassable for wheelchairs and a tripping hazard

$Bcw!&(BSidewalk at corner of Brownsboro and Haldeman on Stor-All side at signal crossing post
$Bcw!&(BRepaint with markings the pedestrian walkway on both sides of Hite Avenue between Cleveland
Blvd. and Lindsay Ave

$Bcw!&(BLight needed at Drescher Bridge Brightside Park - very dark at night

$Bcw!&(BLight needed on Mt. Holly at Bil Jana Drive

Councilman Jecorey Arthur
Louisville Metro Council District 4

601 West Jefferson Street$B!&!1& (B/span>Louisville, KY 40202

P: (502)574-1104 | C: (502)200-4092

Please stay connected with us by signing up for our weekly e-news here.

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the recipient and
others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or
taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unifawful.

The information contained in this transmission is intended only for the person or entity to which it is
directly addressed or copied. It may contain material of confidential and/or private nature. Any review, retransmission, dissemination




or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is
not allowed. If you received this message and the information contained therein by error, please contact the sender and delete the
material from your/any storage medium.



Harward, Sonya

- B
From: Arthur, Jecorey
Sent: Monday, February 27, 2023 11:12 AM
To: Wright, Brianna
Subject: Re: Filing Approval | 2/27/23

You have my permission to sign for these.

From: Wright, Brianna <Brianna.Wright@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, February 27, 2023 9:30 AM

To: Arthur, Jecorey <Jecorey.Arthur@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Filing Approval | 2/27/23

Councilman Arthur,
I am filing the items below. 1 will be signing on your behalf.

CiIF:
1650 and 1652 Story Ave. — Sidewalk Repair ($16,000.00)

NDF:

Roots 101 African American Museum — Programing ($2,000.00)

LGE street light lease in the alley between 16™ & 17" north of Hale ($544.80)
Drescher Bridge Brightside Park — Pole and Street Light ($1,049.40)





