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CIF012623PW08

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
“*~Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
x Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: _Cassie Chambers Armstrong ]

| Amount: g1422 0o Date: 12/14/2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
$1422 to Metro Public Works for permanent markings on alley entrance by Jaeger Avenue

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: gy 51t Sparks

Agency Phone: (507) 574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

(assic. Qrmstrong

8 $1,422 12/14/2022
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF012623PW08 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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DocuSign Envelope ID: 543EDC48-52A7-4535-A879-9D52EAADCO38

Department/Project:
Metro Public Works Jaeger Ave alley markings

Additional Signatures

1 have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.
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lope ID: 543EDC48-52A7-4535-A879-8D52EAA0CO38

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

i Program/Project Name: Jaeger Ave Alley Markings

| Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
- Appropriating Funding?

- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
- account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
 the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF,

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
 life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
- estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

NA\ Yes

NA Yes

No_ NA
No

Yes

Submitted by: Megan Metcalf

Date: 12/14/2022

Revised May 2016
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Metcalf, Megan

From: Brown, Jeffrey

Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2022 9:29 AM

To: Metcalf, Megan; Armstrong, Cassie; Sparks, Stuart; Fred Levein
Subject: RE: Issue | could use some help with

Public Works will accept funds for the pavement markings.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director

Metro Public Works & Assets
444 S 5th St, 4th FI

Louisville, KY 40202

Office 502-574-0065

Cell 502-773-3222
Jeffrey.Brown@LlouisvilleKY.gov

From: Metcalf, Megan <Megan.Metcalf@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2022 9:28 AM

To: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie.Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Fred
Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>

Cc: Brown, leffrey <lJeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Issue | could use some help with

Hi Stuart and Jeff,
Will Public Works accept $1,422 to the markings in the alley off Jaeger?

I will get the funding processed as soon as possible, but due to Metro Council scheduling, the next committee meetings
will be held the week of January 23 with final vote February 2.

Thank you,

Megan

From: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie. Armstrong@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, December 12, 2022 5:11 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>; Metcalf, Megan
<Megan.Metcalf @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Issue | could use some help with

Great. | approve. I've copied Megan so she can get y'all the funds.
Megan, please see below.

Thanks everyone!




From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilieky.gov>

Sent: Monday, December 12, 2022 9:35 AM

To: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>; Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Issue | could use some help with

Cost to install markings at the entrance of the alley off Jaeger Ave is $1,422. Plan attached.

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Monday, December 12, 2022 7:32 AM

To: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie. Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>; Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <jeffrey Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Issue | could use some help with

We should have an estimate for you in a couple days.
Kindly,

Stuart

From: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie. Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Saturday, December 10, 2022 9:10 PM

To: Fred Levein <flevein@hellsouth.net>

Cc: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks @louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey. Brown®@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Issue | could use some help with

Hi folks,

I, too, would like an update of where we are with this. Could someone let me know when | might be able to
approve a cost estimate?

Best wishes and thanks,
Cassie

From: Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>

Sent: Friday, December 9, 2022 10:37 AM

To: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie. Armstrong®louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey <jeffrey.Brown®@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Issue | could use some help with

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Good morning everyone. Just checking to see how we were progressing on this issue. The garbage truck couldn’t turn
into the alley this week due to cars blocking access from Jaeger to the alley. Thank you

Fred Levein




Install 8" white
thermo hatching
at 10' spacing

Install 8" white
thermo hatching
at 10' spacing

Install 4" white thermo
triangular edge line (ending
20' from intersecting alley)

Parcel Report

Property Address: 1641 JAEGER AVE
Owner: WYSOR, SEAN
Parcel ID: 076B00580000
Assessed Value: $298,000.00
Acres: 0.12730
Neighborhood: 220119

Q




On Nov 15, 2022, at 10:12 AM, Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie. Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Excellent, thanks Stuart. I'll look forward to reviewing the cost estimate.

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 9:45 AM

To: Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>; Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey Brown®@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Issue | could use some help with

Everyone,

We are currently working on a plan for markings installation at the alley entrance off Jaeger Ave. We
will provide the proposed improvements and a cost estimate for your review once we have completed
it.

Kindly,

Stuart

From: Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>

Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 5:39 PM

To: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey. Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Issue | could use some help with

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Thanks for checking on this Cassie. There are two issues | guess since | was not aware of the right of way
issue. I've walked every inch of that property over many years and | don’t know where else we would
put a dumpster. If having city garbage cans in lieu of the dumpster would be preferable we are
absolutely open to that suggestion. If anyone has any ideas where else we could put garbage, we are
happy to consider that. The parking issue however needs to be resolved because no truck can pull into
the alley off Jaeger. Have a nice weekend and thank you for the help.

Fred Levein

On Nov 11, 2022, at 5:09 PM, Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie. Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>
wrote:

Hello all,




Did we ever get this resolved? Regardless of the dumpster right of way issue, it
seems like there's a separate issue about parking at the alley entrance, do | have
that correct?

Hope everyone has a good weekend!

From: Brown, Jeffrey <leffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 7, 2022 2:36 PM

To: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>; Fred Levein
<flevein@bellsouth.net>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Issue | could use some help with

Is this the streetview image of the dumpster? If so, it is located within the alley right-of-
way.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 7, 2022 2:18 PM

To: Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>; Sparks, Stuart
<Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey <jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Issue | could use some help with

4




Hi folks,
Bumping this back up and copying in Jeff in case there's someone else | should
reach out to about this. Please see below and let me know what the best course

of action might be to address this situation. Appreciate you all!

Cassie

From: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 2:47 PM

To: Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>

Subject: Re: Issue | could use some help with

Hello Fred,

It's good to hear from you! I'm copying Stuart to get this conversation rolling.
Stuart is over signs and markings at Public Works.

Stuart, Fred notes that the garbage truck can't turn into the alley because the
alley entrance is blocked. Could we get some signage up to address this? | know
we don't typically paint curbs anymore, but could we make an exception for this
since it's a high density area? Anything else you can think of that could help with
this problem?

Fred, I'd love to get together some time soon! Tell Veni | said hello.

Best wishes,
Cassie

From: Fred Levein <flevein@bellsouth.net>

Sent: Wednesday, November 2, 2022 9:00 PM

To: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie. Armstrong @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Issue | could use some help with

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Dear Cassie, | own an apartment building in the Highlands at 1650 Eastern Parkway
where the garbage truck regularly cannot come through the alley and make the turn off
Jaeger Ave because people are parking to close to the entrance of the alley. There
certainly should be signs up and probably painting on the curb of the street but there
isn’t. Then the dumpster overflows and we’ve had rodent issues and neighbors
complaining but it’s simply an issue with access. I’'m wondering which department | can
contact to get this resolved. The garbage company of course comes every week but if
they can’t get down the alley, the dumpster stays full for the next week and overflows.
Thanks so much again and I'm hoping after the election we still can get together for a
little outside gathering with you, Bryan and Veni.




Thanks

Fred Levein

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is
intended solely for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are
not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or
taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and
may be unlawful.




