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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
u Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Cassie Chambers Armstrong, District 8 I

[ Amount: $11,745.00 Date: July |3, 262\ |

Description of program/project inclading public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

$11,745.00 to LMPD to fund the purchase of a passive driver feedback machine, trailer and
accessories for LMPD's 5th Division for use throughout Metro Council District 8 at locations
frequently used by speeding drivers. The intention is to provide realtime feedback to drivers who
are driving at excessive speed and to gather data about hotspots for excessive vehicie speed for
targeted traffic enforcement.

City Agency: |LMPD
Contact Person: i Tenbarge

Agency Phone: 502.574.7678

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

8 . 7/13/2021
ﬁ:sslt F( e is Sﬁ‘ovug $11,745 /13/
District # Council Member Signature Amournt Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount;
Reference #: _CIF080421LMPDO08 To OMB;:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
LMPD 5th DIV PASSIVE DRIVER FEEDBACK MACHINE

Additiona] Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dellars, and have determined the funds will

be used for a public purpose,
Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Namé

Program/Project N ame:

LMPD Sth DIV PASSIVE DRIVER FEEDBACK MACHFNE
o ~ Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) | '
Appropriating Funding? ' NA\ Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with -
account numbers in the request form description? NA
‘Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of ‘
the request exclude the matching fund amount? - NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they T -
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

‘Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the " Yes
funding source is probably NDF. f

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than |

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentatien: Does the attachment include a valid S
estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: Megan Metcalf Date: July 13,2021

Revised May 2016
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From: Metcalf, Megan A.

To: Harward, Sonya
Subject: Fwd: Capitol Infrastructure Funds for driver feedback machine
Date: Friday, July 23, 2021 1:32:58 PM

Megan A. Metcalf, JD

Legislative Assistant, District 8

Council Member Cassie Chambers Armstrong
(502) 574-1108

From: Tenbarge, Neil E <Neil.Tenbarge@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, July 23, 2021 11:05 AM

To: Metcalf, Megan A.

Subject: Re: Capitol Infrastructure Funds for driver feedback machine

Yes, thank you.

From: Metcalf, Megan A. <Megan.Metcalf@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, July 23, 2021 10:33 AM

To: Tenbarge, Neil E <Neil.Tenbarge@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Capitol Infrastructure Funds for driver feedback machine

Hi Lt. Tenbarge,

Council Member Armstrong would like to appropriate $11,745 to purchase a mobile driver
feedback machine for the 5th division. Can you confirm acceptance of the funds?

Thanks

Megan A. Metcalf, JD

Legislative Assistant, District 8

Council Member Cassie Chambers Armstrong
502) 574-1108


mailto:Megan.Metcalf@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov
tel:(502) 574-1108

I
From: Armstrong, Cassie
Sent: Monday, May 10, 2021 9:06 AM
To: Metcalf, Megan A.
Subject: Fw; New machine for LMPD
Attachments: Louisville Metro Police Department - All Traffic Solutions Quote SpeedAlert24 Trailer

TC.pdf; Louisville Metro Police Department - All Traffic Solutions Quote SpeedAlert18
Trailer TC.pdf; Speed Alert 24 Trailer Pictures.pdf

From: Grissom, Jason <Jason.Grissom@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Saturday, April 17, 2021 6:03 PM

To: Armstrong, Cassie <Cassie.Armstrong@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: New machine for LMPD

Quote for speed machine

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy 510e, an AT&T 5G Evolution capable smartphone

———————— Criginal message ---—--

From: "Tenbarge, Neil E" <Neil. Tenbarge@louisvilieky.gov>
Date: 4/7/21 8:49 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Grissom, Jason" <lason.Grissom @Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Fw: New machine for LMPD

Major,

Attached are quotes for two different radar machines. The speed alert 18 is what we currently
have. The speed alert 24 has a larger display screen and can display more safety messages that the
18 cannot. The trailer is the same size. Both work on the same operating software, cloud based data
gathering, reports, etc. Just depends on how much money they are willing to spend.

After they are reviewed and a choice is made let me know and I'll work with them and OMB to get it
going.
Thanks

From: Max Wicklein <mwicklein@alltrafficsolutions.com>
Sent: Wednesday, April 7, 2021 3:14 PM

To: Tenbarge, Neil E <Neil.Tenbarge @fouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: New machine for LMPD

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open

attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe
1




Neil,

Nice speaking with you today. Please find your quotes attached. Attached is a picture of SpeedAlert24 if you wanted to
consider upgrading to something with more messaging. Just let me know how | can help.

Watch the ATS Product Video

Best Regards,

Max Wicklein

All Traffic Solutions

Territory Sales Manager

AL, KY, MD, NC, SC, VA

571-321-5452

12950 Waorldgate Dr Suite 310, Herndon, VA, 20170

On Wed, Apr 7, 2021 at 12:49 PM Max Wicklein <mwickiein@alltrafficsolutions.com> wrote:
Great will give you a ring shortly!

- OnWed, Apr7, 2021 at 12:41 PM Tenbarge, Neil E <Neil. Tenbarge@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

anytime today till 2:15 is good. call my cell 502-338-2902



thanks

From: Max Wicklein <mwicklein@alltrafficsolutions.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 7, 2021 10:43 AM

To: Tenbarge, Neil £ <Neil.Tenbarge@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: New machine for LMPD

CAUTION: This emall came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe




Hi Neil,

A ' When is a good time to jump on a call this week? Just let me know what works for you.

Watch the ATS Product Video




Best Regards,

Max Wicklein

All Traffic Solutions

Territory Sales Manager

AL, KY, MD, NC, SC, VA

571-321-5452

12950 Worldgate Dr Suite 310, Herndon, VA, 20170




On Tue, Mar 30, 2021 at 8:37 PM Tenbarge, Neil E <Neil.Tenbarge @louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Next week would be better. No rush.

Thanks




From: Max Wicklein <mwicklein@alltrafficsolutions.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2021 7:13 PM

To: Tenbarge, Neil E <Neil.Tenbarge @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: New machine for LMPD

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless vou recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Hi Neil,

.~ Would you be able to jump on a call at 8:30 am? I'm heading out of town on vacation shortly after that but would like
i to get you everything you need before leaving. If it's not time sensitive would also be open for a call early next week.

Just let me know




what works best for you.

Watch the ATS Product Video

Best Regards,

Max Wicklein



All Traffic Solutions

Territory Sales Manager

AL, KY, MD, NC, SC, VA

571-321-5452

12950 Worldgate Dr Suite 310, Herndon, VA, 20170




f | OnTue, Mar 30, 2021 at 7:13 PM Tenbarge, Neil E <Neil.Tenbarge @louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Good afternoon,

We are looking to purchase another radar machine similar to what we purchased a few
years ago. If there is a newer model with other options we would consider that also. Please let
me know what options you have and a price quote.

" ' Thank you,

10
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' Neil Tenbarge

Louisville metro police department

. The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended sclely for use by

the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient,

¢ you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this
. information is strictly prohibited and may be uniawful.
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Watch the ATS Product Video

Best Regards,

Max Wicklein

All Traffic Solutions

Territory Sales Manager

AL, KY, MD, NC, SC, VA

571-321-5452

12950 Woridgate Dr Suite 310, Herndon, VA, 20170
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Alf Traffic Solutions Inc.
12950 Worldgate Dr #310
Herndon, VA 20170
Phone: 814-237-8005
Fax: 814-237-9006
DUNS #: 001225114
Tax ID: 25-1887806

ALLTRAFFIC

SOLUTIOKS

Mail Purchase

QUOTE Q-58395

DATE: 04/07/2021 PAGE
NO: 1

Questions contact:

Orders to: CAGE Code: 34FQ5 MANUFACTURER: Independent Sales Rep:
3100 Research Dr. All Traffic Solutions
State College, PA Max Wicklein
16801 Contract: (571) 321-5452
X
mwicklein@alltrafficsolutions.com
BILLTO: SHIP TO:

Louisville Metro Police Department
611 W Jefferson St
Louisville KY 40202

L.ouisville Metro Police Department
Louisville Metro Fleet Services
3515 Newburg Road

Billing Contact:

Louisville KY 40218
Attn: Neil Tenbarge

PAYMENT CUSTOMER: Louisvile CONTACT:(502) 574-7636 ext, 0

TERMS: Metro Police Department

Net 30

ITEM NO: DESCRIPTION: Qry: EACH: EXT.

PRICE:

4000741 SpeedAlert 18 Radar Message Sign {RMS); base 1 $3,600.00 $3,600.00
unit w/ mounting bracket

4000647 App, Traffic Suite (12mo); Equip Mgmt, Reporting, 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
image Mgmt, Alerts, Mapping and PremierCare

4000874 All Options Activation: Bluetooth, Traffic Data, 1 $0.00 $0.00
Violator Alert, Pictures, ($3000 Value, requires
Traffic or Message Suite)

4000793 Violater Strobe, Dual; Hardware for SpeedAlert 18, 1 $400.00 $400.00
flash helps draw attention to the driver's speed.
Requires color assignment PN.

4000826 Strobe Color: Red and Blue (Requires 4000793 1 $0.00 $0.00
Dual Violator Strobe}

4000173 Trailer, ATS-5 {select power separaiely) 1 $3,950.00 $3,950.00

4000765 Mount Kit, adaptable trailer mounting for Sh15 or 1 $100.00 $100.00
SA18 on ATS-5, incl: power adapter harness and
hardware

4001626 VZW communications prep 1 $0.00 $0.00

4000635 Trailer Battery kit for ATS-5, 235Ah deep cycle 1 $495.00 $495.00
batteries w/cover, hold down, cables& hdwr (ShiZ;
Sh15; SA18; ATS5 IA18)

4000740 Trailer Certificate of Origin 1 $0.00 $0.00




4000754 USB cable, 16ft, extra long for trailer or pole 1 $60.00 $60.00

4000838 Solar panel, 80W: includes bracket for ATS-5 1 $940.00 $940.00
trailer and harness
4400641 Shipping and Handling Common Carrier 1 $700.00 $700.00
Special Notes: SALES $11,745.00
AMOUNT:
TOTAL $11,745.00
usp: .

Buration: This quote Is good for 60 days from date of issue.
Shipping Notes: All shipments shall be FOB shipper. Shipping charges shail be additional unless listed on quote,

Taxes: Taxes are not included in quote. Please provide a tax-exempt certificate or sales tax will be appiled.

Warranty: Unless otherwise Indicated, all products have a one year warranty from date of sale. Warranty extensions are a component of some
applications that are avallable at time of purchase. A Finance Charge of 1.5% per month will be applled to overdue balances. GSA GS$-07F-6092R

Authorization: By Signing below, | indicate that my organization does not require a purchase order and | am
authorized to commit my organization to this order.

Signature: Date:

Print Name: Title:






