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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

L] Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF) 2

xCapital Infrastructure Fund (CIF) e

[1 Municipal Aid Program (MAP) ?“‘5’?1
| Primary Sponsor:  District 5, Cheri Hamilton =
= b
| Amount: $17,000 Date: 8/18/14 we

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Alley paving from 34" to 38" Street between Larkwood and Muhammad Ali Blvd for a
total cost of $32,000:

$17,000 District 5 CIF

$15.000 Project 57, Alley Paving Match Fund, FY15 Capital Budget leap unit # 148655
$32,000 Total project estimate

City Agency: Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 502 574 6789

| have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.

5 %ﬁ_ﬁm $17,000 '3"'/4 ’/‘5’

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMBRB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Department/Project:

Revised July 2013 | l/ I e
2504 s L]



- NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: | y. ol —'P(A_{O’ je IW)e RKS

Program/Project Name: \\944 ?‘LU | & W‘{-{,’/\
1 L}

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? \/3 &
Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the {
request form description? Y es
[

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amount?

VeI

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in

the request form description? ¢ §
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building {
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. \/ e 5
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If 4
not, the funding source is probably NDF. \) es

[

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000?

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

NO

Pmpmedby:%/gfm Date:  F~/ 7~ /4

ﬁ_m:
o T R e —————

Effective October 2013



Hamilton, Cheri

“

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Monday, August 18, 2014 12:09 PM
To: Hamilton, Cheri

Subject: RE: paving estimate request

CW Hamilton,

th

The cost to repave the alley from 34" to 38" Street, between Larkwood and Muhammad Ali Blvd. is $32,000. If you have
any questions or need more information, please let me know.

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Tuesday, August 12, 2014 10:45 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: Re: paving estimate request

Yes. Thank youl

On Aug 12, 2014, at 7:50 AM, "Metcalfe, Andrew" <Andrew.Metcalfe @louisvilleky.gov> wrote:
I don’t have any record of preparing that estimate. Would you like me to prepare one for you?

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Monday, August 11, 2014 3:59 PM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: RE: paving estimate request

Andrew, Did you have an estimate to pave the alley from 34" to 38" Street, between Larkwood and
Muhammad Ali Blvd.?

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Monday, August 11, 2014 7:12 AM
To: Allen, Craig L

Cc: Hamilton, Cheri

Subject: FW: paving estimate request

Craig,
Please see below.

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Metcalfe, Andrew
Sent: Monday, August 11, 2014 7:12 AM



'To': Hamilton, Cheri
Subject: RE: paving estimate request

CW Hamilton,
Craig Alten is the contact person in public works for sidewalk repairs. I've copied him on my response
and he will be able to provide you the requested information.

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Friday, August 08, 2014 3:48 PM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: paving estimate request

Andrew, can you give me an update on outstanding any sidewalk paving requests you have for District 5
that we have either not funded vet, or have funded but they have not started yet. Thanks!



