
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
D/ Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)

D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Primary Sponsor: Tina Ward-Pugh

Amount: $8,471.50 Date: July 17, 2014

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Metro Public Works for the Kenilworth sidewalk project. These costs cover the
guardrail removal and re-installation - $ 7,971.50 and parking T's removal and re-striping
by Traffic Engineering - $ 500.00.

City Agency: Metro Public Works

Contact Person: Mache Readus-Wright

Agency Phone: (502) 574-3884

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.
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NDF OR GIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Kenilworth Guardrail & Parking T's

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? M/^.

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description? MO

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amount? Vll^l

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description? Mf^t
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ^
Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
not, the funding source is probably NDF. ^
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? l4J^
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less? v\o

I^repared by:

Effective October 2 013



Ethridge, Kyle

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Readus-Wright, Mache
Tuesday, July 15, 2014 5:36 PM
Ethridge, Kyle
RE: Kenilworth Updated Estimate for striping and guardrail

High

Flag for follow up
Flagged

w-v^
.^.

Ollt^lf?Yes, I received some updated information this afternoon as described below:
o Guardrail removal/reinstallation, per Guardrail Contractor: $7971.50
o Parking tees, removal/re-striping, per rough estimate* from Traffic Engineering Division: $500.00

*We won't be able to get a more accurate number until next week, so this number may be a little high.
Mache'
3884

From: Ethridge, Kyle
Sent: Tuesday, July 15, 2014 4:41 PM
To: Readus-Wright, Mache
Subject: RE: Kenilworth Updated Estimate for striping and guardrail

Mache,

Do you have any updated final pricing? The meeting is tomorrow afternoon.

Thanks,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge
9th District Legislative Assistant
Councilwoman Tina Ward-Pugh
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
(502) 574-3908 office
(502) 333-4644 cell
(502) 574-7844 fax
httD://district9news.wordDress.com/

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

From: Readus-Wright, Mache
Sent: Sunday, July 06, 2014 2:51 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle
Subject: RE: Kenilworth Updated Estimate for striping and guardrail

Kyle,

The rough^stimate for guardrail, and striping for parking spaces is $6,700.00. Details are below:

o Per URS's estimate, Guardrail removal/replacement is approx.. $2,000.00, plus guardrail-end-treatments,
4500.00 = $6,500.00.


