sh

CIF051122LMPDm

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)

[ Primary Sponsor: Marilyn Parker

| Amount: $8,313 Date: 4-14-2022

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

For the purchase of 3 handheld radar guns and 2 in-car mounted radar devices for LMPD's 8th
Division traffic control vehicles. This will allow the 8th division to more effectively target speeding
vehicles throughout the division. Total cost will be shared equally among Districts 16,17,18,19,20.

City Agency: |MPD 8th Division
Contact Person: paye Hamblin

Agency Phone: 574.9258

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

18 El $1662.60 4-14-22
Dig{it # Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #:  CIF051122LMPDm To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
LMPD 8th Division/ Traffic Control Radar Equipment

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: LMPD 8th Division

Program/Project Name: Traffic Control Radar Equipment

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: [s the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA
Yes z
NA |
NA ]
NA ]
Yes EI

Yes El

NA

L]

NA

<]

Yes

Submitted by: ChrisLewis

Date: 4-14-22

Revised May 2016



Harward, Sonxa

From: Benson, Stuart

Sent: Friday, April 22, 2022 8:57 AM

To: Harward, Sonya

Subject: Permission to sign Cif for Lmpd 8th division
Sonya,

Angela webster has permission to sign for the CIF to LMPD 8th Division.
Stuart

Get Qutlook for i0S



Harward, Sonza

From: Piagentini, Anthony B.

Sent: Sunday, April 24, 2022 1:25 PM

To: Harward, Sonya; Smith, Chanelle Emily

Cc: Lewis, Chris W

Subject: Re: Permission to Sign for CM for CIF for LMPD for Radar Devices

Approved and Chanelle can sign on my behalf.

AP

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Sunday, April 24, 2022 12:04 PM

To: Smith, Chanelle Emily <Chanelle.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Piagentini, Anthony B.
<Anthony.Piagentini@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Permission to Sign for CM for CIF for LMPD for Radar Devices

| have the approval from D-20 and it has been added as the 3 page of the attached packet. I'm
adding to this email CM Piagentini in case Chanelle is out so that this does not miss the deadline
tomorrow.

Please see the original message highlighted below.

Thanks,
Sonya

Sonya Harwarol

Louisville Metro Cauncil Clerk
601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-2704 (direct)
(502)574-3902 (ofc)
(502)500-5440 (cell)

From: Harward, Sonya

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2022 6:43 PM

To: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>; Smith, Chanelle Emily <Chanelle.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>




Subject: Permission to Sign for CM for CIF for LMPD for Radar Devices
Importance: High '

We need an email from Councilman Piagentini and Councilman Benson giving permission for
Chanelle and Angela, respectively, to sign for their Council Member on the attached CIF. Please
provide this by Monday at noon to meet the filing deadline.

Thanks,
Sonya

Sonyn Harwayrd

Louisville Metro Council Clerk

601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-2704 (direct)
(502)574-3902 (ofc)
{502)500-5440 (cell)



Lewis, Chris W

From: Mroskey, Carrie

Sent: Thursday, April 14, 2022 2:38 PM

To: Lewis, Chris W

Cc: Hamblin, David K.

Subject: RE: Stalker Radar Quote 2061183 2061184
Sir,

The 8™ Division will accept the funding for the Lidar/Radar units.

Thanks in advance,
Carrie

Sgt. Carrie Mroskey

Louisville Metro Police Department
8" Division

2927 Goose Creek Road

Louisville, Ky 40291

(502) 574-5638

From: Hamblin, David K. <David.Hamblin@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, April 14, 2022 2:30 PM

To: Mroskey, Carrie <Carrie.Mroskey@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Stalker Radar Quote 2061183 2061184

From: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, April 14, 2022 12:18 PM
To: Hamblin, David K. <David.Hamblin@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Stalker Radar Quote 2061183 2061184

Dave,
Can you or the Major send me an email stating that the 8" Division will accept the funding?

Chris W. Lewis |

Office of Councilwoman Marilyn Parker

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1118

From: Hamblin, David K. <David.Hamblin@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2022 12:31 PM

To: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Stalker Radar Quote 2061183 2061184




JTALKER == SHUOTE

applied concepts,inc.

Page 1 of 1
855 E. Collins Blvd ; .
- National Toll Free: 1-800- STALKER :
Richardson, TX 75081 Date: 04/12/22
Phone: 972-398-3780 Brooke Journet Debbie Aull
Fax: 972-398-3781 Inside Sales Partner: | +1-469-656-8011 Reg Sales Mgr: | +1-214-551-5538
brookej@stalkerradar.com aull@stalkerradar.com
Effective From : 04/12/2022 Valid Through: 07/11/2022 Lead Time: 70 working days
Bill To: Customer ID: 016604 |Ship To: FedEx Ground
Louisville Metro Police Department Louisville Metro Police
8th Division Accounts Payable Department Division Resource Officer
2927 Goose Creek Road 8th Division David Hamblin
Louisville, KY 40243-2548 200 Juneau Drive, Suite 100
Louisville, KY 40243-2548
Grp Qty Package Description Wrnty/Mo Price Ext Price
1 3 | 808-4025-00 [LIDAR-XS-C - LI-lon Handles, Charger, Soft Bag, 24 24 $1,813.00 $5,439.00
Ln Qty Part Number Description Price Ext Price
1 3| 200-1428-00 | High Efficiency Lidar XS $0.00
2 6| 200-0944-11 | Lithium lon Battery Handle, SlI, X-Series, Proll $0.00
3 3| 200-0839-00 | Desktop Charger for LI-ION Battery Handle $0.00
4 3| 035-0211-00 | Soft Storage Bag $0.00
5 3| 011-0139-00 | Lidar XS Operators Manual $0.00
6 3| 011-0002-00 | Lidar Certificate of Accuracy $0.00
I 3| 011-0171-00 | Lidar X-Series Quick Start Guide $0.00
8 3| 035-0389-00 | Lidar Shipping Box w/Foam $0.00
9 3| 060-1000-24 | 24-Month Warranty $0.00
Group Total $5,439.00
Product $5,439.00 Sub-Total: $5,439.00
Discount $0.00 Sales Tax 0% $0.00
Shipping & Handling: $0.00
Payment Terms: Net 30 days Total: USD $5,439.00
o

This Quote or Purchase Order is subject in all respects to the Terms and Conditions detailed at the back of this document. These
Terms and Conditions contain limitations of liability, waivers of liability even for our own negligence, and indemnification provisions,
all of which may affect your rights. Please review these Terms and Conditions carefully before proceeding.




QUOTE

JTALKER -

#2061184
applied concepts,i —
age1o0
855 E. Collins Blvd . :
National Toll Free: 1-800- STALKER :
Richardson, TX 75081 aional Lot heee Date: 04/12/22
Phone: 972-398-3780 Brooke Journet Debbie Aull

+1-214-551-5538
aull@stalkerradar.com

Inside Sales Partner:

Fax: 972-398-3781 +1-469-656-8011 Reg Sales Mgr:

brookej@stalkerradar.com

Effective From : 04/12/2022 Valid Through: 07/11/2022 Lead Time: 45 working days

Bill To: Customer ID: 016604 (Ship To: FedEx Ground
Louisville Metro Police Department Louisville Metro Police

8th Division Accounts Payable Department

2927 Goose Creek Road 8th Division

2927 Goose Creek Road
Louisville, KY 40241

Louisville, KY 40243-2548

Grp Qty Package Description Wrnty/Mo Price Ext Price
1 1| 807-0002-00 |DSR 2X Radar w/lnstant On Remote 36 $2,874.00 $2,874.00
Ln Qty  Part Number Description Price Ext Price

1 1] 200-0965-40 | 2X Counting Unit, 1.5 PCB $0.00
2 1| 200-0875-30 | 2X Modular Display, High Bright LEDs $0.00
3 1| 200-1237-00 | DSR Ka Antenna $0.00
4 1| 200-1237-01 | DSR Ka Antenna, Rear $0.00
5 1| 200-0918-00 | Stalker 2X Instant On Remote Control $0.00
6 1] 200-0769-00 | 25 MPH/40 KPH KA Tuning Fork $0.00
7 1] 200-0770-00 | 40 MPH/64 KPH KA Tuning Fork $0.00
8 1| 200-0648-00 | Display Sun Shield $0.00
9 1| 200-0243-00 | Counting/Display Tall Mount $0.00
10 1] 200-0244-00 | Antenna Dash Mount $0.00
11 1| 200-0245-00 | Antenna Tall Deck Mount $0.00
12 1] 155-2591-08 | 8 Foot Antenna Cable, IP67 $0.00
13 1| 155-2591-20 | 20 Foot Antenna Cable, IP67 $0.00
14 1| 200-0622-00 | VSS Cable Kit $0.00
15 1| 200-0619-00 | 2X Documentation Kit $0.00
16 1| 035-0361-00 | Shipping Container, Dash Mounted Radar $0.00
17 1| 060-1000-36 | 36 Month Warranty $0.00
Group Total $2,874.00

Product $2,874.00 Sub-Total: $2,874.00

Discount $0.00 Sales Tax 0% $0.00

Shipping & Handling: $0.00

Payment Terms: Net 30 days Total: USD $2,874.00
001

[ This Quote or Purchase Order is subject in all respects to the Terms and Conditions detailed at the back of this document. These
Terms and Conditions contain limitations of liability, waivers of liability even for our own negligence, and indemnification provisions,
all of which may affect your rights. Please review these Terms and Conditions carefully before proceeding.






