
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

|^j Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PA V)

Primary Sponsor: Steve Magre

Amount: $ 14,000.00 Date: October 5, 2015

Description ofprogram/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

$14,000 Additional funding needed for MAP and MAP Match paving projects:
Unseld Blvd from Petersburg to Exeter ($82,000) and Roosevelt Avenue from
Morgan Ave to Dead End ($32,000).

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 574-6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a publu

10

District # Council Member ^gnat0-e

$14,000.00

Amount

Oct. 5, 2015

Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



GIF, NDF, MAP OR PAY INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: public Works

Program/Project Name: Unsled and Roosevelt Paving

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? i

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the I
request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

NA

Yes

Prepared by: 0^6^^- Date: October 5,2015

Effective July 2015



Peers, Carrie G

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Stenberg, Beth
Wednesday, September 30, 2015 3:02 PM
Peers, Carrie G
RE:

You can either do this with PAV or CIF. If CiF the wording will be:

$14,000 Additional funding needed for MAP and MAP Match paving projects: Unseld Blvd from Petersburg to Exeter ($82,000) and Roosevelt Avenue from
Morgan Ave to Dead End ($32,000).

If you use PAV the wording will be:

$14,000 additional funding from 8127 410 8105 148947 822810 needed for MAP and MAP Match paving projects: Unseld Blvd from Petersburg to Exeter
($82,000) and Roosevelt Avenue from Morgan Ave to Dead End ($32,000).

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Wednesday, September 30, 2015 11:21 AM
To: Stenberg, Beth
Subject: FW:

Beth,

I'm getting ready to prepare an GIF for $14K for the work described below. Do you have a recommendation of how it should look?

Thanks,

Carrie

From: Metcalfe, Andrew
Sent: Monday, August 24, 2015 9:20 AM
To: Peers, Carrie G
Cc: Cosper, John W; Stenberg, Beth; Barr, Gerald F
Subject: RE:



Carrie,

The projects that PW will be paving with the $100,000 from D10 are Unseld Blvd from Petersburg to Exeter ($82,000) and Roosevelt Avenue from Morgan
Avenue to Dead End ($32,000). The cost for these two projects exceeds the available amount by $14,000.1 believe Beth was going to get with you on how to
handle the additional $14,000 required. I wouldn't anticipate these getting paved until the Spring of 2016. The paint on Trevilian is in preparation or paving. I'm
hoping to get it paved by mid-September.
Thanks,

Andrew

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Tuesday, August 18, 2015 9:39 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew
Cc: Cosper, John W
Subject:

Good Morning,

Councilman Magre wanted to touch base with you about District 10 paving. He submitted a list of streets for his MAP money. He would like to know how many
on this list will be completed with the $100K and when are scheduled and compelted.

He has another list of streets that he wishes to use the $75K paving funds to complete. I will be working on the paperwork to get those over to you all soon.

I noticed paint markings on Trevilian Way at the curve. I'm guessing that is you all prepping for that job.

Thanks,

Came Peers

Legislative Assistant
Councilman Steve Magre, District 10
Louisville Metro Council
601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-1110
carrie.peers@louisvilleky.gov


