CIF030321PW15

CoeuSiygn Envetope ID: IE7EF4TE-EBTE-4321-2ER1-1OFAD2I4B M

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
% Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAF)
Paving Fund (FAY)
| Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett

| Amount: $1,408.00 Date: 02/03/2021

' Description of program/preject including public purpose, additional funding sources,|
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Public works will install 2 stop signs and B post at 2nd Street and wWest
Florence,

City Agency: Public works
Contact Perspn; Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502-574-3278

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditnre.

15 ] —
. $1.408.00 2/3/2021
Dhistrict # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Dare
Clerk™s Office & ONME Use Only:
Request Amount; Amended Amoiani:
Reference 5 CIF030321PW15 To OMB:
Budger Revision #:
Account 7
T'o Project Manager: Completion Dage:
Actual Cosi: Funds Retumed:

Revised May 2016
Page |



CIF030321PW15

Department/Project:
Public Works- Stop Signs at 2nd & Florence

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will

be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: 2 stops signs and 2nd & Florence
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: shughes Date: Feb 15, 2021

Revised May 2016



CIF030321PW15

From: Luckett, Daniel R

To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: FW: Cherokee Road Stop Lights

Date: Monday, January 25, 2021 10:31:49 AM
Attachments: image001.ona

image002 pna
image003.pna
image004.nng
image005.pna

The posts are called “flexible delineator posts”. They are posts (see pictures below) to allow the stop sign to be installed safely in the street. That street too
wide as is. Less expensive to do this than a curb extension.

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, January 25, 2021 6:46 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Cherokee Road Stop Lights

Dan,

Yes, Louisville Metro Public Works will accept these funds.

Thanks,

Stuart

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, January 22, 2021 4:02 PM
To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Cherokee Road Stop Lights

Mr. Sparks,

Yes we want to proceed with this 4-way stop at S. 2" Street & W. Florence Ave. We will appropriate $1,408.00 for 8 posts at $176.00 each. You will provide 2 stop
signs/posts and installation. Will you accept the funds?

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, January 19, 2021 5:51 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luck louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Cherokee Road Stop Lights

Dan,
I will fund the signage but CM Triplett would have to fund the posts. The cost for the posts would be $1,408 if we had 8 installed. They are $176 each.
Thanks,

Stuart

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, January 13, 2021 3:32 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Cherokee Road Stop Lights

Here are two before and after examples of an option to protect the stop sign and ensure adequate visibility if on street parking would limit visibility if placed outside of
the road.
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After

Cherokee at Longest

Before




After

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

(502) 574-3650






