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CIF110321PW09

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Bill Hollander |

| Amount: $2,450 Date: October 11, 2021 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Metro Public Works to repair and replace the access gate at the end of 300 Claremont
Avenue that connects to the emergency access easement and road. The gate was damaged due to
a vehicle running through it. All in the public right-of-way or easement.

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Steve Kurowsky

Agency Phone: (502) 574-8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

9 . $2,450 10/12/2021
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF110321PW09 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name:  Repair and replace emergency access easement gate on Claremont Ave

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. Ne. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? Ne. NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: kol Aluida Date; 10/11/2021
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Hartiage Fence Co.

oation TLAGE
502-361-8403 FENCE COMPANY

hfc@hartiagefence.com
www.hartlagefence.com

Estimate

ADDRESS SHIP TO ESTIMATE # 6447

Steve Kurowsky Steve Kurowsky DATE 10/08/2021

Louisville Metro Public Works Louisville Metro Public Works

444 South 5th St. Jobsite

Ste. 400 300 Clairemont Ave

Louisville, KY 40202 Louisville, KY 40206

SHIP VIA TRACKING NO. SALES REP

Our truck Jefferson Jeff

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Repairs to gate due to car running through it 2,450.00

Furnish and install:

2 - 4" x 8 S5-40 gate posts with caps
1 - 16’ x 6’ double drive gate
1 - Strong Arm Latch

Re-hang existing walk gate

Remove damaged material and haul away

The Purchaser/Property Owner agrees that Hartlage Fence will not be held ~ TOTAL $2 450 00
. N ™ ’ L]

responsible or liable for any damages of any nature to underground utility,

water, septic/sewer, sprinkler cable lines, either public or private.

Purchaser/Property Owner is responsible for determining property lines,

and HOA restrictions if rock or any other underground obstructions are

encountered, additional charges for equipment and labor wil apply.

Accepted By Accepted Date

Upon acceptance of this proposal, please sign and return 1 copy along with a 25% down payment. We accept MC, Visa,
Discover. WARRANTY 1 year on Labor



Ethridge, lee

From: Kurowsky, Steve M.

Sent: Monday, October 11, 2021 9:43 AM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: RE: Reservoir Gate

MPW will accept the funds

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 11, 2021 8:31 AM

To: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve.kurowsky@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Reservoir Gate

Thanks, Stevel

Will MPW accept these funds?

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the bi-weekly District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood
news and alerts!

From: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve.kurowsky @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, October 8, 2021 5:54 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle Ethridge @louisvilieky.gov>

Subject: RE: Reservoir Gate

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, October 8, 2021 11:01 AM

To: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve kurowsky@louisvilleky. gov>
Subject: Reservoir Gate

Steve,

| received your VM. Yes, we are good with $2,500. Once you a written estimate, can you please send
it to me so we can process funds?

Also, the best way to reach me is in the office or via email. | really don’t use my personal cell phone
for work related stuff.

Thanks!



