2
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request €

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

I_Primary Sponsor: Cheri Bryant Hamilton j

| Amount: 50,999.04 Date: March 3, 2015 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

D5 Sidewalk repair for 400 block of N. 34th Street $26,698.00, D5 Sidewalk repair for 500
block of N. 34th Street $54,242.40 for a total of $80,940.40.

Funding sources in this order:

$33,452.26 MAP Match 8676 410 8106 048205 822702

$59,999.04 MAP 8672 410 8106 048205 822702

$93,451.30

Estimates attached are a year old and are being updated. Any remaining funds when the
project is complete will be released in the D5 MAP account.

City Agency: Public Works and Assets
C.mua
Contact Person: llen

Agency Phone: 574 6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name:  Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: 400 and 500 block of 34" Street sidewalk repair

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? yes
Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the &
request form description? a
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching i
fund amount?
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in -
the request form description?
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building es
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ¥
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If yes

not, the funding source is probably NDF.
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? na

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for

the fiscal year $25,000 or less? Hs

Prepared by: & ¥ /,/C- % : M/M/Mﬂm Date: 57~ 3~ / 5

Effective October 2013



Hamilton, Cheri

From:
Sent:
To:

Subject:

Councilwoman Hamilton,

Allen, Craig L
Tuesday, May 06, 2014 3:28 pPM
Hamilton, Cheri

RE: Estimate for 400 and 500 Blocks of N 34th Street

Below are the two estimates you requested.

SR#
LOCATION 400 Block of N. 34th Street
REQUESTED BY D-5
RATE
DATE SENT 5/6/2014
ESTIMATE BY CA
298 SY S/W's. 30" of curb. 3 utility cabs

that will need adjusting. 20 SF of
gmbmcxmz_mz?\noggmz.a Detectable Pavers. 36 SY of D/w.
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $26,698.00

Estimate is valid for 90 days from date sent. Any requests after 90
days will require re-inspection.

SR#

LOCATION 500 Block of N. 34th Street
REQUESTED BY D-5

RATE

DATE SENT 5/6/2014
ESTIMATE BY CA




475 SY S/W's, 75" of curb. 4 utility cabs
that will need adjusting. 50 SF of
Detectable Pavers, 22SYof D/W. 6 tree

removals. 6 cubic yard of concrete
gmacamgmz._.m\noggmz,_.w retaining wall.

ESTIMATE AMOUNT $54,242 40 ]

Estimate is valid for 90 days from date sent. Any requests after 90
days will require re-inspection,

If you have any further questions please let me know,

Craly rHlen
Engineer I
Louisville Metro Government
Public Works and Assets

444 S. 5" Street Suite 400
Louisville, Ky 40202
Office; (502)574-6159
Fax: (502)574-4129

Email: Crai Allen@lou

From: Hamilton, Cheri
Sent: Friday, May 02, 2014 11:41 AM

To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: Estimate for 400 and 500 Blocks of N 34th Street

Can you break out the cost estimate for just the west side of N, 34" st in the 400, and then the 500 block, as wel|?
From: Allen, Craig L
Sent: Thursday, May 01, 2014 11:53 AM

To: Hamilton, Cheri

Subject: Estimate for 400 and 500 Blocks of N 34th Street

Dear Councilwoman Hamilton,



SR#
— —
LOCATION 400 and 500 Blocks of N. 34th Street
| -

REQUESTED By D-5

——— = 8V —
RATE
DATE SENT 4/22/2014

ESTIMATE By CA
!

771SY $/W's. 117" of curb. 8 utility cabs
that will need adjusting. 70 SF of
zmnmcamgmza\nogzmzd Detectable Pavers. 58 SY of D/W. 8 trees.
|_YEASUREMEN

m.ﬂ_zﬁ:zo:zq . $83,268.00
Estimate is valiq Jor 90 days from date
sent. Any requests after 90 days will
require re-inspection,

The following pictures are to help visualize the project limits.

This is the 500 Block of N 34th St. The circles are for the only sidewalks on both sides of the street,



This is the 400 Block of N 34™ St. As you can see there is sidewalk all along the east side of 34" St. but there is only one
patch of sidewalk on the other side of the road.
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If you have any further questions please ask,

Craiy rHlen

Engineer I

Louisville Metro Government

Public Works and Assets

444 S. 5™ Street Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502)574-6159

Fax: (502)574-4129

Email: Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov




