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CIF012622SWMS09

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Bill Hollander ]

[Amount: $8,250 Date: November 30, 2021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to SWMS to purchase 22 new mushroom trash cans for installation on Farnkfort Avenue
and Brownsboro Road in D8.

City Agency: Solid Waste Management Services

Contact Person: antonio Baldon

Agency Phone: (502) 5744362

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

o Bl tollandor $8,250 11/30/2021

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF012622SWMS09 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

sh Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: Solid Waste Management Services

Program/Project Name: D9 mushroom trash cans for Frankfort Avenue and Brownsboro Road
. ‘ ‘ Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes E
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
~account numbers in the request form description? NA
| Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
 the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA E}
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville ‘:
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes B
- funding source is probably NDF.
- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful -
~ life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
- Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
 Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? _
- If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: [uq(b ﬁlu/\j/jb Date; 11/30/2021

Revised May 2016
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Ethridge, Kzle

From: Baldon, Antonio J Sr

Sent: Tuesday, November 30, 2021 10:47 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Axsom, Amy; Bradley, Maxwell B.
Subject: RE: D9 Trash Can Order

Yes, funds accepted.

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 30, 2021 10:42 AM

To: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill. Hollander@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Axsom, Amy <Amy.Axsom@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: D9 Trash Can Order

Good morning, Antonio!

Thanks again for the cost estimates for the trash cans for D9. At $375 each, D9 would like to order 22
mushroom trash cans for the District.

Will SWMS accept $8,250 from D9?

Attached is the list of locations.

Thanks so much,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legisiative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

801 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3808 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the bi-weekly District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D8 blog for the latest neighborhood
news and alerts!

From: Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonioc.BaldonSr@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 23, 2021 10:42 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill. Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>; Axsom, Amy <Amy. Axsom@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: D9 Trash Can Order

Good morning Kyle,

We have a price for the mushroom style containers along with freight charges and delivery. | also included a photo of
how the container will look.

PRICE, Delivered to Louisville, KY 40217.......ccoeovvvvvrvvreneiinnen $355.00 EACH
Freight Charge...... e cesrenssessssevessanensans $20.00 EACH CONTAINER
DELIVERY ... .oieiii it ceeircrrreeescrreresecsaneneneesessnessesannneesesans 6-8 WEEKS
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