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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

[l Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
X Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

L] Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
| Primary Sponsor:  Vicki Aubrey Welch, District 13 ]

] Amount: $3,035.70 Date: Monday, March 24, 2014 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

CIF dollars for Curb Repair & Repaving at 7425 Old North Church Rd., necessary to correct
inadequate drainage and improve road condition.

Remove / Replace 58 If curb & gutter, seed & straw at $3,035.70

City Agency: Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Craig Allen, Engineer
Agency Phone: 574 - 6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.
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NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST |

Interagency Name Pubhc Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Curb Repair / Repaving to 7425 Old North Church Rd, district 13

Yes/No/NA

| Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? Y
' Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the N/A

request form description?

Request Form: If matiching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching N/A

fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in N/A

the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building v

or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If

not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000?
. Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for N
| the fiscal year $25,000 or less?
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Triplett, Kevin D-

T e
From: Welch, Vicki A
Sent: Monday, March 24, 2014 10:42 AM
To: Triplett, Kevin D
Subject: Fwd: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd
Attachments: image001.png; image001.png; image002.jpg; image003.jpg

Please prepare CIF PAPERWORK for this curb repair as below amount $3,035.70. Get it to clerk before the
noon deadline today please.

Vicki Aubrey Welch
Councilwoman District 13
574-1113
www.louisvilleky.gov/district] 3
Sent from iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Allen, Craig L" <Craig. Allen@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: March 24, 2014, 10:34:59 AM EDT

To: "Welch, Vicki A" <Vicki.Welch@louisvilleky.cov>

Ce: "Pennington, James" <James.Pennington@]Jouisvilleky.gov>, "Akridge, John L"
<John.Akridge@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Vicki,

The drainage issue at 7425 Old North Church has been inspected and an estimate has been
prepared. The estimate is in the email just below.

After speaking with James Pennington, Engineer Il and John Akridge, Inspector Il it has been determined
that this drainage issue is the result of a combination of the road itself having a very low grade (0.1-
0.4%) so that the road is almost flat and the curb needing to be replaced. Simply replacing the curb will
not completely eliminate the issue. Repaving this section of the street in order to improve the grade
doesn’t seem to be an option at this time due to the expense and since it was just repaved. However if
you should choose to replace the curb we are more than happy to oblige.

Please let us know how you wish to proceed!

Thanks in advance,

Chaig #Hles

Engineer 1

Louisville Metro Government
Public Works and Assets

444 S. 5™ Street Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502)574-6159



Fax: (502)574-4129
Email: Craig. Allen@louisvilleky.gov

From: Akridge, John L

Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2014 9:17 AM

To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 OId North Church Rd

Craig,
Here is the estimate as requested. | did not figure any asphalt as | would hope this could be pulled away

from the new asphalt to prevent damage. | also did not have a SR# for this.

Has not been sent to council office either.

SR#
LOCATION 7425 Old North Church
REQUESTED BY D13
RATE N/A
DATE SENT 3/19/2014
ESTIMATE BY j akridge
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS
remove replace 58 If curb & gutter, seed
straw, & cont.
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $3,035.70
Estimate is valid for 90 days from date
sent. Any requests after 90 days will

require re-inspection.

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2014 3:49 PM

To: Akridge, John L

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

No problem! Yes that’s correct, contract prices.

From: Akridge, John L

Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2014 3:46 PM

To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

I'was running around the whole county today | should be able to get it soon. | assume we are just using
the annual sidewalk contract prices?
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From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Monday, March 17, 2014 3:34 PM

To: Akridge, John L

Cc: Rohrman, Ronald; Metcalfe, Andrew; Barr, Gerald F
Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

lohn,
Please prepare an estimate for this curb replacement and send it back to me.

Thanks in advancel

Engineer |
Louisville Metro Government

Public Works and Assets

444 8. 5™ Street Suite 400
Louisgville, KY 40202

Office: (502)574-6159

Fax: (502)574-4129

Email: Craig. Allen@louisvilleky.cov

From: Rohrman, Ronald

Sent: Monday, March 10, 2014 9:24 AM

To: Metcalfe, Andrew; Bair, Gerald F; Willen, Dan E.

Cc: Allen, Craig L; Akridge, John L

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Measured curb. Appears 58’ needs to be repaired, both sections of curb tying into this low curb
only has between 0.1-—0.4% fall. Areas have been marked.

Nick Rohrman

Inspector [

Louisville Metro-Public Works & Assets
Engineering & Construction Division
3515 Newburg Rd

Louisville, Ky 40218

502-210-2700
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From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Friday, March 07, 2014 10:03 AM

To: Rohrman, Ronaid; Barr, Gerald F; Willen, Dan E.

Cc: Allen, Craig L; Akridge, John L ‘

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd
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Attached is an e-mail with more info. It was originally attached but looks lost along the way. The curb
was replaced across from here but not at this address.

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Rohrman, Ronald

Sent: Friday, March 07, 2014 9:48 AM

To: Barr, Gerald F; Willen, Dan E.; Metcalfe, Andrew

Cc: Allen, Craig L; Akridge, John L

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Andrew, as I recall specific address, I do believe we replaced this curb along with the one
directly across the street as that curb had failed completely. Can you verify? I do not have the
paperwork of all addresses in my possession of all the curb that was replaced throughout Old
North. But it seems we did, as you stated the entire street has this problem due to not having
much fall. We replaced 250° throughout, addressing worse to minors. Thanks

Nick Rohrman

Inspector 1

Louisville Metro-Public Works & Assets
Engineering & Construction Division
3515 Newburg Rd

Louisville, Ky 40218

502-210-2700
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From: Barr, Gerald F

Sent: Friday, March 07, 2014 9:35 AM

To: Willen, Dan E.; Rohrman, Ronald

Cc: Allen, Craig L; Akridge, John L

Subject: FW: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Dan, Nick

Make sure to take care of this.

Jerry

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Friday, March 07, 2014 9:12 AM
To: Barr, Gerald F

Cc: Willen, Dan E.
Subject: FW: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Hey Jerry, could you have Dan or Nick take a look at this curb in D-13. | would have CC'd Nick but my
directory wouldn’t show his name.



From: Pennington, James

Sent: Friday, March 07, 2014 9:02 AM

To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Needs to be inspected.....it would go to Dan Willen or Nick Rohrman first.

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Friday, March 07, 2014 9:01 AM

To: Pennington, James

Subject: FW: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Hey James, | got this from Vicki Welch yesterday via Andrew. It looks like it won’t be a big deal.

Interestingly enough Vicki Welch is J-Town's area who [ think is in some kind of bankruptcy or other
financial problem. | called Billy’s cell and his office and left him messages at both. Hopefully he'll call
me back today.

So the first step is to get an estimate and send it back to Councilwoman Vicki Welch?

From: Metcaife, Andrew

Sent: Thursday, March 06, 2014 7:21 AM

To: Welch, Vicki A

Cc: Triplett, Kevin D; Marshall, Menisa; Allen, Craig L
Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Vicki,

Having the curb replaced shouldn’t be a problem. Since the repaving project has been closed out and
the work isnt directly related to paving, the curb repairs will be made through our sidewalk and curb
repair program which is now managed by Craig Allen. Craig is taking over the duties from James
Pennington and will be able to provide the estimate for the work and get it scheduled for you. | have
copied him on this e-mail to assist in keeping the request moving. If you need anything further from me
please let me know.

;

Thanks,
Andrew Metcalfe

From: Welch, Vicki A

Sent: Wednesday, March 05, 2014 2:52 PM

To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Cc: Triplett, Kevin D; Marshall, Menisa

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd
Importance: High

Andrew,

I'm sorry | dropped the ball on this one from back in January. The constituent has asked again
about this problem. So, | want fo ask if you can replace the curb as you suggested to alleviate
this water pooling situation. This is the only complaint that | have had on water pooling along
Old North Church, so | don't know of other locations.

Vicki Aufarey Welch

Councilwoman District 13



Majority Caucus Chair
Louisville Metro Council
502-574-1113
vicki.welch@louisvilleky.gov
www.louisvilleky.gov/district13

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Thursday, January 02, 2014 1:54 PM

To: Welch, Vicki A

Cc: Triplett, Kevin D; Marshall, Menisa

Subject: RE: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd

Vicki,

I made a site visit earlier today during the rain to 7425 Old North Church. There is curb on both sides of
the road and water runs from the center out. The street was not built up diverting water across the
street. The curb along Old North Church is flat and has settled in some places causing small amounts of
water to stand. In addition, water doesn’t drain as quickly in flatter areas. The curb in front of 7425 has
settled slightly, but was still flowing when | was on site. Below are two pictures, one from before paving
and the other from today. As you can see, water ponded in the area prior to paving but seems to
dissipate soon after a rain event. The only solution would be to replace the curb. However, if this section
gets replaced, there are several more along Old North Church that have similar situations. If you need
anything more or have further questions, please let me know.

Thanks,
Andrew



From: Welch, Vicki A

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2013 3:32 PM

To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Cc: Triplett, Kevin D; Marshall, Menisa

Subject: low spot new paving 7425 Old North Church Rd
Importance: High

Andrew,

Can you please check on this address at 7425 Old North Church Rd. This street was paved
before Christmas. Resident, Chris Winders 361-3764, is complaining that there is a low spot from
his driveway to the middle of his property in the street now holding water. He says they built up
the other side of the street which causes pooling of rain water on his side. Is there anything that
can be done to rectify this situatione

Thank you,

Vicki Aubrey Welch
Councitlwoman District 13
Louisville Metro Council
502-574-1113
vicki.welch@louisvilleky.gov
www.louisvilleky.gov/district13




