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NDF042022PW15

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
» Neighborhood Development Funrd (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett

[ Amount: $4,520.00 Date: March 7, 2022

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding used for Landscaping and maintenance for designated areas in District 15:

Crittenden Dr. & Warnock

Easter Parkway and Crittenden Dr.

Manslick and Gage!

Funding being directed through Public Works to Luv-It Landscaping for the work.

City Agency;: Public Works and Assets
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
docunientation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
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To Project Manager: Compietion Date:
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| interagency Name: Public Works
Program/Project Name: ~ Toluvit Landscaping for Landscaping in District 15
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? - Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with ,
account numbers in the request form description? - NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

: Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? - NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville :
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
- funding source is probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.  NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF requéét to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No
* Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? ~ No
_ Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid |
. estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: shuges Date: Mar7, 2022

Revised May 2016



Hughes, Susan

R TR R R T L NG
From: Luckett, Daniel R
Sent: Tuesday, March 8, 2022 10:20 AM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E
Cc: Hughes, Susan
Subject: RE: Luv it Landscaping
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Thank you Sir!

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, March 8, 2022 7:19 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Luv it Landscaping

Public Works will accept $4,520 for Luv-it Landscaping to provide landscaping maintenance at Crittenden Dr & University
{fka Warnock), Eastern Pkwy, Crittenden Dr and Manslick & Gagel

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director of Public Works
444 S 5™ St, 4™ Floor

Louisvilie, KY 40202
(502)574-0065

Celi {502)773-3222

Jeffrev. Brown@louisvilleky.gov

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel. Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, March 4, 2022 12:05 PM

To: Brown, leffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Luv it Landscaping

Hi Jeff!
Here is Luv-It Landscaping’s cost estimate to preform island median beautification at four (there is two locations at
Crittenden & Eastern Parkway) District 15 jocations during 2022. Will you/Public Works accept the funds?



P.O. Box 17192
Louisville, KY 40217

Bill To:

Dan Luckett

Councilman Kevin Triplett
601 W Jefferson St
Louisville, Ky 40202

Home Phone
574-3918

Description:
Maintenance for 2022

Crittenden & Warnock

Eastern Parkway / Crittenden Dr
Manslick & Gagel

trim x2

mulch

Fertilize

pre-emergent

pick up garbage

Thank You for your business!

Invoice

Number: 9424
Date: 211712022

Ship To:

Dan Luckett

Councilman Kevin Triplett
601 W Jefferson St
Louisville, Ky 40202

Work Phone

Amount

$2,460.00
$980.00
$1,080.00

Total $4,520.00





