Print Form

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
s Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Cindi Fowler |

| Amount: 55,792.27 Date: March 4, 2019 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Additional funding for the Ashby Lane Sidewalk project. The funds are in the following accounts
listed in order or payment priority:
$1,038.15 8672 410 8105 148375 822702
$5,563.84 8126 410 148946 822814
$49,190.28 8102 41 8105 148375 822702

City Agency: Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Steve Kurowsky, PE

Agency Phone: (502) 574 8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Approved by:
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Budget Revision #:
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Department/Project:
Additional funds for Ashby Lane Sidewalk

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Ashby Lane Sidewalk - Additional funding
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: Beth Stenberg Date: Mar 4, 2019

Revised May 2016



Thieneman, Cindy L

From: Kurowsky, Steve M.

Sent: Wednesday, February 20, 2019 4:57 PM
To: Fowler, Cindi

Cc: Thieneman, Cindy L; Stenberg, Beth
Subject: Ashby Lane sidewalk project

CW Fowler,

If and when the additional $55,792.27 shows up for this project, this should enable us to complete the sidewalk up to
Rancho Drive. At this end of the project, we are going to need to acquire a Perm. Sidewalk Easement in front of 6107
Ashby Lane (Grace Crossing Church). Would your office like to reach out to them for a “donated” easement? This could
save the project (and taxpayers) a little bit of money here. | have often heard that churches are the worst to deal with,
but we recently had a church in D10 donate a sidewalk easement to Metro. If they don’t want to donate, we can still go
through with it with our R/W department and acquire it with payment.

With this new additional funding and expanded scope | am going to move forward with the preparation of the R/W
documents now. Please let me know...

Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government
Transportation Division
Metro Development Center
444 South 5" Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202

Tel (0): (502) 574-8743

Tel (c): (502) 565-7601
Steve.Kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov




Thieneman, Cindy L

From: Stenberg, Beth

Sent: Friday, February 15, 2019 5:05 PM

To: Fowler, Cindi

Cc: Gowin, Dirk L; Kurowsky, Steve M,; Thieneman, Cindy L; Tackett, Danielle; Bell, LaTonya J;
Haines, Matthew R; Bradley, Maxwell B.; Tipton, Benjamin K.

Subject: RE: Ashby Lane

Whew... you are welcome.

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Friday, February 15, 2019 5:04 PM

To: Stenberg, Beth

Cc: Gowin, Dirk L; Kurowsky, Steve M.; Thieneman, Cindy L; Tackett, Danielle; Bell, LaTonya J.; Haines, Matthew R;
Bradley, Maxwell B.; Tipton, Benjamin K.

Subject: Re: Ashby Lane

Thank you so much everyone who helped to get this done. | am so exctied to move forward with this project. You guys
rock! Cind

Sent from my iPad

> On Feb 15, 2019, at 4:42 PM, Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

>

> | apparently need sleep... You asked the question and | picked up

> without checking balances! We have already dealt with this issue and

> resolved back in December... We have already moved the PAV funds

> (thanks to Ben!! for finding a paving invoice to charge it to) |

> approved this and he moved the funds from PAV to MAP Match along with

> another small amount. We had this written on our spreadsheet that it

> was going to be done, but was looking at an old report of balances.

> Max confirmed to me this afternoon there is zero in the PAV account

>

> Where we are now:

> There is $49,190.28 (if the $438.72 encumbrance can be released Max) in 8102 410 8105 148375 822702 MAP Match.
There is an additional $1,038.15 in 8672 410 8105 148375 822702 MAP Match which can also be used. And there is
$5,563.84 in 8126 410 148946 822814 MAP which also is available for reallocation. All the small remaining MAP funds
were left from the Greystone, Poplarwood Dr and Deering Rd sidewalk repair MAP050218PW14 and available for
redistribution.

>

> Therefore, a MAP request for $55,792.27 can be prepared and submitted for the Ashby Lane sidewalk project. Let me
know if you need any additional information. And | am sorry for wasting part of your day Max running down balances
and purchase orders for something we had already done!

>

> Cindi, let me know if you need any further information or help with the MAP allocation.

>

> Beth



Thieneman, Cindy L

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Monday, March 18, 2019 4:55 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz

Cc: Ott, Stephen; Stenberg, Beth; Thieneman, Cindy L; Bell, LaTonya J.; Kurowsky, Steve M.;
Blackwell, Rick; Helton, Jessamyn

Subject: Re: Ashby Lane sidewalk project

Thank you Liz and Rick!!
Sent from my iPad

On Mar 18, 2019, at 3:18 PM, McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

CW Fowler & Stephen — Per CM Blackwell, please add this item to the Appropriations agenda for next
week.

Thanks,
Liz McQuillen

<image003.png>Liz McQuillen | Legislative Aide

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112 £ (502) 574-3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

From: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, March 18, 2019 3:08 PM

To: Ott, Stephen <Stephen.Ott@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Thieneman, Cindy L
<Cindy.Thieneman@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>; Kurowsky,
Steve M. <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>; Blackwell, Rick <Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov>;
McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@]ouisvilleky.gov>; Helton, Jessamyn <Jessamyn.Helton@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Ashby Lane sidewalk project

Thank you Stephen!
Rick,
Do you have an objection to it being heard in appropriations sir? | appreciate your consideration! Cindi

Sent from my iPad

On Mar 18, 2019, at 3:03 PM, Ott, Stephen <Stephen.Ott@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Council Member Fowler,

MAP applications do not go through the full Council. In other words, it is not read
into record under New Business. This decision would be entirely up to
Appropriations Committee Chairman Blackwell.



