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CIF020922PW21

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Nicole George |

| Amount: $1,000 Date: 1/12/2022 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
New entrance signs for Cliff and Bellevue Parks. They are both neighborhood pocket parks that will
receive two signs each for a total of four signs.
Cost per sign is $250. $250 x 4 = $1,000.

The total cost of four signs is estimated to be $1,000.

City Agency: Louisville Parks and Recreation
Contact Person: Mesude Duyar

Agency Phone: 502-574-7275

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

21 m M $1,000 1/12/2022
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Print Form

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _CIF020922PW21 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name Louisville Parks and Recreation

 Program/Project Name: 7

New Signs for Cliff Park and Bellevue Park

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville . B

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
'Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than |

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes
L

Submitted by: Rachel Roarx, District 21 Legislative Aide Date: Jan 12, 2022

Revised May 2016



Roarx, Rachel G.
h

From: Duyar, Mesude

Sent: Wednesday, January 12, 2022 2:12 PM
To: Roarx, Rachel G.

Cc: George, Nicole A.

Subject: RE: FW: Cliff park sign- Graffiti
Importance: High

Categories: Allocate $

Yes.. We are accepting the funds.

LOUISVILLE
PARKS

=" AND RECREATION
Mesude Duyar

Assistant Director, Operations

1297 Trevilian Way
Louisville, Kentucky 40213

Main Office: (502) 574-7275

A Nationally-Accredited
Parks & Recreation Agency

vivrw.bestparksever.com

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, January 12, 2022 11:58 AM

To: Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: FW: Cliff park sign- Graffiti

| will start the NDF paperwork to cover the cost of 4 new signs.

Mesude — Will you accept the funds of $1000 on behalf of Parks and Rec?

Rachel Roarx | Legislative Aide

Office of District 21 Councilwoman Nicole George

City Hall | 601 W. Jefferson St. | 3" Floor
Office: (502) 574-1121

Click here to sign up for the District 21 eNewsletter!
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Roarx, Rachel G.

m

From: George, Nicole A.

Sent: Sunday, December 12, 2021 9:56 PM
To: Duyar, Mesude; Roarx, Rachel G.
Subject: Re: FW: Cliff park sign- Graffiti
Categories: Allocate $

Rachel- Please move forward with ordering. Each park gets 2 signs for both entrances?

From: Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, November 15, 2021 1:24 PM

To: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: FW: Cliff park sign- Graffiti

Rachel, sorry for the delay responding your question.
Each sign costs ~$250.

LOUISVILLE
PARKS

&5 AND RECREATION
Mesude Duyar

Assistant Director, Operations

1297 Trevilian Way

Louisville, Kentucky 40213
Main Office: (502)574-7275

A Nationally-Accredited
Parks & Recreation Agency
www. bestparksever.com

From: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, November 2, 2021 2:08 PM

To: Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Abbott, Jeffrey T. <Jeffrey.Abbott@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: FW: CIiff park sign- Graffiti

E203-61839.pdf
Here is one of the latest quotes we got from Fastsigns for Park entrance signs. The signs are about $200 each plus

another $50 for the posts and hardware.




Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Louisville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell)
jason.canuel@Ilouisvilleky.gov

@R LOUISVILLE
(EIRE b wecemon

From: Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 12:34 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Abbott, Jeffrey T. <Jeffrey.Abbott@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: FW: Cliff park sign- Graffiti

Jason, can you please let me know the name of the vendor we work with for Parks signs? | don't think we should wait
two months for an estimate. We will communicate with the vendor.

<< OLE Object: Picture {Device Independent Bitmap) >>

From: Mikesell, Matthew C. <Matthew.Mikesell@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 12:31 PM

To: Duyar, Mesude <Mesude.Duyar@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Abbott, Jeffrey T. <Jeffrey.Abbott@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Task Status Report: FW: Cliff park sign- Graffiti

I spoke with Steve from central services about getting an estimate for the signs at Cliff park and Bellevue park. He told
me that he has been very busy trying to get signs before the weather gets really cold and he said that he wont be able to

get an estimate for a couple of months because he is so busy.

-—---Original Task-----
Subject: FW: Cliff park sign- Graffiti
Priority: Normal

Start date: Fri 10/15/2021
Due date: Wed 10/20/2021

Status: Completed
% Complete: 100%




Date completed: Mon 10/25/2021
Actual work: 0 hours

Requested by: Duyar, Mesude

)21 5:57 PM

Graffiti

Can | get an estimate for new signs at Cliff and Belleview?

From: Roarx, Rachel G. <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, October 14, 2021 3:10 PM
To: George, Nicole A. <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Cliff park sign

Sent from my iPhone



