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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
D Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
XCapital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)

D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Primary Sponsor: District 6, Councilman David A. James

Amount: $4,500.00 Date: 4/28/14

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): To repair the alley "from Taylor
Blvd. To Hardy Avenue parallel to Rodman Street ©49,000.00 total coat with $4,500.'00
from GIF and the additional matching alley funds from account #8101 410 8210 148250
822702 @ $4,500.00

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone®502) 574-6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Date

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:

Revised July 2013



NDF OR GIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
InteragencyName: ? ^\ ^ U/Qr^
Progran^Project Name=^^^__3^|_J^J_^^
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? u.^<;

y^-^
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amoimt? u.<g^Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description?

Funding Source: IfCIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

M^_

y^Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
not, the funding source is probably NDF.

^
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000?

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

,1Q_

A<̂
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Effective October 2013



Smith, Wanda M

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:
Subject:

Metcalfe, Andrew
Thursday, April 03, 2014 8:36 AM
Smith, Wanda M
James, David A
RE: Alleys

Wanda,

Here are the requested alley estimates:

1. From Compton Street to Rodman Street parallel to and between Creel Avenue and Algonquin Parkway: $22,000
2. From Taylor Blvd to Hardy Avenue parallel to Rodman Street: $9,000
3. There are 4 different alleys in the 2700 block of Rodman. Which alley are you requesting the estimate on? See

map below.
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Thanks,

Andrew

From: Smith, Wanda M
Sent: Tuesday, March 25, 2014 2:06 PM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew
Cc: James, David A
Subject: Alleys
Importance: High

Would you provide us with estimate on several alleys and they are as follows:
. Between Compton and Rodman in the rear of 700 Algonquin Pkwy
. Between Hardy and Taylor Blvd
. 2700 Block of Rodman



A street sign is needed at Hardey and Rodman. Please be advised that this is a time sensitive matter and would
appreciate you expedient response regarding this matter.

Thanking you in advance for your cooperation.

G>t.: ^''../..-(y»uf/i
Office of Councilman David A. James,
District 6

wanda.smith@louisvilleky.gov

(502) 574-1106


