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CIF110321PW15

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
! Primary Sponsor: Kevn Triplett ;

[ Amount: $18,629.50 Date: Sep 29, 2021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding requested for sidewalk repair and to add handicap curb cuts at four locations along Locust

Lane and Parkway Drive. .
The total cost of the project is $37,259, and Public Works and District 15 are each paying half

of the costs.

City Agency: Metro Public Works and Assets

Contact Person: Craig Allen

Agency Phone: 502-574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

f
é
15 — ¢ ﬂ $18,629.50 Sept 29, 2021

Print Form

District # C&un}i] Member Signathré Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _CIF110321PW15 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Sidewalk repair and ramps; Locust Lane and Parkway Dr.

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

NA

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? Ne. NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid v

es

estimate and description of cost?

Submitted by: shughes Date: Sep 29, 2021

Revised May 2016
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Gmail - FW: Sidewalk handicap Ramps along Preston Highway https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=2becf33317& view=pt&search=a...

Gmail Susan Hughes <swhughes11@gmail.com>

FW: Sidewalk handicap Ramps along Preston Highway

1 message

Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov> Wed, Sep 29, 2021 at 9:48 AM

To: "swhughes11@gmail.com” <swhughes11@gmail.com>

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel Luckett@louisvilleky gov>
Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 1:09 PM

To: Hughes, Susan <Susan Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE; Sidewalk handicap Ramps along Preston Highway

Yes ma'am!

From: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilieky.gov>

Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 1:07 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Sidewalk handicap Ramps along Preston Highway

So it's $18,629.50 from CIF- right?

Get Qutlook for i0OS

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 1:03:27 PM

To: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilieky.gov>

Subject: FW: Sidewalk handicap Ramps along Preston Highway

Hi ma’am!

No rush on this just wanted you to have when you are ready. Explanation, location, cost, map and Craig's acceptance of the $money is below. Councilman
has signed off on this!

From: Allen, Craig L <Craig Allen@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 10:58 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel. Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Sidewalk Ramps

Yes, Public Works will accept the funds for the below work.

Craig Alien, PE

Engineer i

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov

(502) 574 6159

lof3 9/29/2021, 11:54 AM



Gmail - FW: Sidewalk handicap Ramps along Preston Highway

20f3

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel Lucketi@ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Saturday, September 25, 2021 12:02 PM

To: Alien, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Ramps

Thank you Sirl Will you accept the funds from the District 15 office?

From: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, September 24, 2021 1:39 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel. Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Sidewalk Ramps

Dan,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=2becf33317& view=pt&search=a...

The estimate to repair sidewalks and add curb cuts at the four locations below, along the Preston Hwy side of the below cemetery’s, between Locust Lane
and Parkway Drive is $37,259. As discussed Public Works will cover half of the cost if Councilman Triplet can provide the remaining $18,629.50. If you have

any questions let me know.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer Il

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 51 Street, 41 Floor
Louisvifle KY 40202
craig.alien@louisvilleky.gov

(502)574-6159

9/29/2021, 11:54 AM





