Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
X _Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilman David Tandy

LAmount: $8,320 Date: December 15, 2014

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): District four is allocating $8320 to
repair the sidewalks at Clay and Oak Street, 1121 South Clay Street

D4 MAP $8,320 Account # 8676-410-81 60-048204-822702
D4 MAP Match $8,320 Account # 8676-410-8160-048204-822702

Total Funding Source $16,639.20

City Agency: Public Works and Asset
Contact Person: Craig Allen

Agency Phone: (502)574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose

4 $ 8.320 12/15/14
District # Council Member Signafire Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:

Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:

Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Department/Project:
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~ NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name Pubhc Works and Asset

Program/Pr()]ect Name sndewalk repalr on clay and Oak Street

Request Form: Is the NDF Request S1gned by all Councﬂ Member(s) Appropnatmg Fundmg‘?

Request Form: If matchmg funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form descnptlon’?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be. used does the amount of the request st exclude the matcilmé
fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this pl‘OjeCt, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description?

Yes/N ofi\lA

yes

yes

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, bulldmg |
| or equ1pment'7 ) If not, the fundmg source is probably NDF.

Fundmg Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more ore than one yeér‘?m If
not, the ﬁmdmg source is probably NDF.

Ordmance Requlred Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5 000?

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Date 12/ I 5/1

Prepared by Keidra ng
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Kina, Keidra

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Monday, December 15, 2014 7:44 AM
To: King, Keidra

Subject: RE: Emailing: sidewalk clay and oak

Keidra, we’ll accept the funding. We’'ll begin putting this repair in motion as soon as the funds are appropriated.

Thanks,

Craiy AHlen

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Oftfice: (502) 574-6159

Fax. (502) 574-4129

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Friday, December 12, 2014 7:05 PM
To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: Emailing: sidewalk clay and oak

Hello Craig,
Councilman Tandy has agreed to fund this project.
Please confirm that public works will accept $16,639.20 from district four.

Yours in Service,

Keidra D.C. King

Metro Council District Four
Councilman David Tandy
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
Office: 502.574.1104

*All meeting and public appearance request should be sent to District4@louisvilleky.gov *

From: Allen, Craig L
Sent: Thursday, December 11, 2014 4:39 PM



To: King, Keidra
Cc: Rivers, Arnitra N
Subject: RE: Emailing: sidewalk clay and oak

Keidra, here is your estimate below. If Councilman Tandy would like to proceed with this repair I'll be his project
manager.

SR# 4384366
LOCATION 1121 South Clay Street
REQUESTED BY . D4
RATE 5
DATE SENT 12/11/2014
ESTIMATE BY CA
106 SY of S/W, 44 SY of pavers, 70 LF of
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS curb, 20 SF of detectable pavers
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $16,639.20
Estimate is valid for 90 days from date
sent. Any requests after 90 days will

require re-inspection.
Thanks,

Craig Allen

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5th Street, Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-6159

Fax: (502) 574-4129

----- Original Message--—-

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Monday, December 08, 2014 3:26 PM
To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: Re: Emailing: sidewalk clay and oak

Okay, thanks
Keidra D. King
Please excuse typos

Sent from my iPhone

Your voice can change the world.
—President Barack Obama, 44

On Dec 8, 2014, at 3:21 PM, Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:



