
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

. Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

Primary Sponsor: David Yates

Amount: $75,000.00 Date: Jul6,2017

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Paving Hardwood Forest Drive between 3419 Hardwood Forest Drive and Princess Wood Court.

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # "Council Membo^ignature

$75,000.00

Amount

7/^//7
Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount: _ Amended Amount:

Reference #: _ To 0MB:_

Budget Revision #:

Account#:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Date
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NDF, GIF, MAP OR PAY INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST '

I Interagency Name: Public Works

Name: paving Hardwood Forest Drive between 3419 HWF & Princess Wood Court |
"Yes/No/NA'

I Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
[ Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
[ account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

I Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
I disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: IfCIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
I ownAvill own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

funding source is probably NDF.

I Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
I life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

I Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
I $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

! Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
i If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

I Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
I estimate and description of cost?

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

NA

Yes

_j

Submitted by; Brian Bales Date: Jul6,2017

Revised May 2016



Yates, David

From:

Sent:

To:
Cc:
Subject:

Bales, Brian

Monday, June 19, 2017 5:01 PM
Brown, Jeffrey E; Haines, Matthew R
Yates, David; Browning, Cheryl L; Stenberg, Beth
RE: hardwood forest dr

Great! Thank you. We will create a CIF for this paving.

Thank you,

Brian Boles
Legislative Assistant
President David Yates

District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 1st floor
Louisville, KY 40202
Email: brian.boles(S)louisvilleky.Rov

Office: (502) 574-1125

Click HERE to sign up for the weekly District 25 eNews!

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to
which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are notified that any review, use, disclosure,

distributing or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Monday, June 19, 2017 2:55 PM
To: Bales, Brian; Haines, Matthew R
Cc: Yates, David; Browning, Cheryl L.; Stenberg, Beth
Subject: RE: hardwood forest dr

We can certainly coordinate the forfeited bond paving with the overall project if you wish to add sections & funding.

For the speed humps, criteria need to be met before humps are improved and installed so make sure you go thru the
evaluation process.

Paving between 3419Hardwood Forest Dr and Princess Wood Ct would be about $75,000

Jeffrey Brown, PE, PTOE

From: Bales, Brian
Sent: Monday, June 19, 2017 11:32 AM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E; Haines, Matthew R
Cc: Yates, David; Browning, Cheryl L.; Stenberg, Beth
Subject: RE: hardwood forest dr



Jeff,

Does the below email still stand? During our conversation about paving this year I discussed David's desire to repave
Hardwood Forest Drive, between Princess Wood Court to Dead End and then possibly assist in installing speed humps. I
see below that from 3419 Hardwood Forest to Dead End is Bonded in Section 2.

As is expressed in the attached email Hardwood Forests bonds have been forfeited but the funds are still waiting to be
sent. Is it possible to time the use of these funds for the paving of Section 2 (3419 Hardwood Forest Drive to Dead End)
with the paving of Section 1 (Princess Wood Court to 3419 Hardwood Forest Drive) by including these funds in the
budget or as a CIF if necessary?

If so, I wish to request a quote for the cost of the paving between Princess Wood Court to 3419 Hardwood Forest Drive.

Thank you,

Brian Boles
Legislative Assistant
President David Yates

District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 1st floor
Louisville, KY 40202
Email: brian.boles(a)louisvillekv.gov

Office: (502) 574-1125

Click HERE to sign up for the weekly District 25 eNews!

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to
which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are notified that any review, use, disclosure,

distributing or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Monday, June 27, 2016 11:42 AM
To: Bales, Brian
Cc: Browning, Cheryl L.
Subject: FW: hardwood forest dr

Brian,
Most of Hardwood Forest Dr is still within a bonded subdivision that is under construction. What that means, the
developer is still responsible for the public roads in the subdivision. Final surface of asphalt hasn't been installed either
because of the ongoing construction of single family homes. Final asphalt isn't typically installed until the subdivision is
80% to 95% complete. I recommend removing your request for paving of Hardwood Forest Dr between Princess Wood
Ct and dead end because this will be the responsibility of the developer and it is an active construction site which could
result in substantial damage to a freshly payed road.

Jeffrey Brown, PE, PTOE

From: Browning, Cheryl L.
Sent: Monday, June 27, 2016 9:15 AM



To: Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: hardwood forest dr

Princess Wood Ct. is in Sec. 1 which was never bonded. Hardwood Forest Dr. is bonded from 3419 to the
dead end in Sec. 2. We have damage bonds for Sees. 2 & 3, but no mention of Sec. 1. Thanks.

Cheryl L. Browning
Administrative Specialist
Louisville Metro Planning <& Design Services

Transportation Review
444 S. 5th St.. Suite 200
Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-6761 (phone)
(502) 574-1334 (fax)
^ Please consider the environment

before printing this email

DEVELOI)
LOUISVILLE
!l.;il!f\'!LlL SOKH'AKf'j

From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Saturday, June 25, 2016 12:46 PM
To: Browning, Cheryl L.
Subject: hardwood forest dr

Cheryl,
Is Hardwood Forest Dr between Princess Wood Ct and dead end still bonded?

Jeffrey Brown, PE, PTOE
Assistant Director of Public Works

444 S 5th St, 4th Floor
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-0065
Cell (502)773-3222
Jeffrey.brown(5)louisvillekv.gov


