Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request @

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
. Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

‘ Primary Sponsor: Councilman Jerry T. Miller, District 19 ‘ ]

| Amount: $12,000 Date: 10 Oct 2014 - |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funds will allow Metro Public Works to pave Polo Fields Court, a metro owned
road.

City Agency:  Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 574-6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

19 $12,000 10 Oct 2014

District # @ Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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~ NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST _

Interagency Name: Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Polo Fields Ct Paving Project

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? Y
Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the ;
request form description? N) A—
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amount? N A'

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in N
the request form description? A’

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building \
ot equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. /
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,0007? _ N'/ f-l
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for )
the fiscal year $25,000 or less? N }A’
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Harrington, Scott _

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Friday, October 10, 2014 11:31 AM
To: Harrington, Scott

Subject: RE: District 19 Paving Estimates
Scott,

Polo Fields Court would be $12,000 and can be completed with Crosstimbers. Let me know if you plan to appropriate
funds so | can work it in the schedule. Nelson Miller Parkway is tentatively on the Public Works schedule for next fiscal
year beginning July 2015. | can get an estimate if you want it, but PW will be taking care of that one soon. CM Miller may
prefer to spend his money elsewhere.

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Harrington, Scott

Sent: Thursday, October 09, 2014 3:51 PM

To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: District 19 Paving Estimates

Importance: High

Andrew — Councilman Miller is considering allocating funds to pave one more street in District 19.
Would you please give me a cost estimate to pave:

e Polo Field Ct. (rated a 12)
o Nelson Miller Pkwy from Forest Centre to Park View Ct. (rated a 13)

Councilman Miller was wondering if you can have Polo Field Ct. paved when Crosstimbers is scheduled to be paved since
both are in Polo Fields.

Please let me know asap so | can start the appropriation to your dept.

Scott

Scott W. Harrington | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Jerry T. Miller
Louisville Metro Council | District 19



phone: 502.574.3464 City Hall

email: scott.harrington@Ilouisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

ﬁSign up for District 19’s E-Newsletter




