Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

X Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
[ Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler- District 14 : l

| Amount: $28,126.38 Date: March 9, 2015 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Municipal Aid Program Funding, in conjunction with Capital Infrastructure Funding, will be
directed to Public Works and Assets for a paving project on Johnsontown Road from Tradeport
Drive to Yuma Way for a cost of $32,000.00

Funding sources (in order of application):

D14 MAP $28,126.38 8672 410 8106 048214 822702
CIF Appropriation $3873.62

City Agency: Public Works and Assets

Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 574-6789

| have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.

1Y 9251262  3b/x

District # Council Member Signature Amount Ddte’/

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: . Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2013




3/9/2015 Fwd: Paving Estimates for District 12

Fwd: Paving Estimates for District 12

Kennedy, Liz

Sent: Tuesday, March 03, 2015 4:49 PM
To: Bowman, Michael
Attachments:image002.png (12 KB)

FYI-
Would D14 be willing to pay the $32,000 for Johnsontown from trade port to Yuma?

Liz Kennedy

Legislative Assistant to Councilman Rick Blackwell
Metro Council District 12

601 West Jefferson Street, Louisville, KY 40202

0) 502.574.1112

F) 502.573.3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Metcalfe, Andrew" <Andrew.Metcalfe@louisvilleky.gov>
Date: March 3, 2015 at 3:54:46 PM EST

To: "Kennedy, Liz" <Liz.Kennedy@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Paving Estimates for District 12

Liz;
Here are the estimates you requested:

1. Ledgewood Parkway — this is the entrance to the Ledgewood Apartments. It's a private road
and is being maintained by the apartment complex. I’'m not sure how it made it into our
inventory but I've made the correction.

2. Pikes Peak Blvd from Manslick Road to Table Mountain Avenue: $80,000

Greenview Drive from Lower Hunters Trace to Hunters Point Circle: $70,000

Milner Road — this road isn’t in terrible shape, | would hold off on any paving here for
another year or two.

Mount Holyoke Drive from Hunters Point Circle to Mount Blanc Road: $60,000
Barbrook Road from 7614 Norwich Blvd to Kenhurst Drive: $12,000

Johnsontown Road from Tradeport to Yuma Way (D14): $32,000

Johnsontown Road from Yuma Way to Johnsontown Drive (D12): $28,000
Johnsontown Road from Johnsontown Drive to Greenbelt (D14): $100,000
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Let me know if you need anything else.

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Kennedy, Liz

https://email.louisvilleky.gov/iowa/?ae=Itemn &t=1PM Note&id=RgAAAACIM 1X%2b8jWzQ5U CPLQCdSPcBwB7dR %2f4ubdm R YxZzSVyJOWRAAAAZ SCtAAB. .
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Fwd: Paving Estimates for District 12

Sent: Thursday, February 26, 2015 10:33 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew
Subject: RE: Paving Estimates for District 12

Andrew —

Please add the remainder of Johnsontown Road for estimates. | spoke with Michael about this and
D14 is interested, but wants to know the cost.

Thanks,
Liz Kennedy

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Thursday, February 26, 2015 7:49 AM
To: Kennedy, Liz

Subject: RE: Paving Estimates for District 12

Liz,
| can get you something on these early next week.

On Johnsontown Road, | would consider working with D14 on that route. | looked at it for D14 last
year and | would prefer not to pave one block in the middle of the road when sections on both ends
stretch into D14 need to be paved also.

Flintlock Drive is not on the PW paving schedule at this time. It's probably a year or two out from
making our list.

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Kennedy, Liz

Sent: Wednesday, February 25, 2015 5:08 PM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Cc: Kennedy, Liz

Subject: Paving Estimates for District 12

Good Afternoon Andrew -
Councilman Blackwell would like paving estimates for the following roadways:

Ledgewood (Manslick to Ledgewood Court) — Rated 16
Pikes Peak Blvd — (entire length)

- Beau - High Pine — Rated 3

- Patio — Hill Peak — Rated 37

- Manslick — Leon — Rated 45

- Leon—Beau — Rated 47

- High Pine to Patio — Rated 59
Greenview Drive (entire length)

- @Greenview Ct — Marguerite — 27

- Krause — Lower Hunters — 38
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3/9/2015 Fwd: Paving Estimates for District 12

Milner Road — Rated 24
Mount Holyoke —
- Hunters Point — Mount Everest — 28
- Mount Everest — Matterhorn — 47
- Matterhorn — Mount Marcy — 55
Barbrook (Norwich to Kenhurst) — Rated 27
Johnsontown Road (Yuma to Johnsontown) — 53

We also want to confirm that Flintlock Road is one of the roads that PW plans to pave (without
CIF/MAP Funding).

The MAP MATCH spending deadline really snuck up on me. Is there any way we can get these
estimates by late next week? (I know that is asking A LOT). '

Please giveme a call tomorrow to discuss.
Liz

Liz Kennedy Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street ' Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112 ' (502) 574-3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

hitps:/email louisvilleky.gov/iowa/?ae=ltem&t=IPM Note&id=RgAAAACIM 1X%2b8)WzQ5U CPLQCdSPcBwB7dR % 2M4ubdm R YXZZzSVyJOWRAAAAZSCIAAB. . 3/3



Bowman, Michael

=== —
From: Fowler, Cindi
Sent: Monday, March 09, 2015 11:46 AM
To: Bowman, Michael
Subject: Signature
Michael,

As I am in Washington for the NLC Conference, you have my permission to sign both the MAP and CIF forms for the
Johnsontown Rd paving project.
Thanks!

Thank you,

Councilwoman Cindi Fowler

Louisville Metro Council | District 14
p:(502) 574-1114

e: cindi.fowler@louisvilleky.gov




