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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
X Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

[] Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

L _Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
[ Primary Sponsor: Vicki Aubrey Welch, District 13 l

| Amount: $480.00 Date: March 10, 2014 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

NDF to Parks for materials / lumber, needed for Eagle Scout Bridge Project planned for
Waverly Park.

City Agency: Metro Parks
Contact Person: Bennett Knox
Agency Phone: 366-2913

| have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.
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District # Council Member Signatiire Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
f Department/Project: *
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NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Parks

Program/Project Name: Eagle Scout Bridge Project at Waverly Park

. not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding?
Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description?
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching v
fund amount?
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in N
the request form description?
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building NA
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,0007?

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
. the fiscal year $25,000 or less?
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Triplett, Kevin D

From: Welch, Vicki A

Sent: Friday, March 07, 2014 11:36 AM
To: Knox, Bennett; Triplett, Kevin D
Subject: Re: Costs for Eagle Scout Project
Attachments: image001.jpg; image002.png
Bennett,

That's great! Kevin will have the paperwork done by Monday's noon deadline to get this funded.
Kevin,
This is an Eagle Scout project for a bridge to be built at Waverly Park. The scout is Chris Portman from District 13.

Vicki Aubrey Welch
Councilwoman District 13
574-1113
www.louisvilleky.gov/district13
Sent from iPhone

On Mar 7, 2014, at 11:20 AM, "Knox, Bennett" <Bennett.Knox@louisvilieky.gov> wrote:

Vicki,

After speaking with the scout’s mom, the only item he was not able to procure is some rough sawn
lumber that we purchase from J&J Pallet. These are the twelve 2”x12”x16’ boards at are $40 each. For
a total of =5480.

So that would need to be the total amount of the request.
Please let me know if you need additional information from us.
Thanks!

Bennett

Bennett Knox, Parks Administrator

Louisville Metro Parks

Natural Areas Division/lefferson Memorial Forest
PO Box 467 Fairdale, KY 40118

502.366.2913 (office)

502.368-6517 (Fax)

www.memorialforest.com
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