Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
X Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

[J Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Ll Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
] Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler- District 14 ]

| Amount: $3000.00 Date: 7/17/2014 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Neighborhood Development Funding will be directed to the Louisville Metro Police Department's
3" Division for overtime operations within District 14, specifically targeted ATV patrols due to
recent youth violence along the Louisville Loop/Levee Trail.

City Agency: Metro Police
Contact Person: Amy McTyeire

Agency Phone: 502-574-3819

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.
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District # Cduncil Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount;
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned: e YT

- —LIT AL iR
TRICL OF MriRo =
o LEVITHED

Revised July 2013

m«m,;zéiﬂiﬁm



NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

‘ Interagency Name Lou15v1lle Metro Police Department

Program/PrOJect Name: Dlstrlct 14 Overtime Funding

‘ Yes/No/NA
' Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the N/A
request form description?
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching N/A
fund amount? N
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in N/A
. the request form description?
. Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building N/A
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If | N/A
not, the funding source is probably NDF. ,
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? . No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for N/A

the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Effective October 2013

Date: /) 7//9/ L




Bowman, Michael

From: Harper, Jimmy

Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2014 2:59 PM
To: Bowman, Michael

Subject: RE: Overtime Funding

Please do so, and we will coordinate dates to put personnel on the floodwall. Thanks

From: Bowman, Michael

Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2014 2:51 PM
To: Harper, Jimmy

Cc: McTyeire, Amy; Fowler, Cindi
Subject: RE: Overtime Funding

I 'apologize for failing to denote that the amount of funding will be $3000, per your previous conversation with
Councilwoman Fowler.

Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p: 502.574.1114 City Hall

e: michael.bowman@Iouisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

From: Bowman, Michael

Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2014 2:41 PM

To: Harper, Jimmy (Jimmy.Harper@louisvilleky.gov)
Cc: McTyeire, Amy; Fowler, Cindi

Subject: Overtime Funding

Major Harper,

Per your conversation with Councilwoman Fowler and in order to process the funding transfer, | need your confirmation
that your division will accept District 14 NDF funding for overtime operations use within District 14, specifically the
targeted ATV operation on the Levee Trail.

Please respond to this email that you will accept the funding and | will initiate the appropriation.

Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.
Thanks!




Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p: 502.574.1114 City Hall

e: michael.bowman@Iouisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202




Bowman, Michael

From: Harper, Jimmy

Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2014 3:06 PM
To: Bowman, Michael

Cc: Fowler, Cindi

Subject: RE: Overtime Funding

Councilwoman Fowler,

In an effort to maximize the monies to ensure we get as much coverage as possible. | intend on running two
Officers/ATV’s a minimum of 12hrs a weekend for 5 weekends. Officers will be paired up due to the safety issue along
the floodwall. Each officer will work 3 hrs per shift. We will also do enforcement during the evening hours to ensure we
are hitting at the peak times. We might change the patrol times after an assessment is made on the issue.

Thanks so much for the support.

Major J. Harper

Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2014 2:51 PM
To: Harper, Jimmy

Cc: McTyeire, Amy; Fowler, Cindi
Subject: RE: Overtime Funding

I apologize for failing to denote that the amount of funding will be $3000, per your previous conversation with
Councilwoman Fowler,

Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p: 502.574.1114 City Hall

e: michael.bowman@Iouisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

From: Bowman, Michael

Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2014 2:41 PM

To: Harper, Jimmy (Jimmy.Harper@Iouisvilleky.gov)
Cc: McTyeire, Amy; Fowler, Cindi

Subject: Overtime Funding

Major Harper,



Per your conversation with Councilwoman Fowler and in order to process the funding transfer, | need your confirmation
that your division will accept District 14 NDF funding for overtime operations use within District 14, specifically the
targeted ATV operation on the Levee Trail.

Please respond to this email that you will accept the funding and | will initiate the appropriation.

Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.
Thanks!

Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p: 502.574.1114 City Hall

e: michael.bowman@louisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202




