Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Brandon Coan |

| Amount: $5200 Date: 3.22.18 l

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Creation of hardened median at the intersection of Ashwood Drive and Saratoga Drive

City Agency: puyblic Works

Contact Person: steve Kurowsky

Agency Phone: 574 g743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving depart eptconcerning the project/expenditure.
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District # buneil Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Commiittee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
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Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
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Revised May 2016

Page 1




Department/Project:
Public Works/ Median at the intersecion of Ashwood Drive and Saratoga Drive

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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 NDF,CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST =~

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

“Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

~Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
- life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
- §5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

‘Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Ashwood Drive/ Saratoga Drive Median

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA
NA
NA -]
Yes
Yes
NA
NA

Yes

Submitted by: Jasmine Weatherby

Date: 3.22.18

Revised May 2016




Helton, Jessamyn

- Ao T s e e )
From: Coan, Brandon
Sent: Thursday, March 22, 2018 5:39 PM
To: Weatherby, Jasmine; Helton, Jessamyn
Subject: Re: CIF application forms

Thanks, Jasmine.

Jess - please let this serve as my request/authorization for Jasmine to sign the CIFs she described, for the reasons she
described, on my behalf.

Best Regards,
SBC
Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 22, 2018, at 2:11 PM, Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine.Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Hi Jess,

As Brandon is out with following the birth of Baby Simon, he has asked that I sign the CIF forms in his
absence so that we are able to make the Monday deadline. | have copied Brandon so he can chime in
and give his confirmation. There are two CIFs — one for an honorary street sign in the amount of $188, a
second for a median at the intersection of Ashwood and Saratoga for $5200.

Thank you

Jasmine (Masterson) Weatherby

Legislative Aide

Councilman Brandon Coan

District 8

601 West Jefferson St

Louisville, KY 40202

Email: jasmine.weatherby@Iouisvilleky.gov

Office: (502) 574-1108

Please sign-up to receive important notifications regarding District 8! Our goal is to increase from zero to
8,000 engaged subscribers by 2019.




Masterson, Jasmine

I S
From: Kurowsky, Steve M.
Sent: Wednesday, January 31, 2018 1:32 PM
To: Coan, Brandon
Cc: Masterson, Jasmine
Subject: RE: Your Review and possible HELP!

CM Coan / Jasmine,

I did a new estimate for providing new “Historic” concrete curbing around this island area. The items required would be
sawcutting, new Historic Concrete Header Curb, topsoil, sod and a Mobilization charge. These are the costs for my
Secondary contractor. My Primary contractor has a much higher Mob charge. | am also hoping that they would be
willing to mobilize for something this small. The total cost would be $5,200. | would also want to get Traffic’s blessing
on this concept too.

On a side note, | saved $3,000 from the Speed & Lauderdale median island project. The contractor should invoice me
this week for that project.

From: Coan, Brandon

Sent: Wednesday, January 31, 2018 12:15 PM
To: glalshOt@aol.com; Kurowsky, Steve M.
Cc: Masterson, Jasmine

Subject: FW: Your Review and possible HELP!

Thanks, Ed and Vickie. I'll investigate and consider. Do you happen to have any Service Request Numbers or street
addresses associated with your past attempts with CM Owen?

Steve - please see below and attached; do these projects ring a bell? Did you prepare cost estimates for Tom Owen at
some point and, if so, can you send them my way (along with any notes about change in pricing)? Thanks very much!

Brandon Coan

Metro Council District 8
(502) 574-1108

601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

Please sign-up to receive important notifications regarding District 8! Our goal is to increase from zero to 8,000 engaged
subscribers by 2019.

From: GOalshOt [mailto:g0alshOt@aol.com]
Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 3:40 PM
To: Coan, Brandon

Subject: Your Review and possible HELP!




Good afternoon. Our neighborhood has a problem | am again asking for the City's help. | asked our previous
representative but he declined to provide any assistance.

The attached pictures provide an overview of the issue we have. We have a small "island" that | care for. | cut the grass,
decorate on holidays (U.S. flags) and even planted the tree you see in the picture when lightning killed the
original. (Again, Tom Owen refused to assist us in replacing it. | bought it and planted it.)

My request, could you please see if you can provide a curb around this island to keep cars and trucks from driving through
it and doing what you see in the pictures. | have repaired this damage (for the 10th+ time) and this will not stop without a

curb!

There is a similar island at the top (up the hill) of Saratoga the city installed. | am asking for the city's help with this eye
sore. If you can only provide "some” financial assistance, | will see if | can get the neighbors to donate some funds to

cover any balance.

The curbs work! You can see from the (additional) pictures how the yards are destroyed from cars parking in the
yards. We paid for the curb in front of our house and other neighbors have done the same. Those with curbs do not have

the problem.

[ do not think the cost for this small project would be significant. Please take a moment to review this request and
PLEASE, call me anytime, at your convenience, to discuss.

Thanks in advance for your consideration.

Ed & Vickie Aulick
2360 Ashwood Dr.
40205
502.322.3935 (C)
502.456.2360 (H)

PLEASE NOTE: Files may too large to send in 1 e-mail. Please check for follow-up e-mails from us.




