Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
s Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Rick Blackwell I

| Amount: $2,250 Date: 10/22/2018 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Two new speed humps and sighage at 7612 and 7817 Nottoway Circle. Total cost is $4500. The
Iroquois Heights Neighborhood Association is partnering to provide half of the costs.

City Agency: Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Greg Dow

Agency Phone: 502.574.3382

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

12 #ALMQM”//& $2,250 10/22/2018
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

- Interagency Name: Public Works & Assets
Program/Project Name: Nottoway Circle Speed Humps :

' Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
- account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of |
the request exclude the matching fund amount? ~ NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they :
- disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? - NA
' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville :
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
- funding source is probably NDF.
- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ~ Yes
?n(ji'ﬂiﬂéﬂce Requifed: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agéﬁémyuéféﬁ{é} than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. - NA
' Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
~estimate and description of cost? | Yes

Submittedby:@m /%’/“WW Date: (’OfU// { §

Revised May 2016



McQuillen, Liz

From: Blackwell, Rick

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 10:23 AM
To: Helton, Jessamyn

Ce: McQuillen, Liz

Subject: CIF Nottoway Circle Signature

Good Morning Jess —

Please note that Liz McQuillen has my permission to sign the NDF for funding of the Nottoway Circle Speed Humps.

Thanks,
Rick



DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND ASSETS
LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY

GREG FISCHER VANESSA D. BURNS
MAYOR Director
TO: Councilman Rick Blackwell

District 12

FROM: Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

DATE: October 16, 2018

RE: Cost of Speed Humps/Signs for Nottoway Circle
SR # 3463428

Two (2) Speed Hump x $2,050.00= $4,100.00
Two (2) Speed Hump sign x $200.00 =  $400.00
Total=  $4,500.00

Please consider this letter as our official Statement of Cost for all speed hump related work.

Each speed hump, including markings is $2,050.00 and each sign is $200.00. Two (2) additional speed
humps have been proposed in the vicinity of addresses 7612 and 7817 and two (2) speed hump signs
will be added. The total “not to exceed” cost is $4,500.00.

Upon funding approval, the speed humps and signage will be installed as schedule and weather
permits.

Please let me know if you have any questions. You may contact me at 574-3882.

Sincerely,

Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

WWW. LOUISVILLEKY.GOV
METRO DEVELOPMENT CENTER 444 SOUTH 5™ STREET SUITE 400 LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY 40202
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McQuillen, Liz

From: Dow, Greg

Sent: Tuesday, October 16, 2018 6:22 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz

Cc: Blackwell, Rick; Tackett, Danielle

Subject: Statement of Cost for Nottoway Circle - Two additional speed Humps and speed hump
signs

Attachments: SOCNottoway Circle_10-16-18.docx; Nottoway Circle Layout_10-16-18.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Liz,

Please see attached statement of cost and layout for Nottoway Circle.

Greg

From: McQuillen, Liz

Sent: Monday, October 15, 2018 10:01 PM

To: Dow, Greg

Cc: Blackwell, Rick

Subject: Fw: Nottoway Circle - Additional Speed Humps

Hello Greg - Please see the note below from Iroquois Heights Neighborhood Assoc. They would like to move
forward with the two speed humps at 7612 and 7818 Nottoway. Could you please prepare the final cost
estimates so that our office can prepare the NDF paperwork for half? IHNA will send in a check for the other
cost.

Thank you!
Liz McQuillen

From: Darlene <fhaydenl@bellsouth.net>

Sent: Monday, October 15, 2018 8:51 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz

Cc: Ray & Lisa Hendrickson

Subject: Re: Nottoway Circle - Additional Speed Humps

Good morning!

The board met today and gave a green light on the speed humps at 7612 and 7818 Nottoway. | am still on the
board and responsible for accounts payable. Please let me know when and where to send the check for our

portion.

As always, thank you for taking such good care of us. Our neighborhood will be safer as a result of these
additions speed humps.



Sincerely,
Darlene Hayden
IHNA Treasurer

Ps. Thank your boss too.

Sent from my iPad

On Oct 2, 2018, at 3:05 PM, Darlene <fhaydenl@bellsouth.net> wrote:

Liz,

I am no longer on the board and I'm also on vacation for a week in Galveston. I'll get to the new
officers on Oct. 15 when we have a turnover meeting. You should hear something after that.

Thank you,
Darlene Hayden

Ps I'll have the new officer contact you.

Sent from my iPad

On Oct 1, 2018, at 3:36 PM, McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Good Afternoon Darlene —

Councilman Blackwell asked me to contact Public Works about installing another
speed hump on the north end of Nottoway Circle around 7610. Attached is the
proposal they provided with 5 possible speed hump locations —the area at 7610
was not wide enough so they proposed 7612 instead.

However, Public Works will not install ONLY the requested speed hump at 7610
because there would be too great of a distance between the existing speed
humps on the south side. They would require that at least one other speed
hump be installed — so the one at 7817 and 7612 or 7612 and the three on the
west side of Nottoway.

Currently, speed humps costs $2050 each and there would need to be one
additional sign, which is $200. If the neighborhood association would like to
move forward with the placements at 7612 and 7817, the IHNA portion would be
$2150 (half of the total cost of $4300).

Please let me know if you have any questions and if you would like to proceed.

2



Thank you,
Liz McQuillen

<image003.png>Liz McQuillen  Legislative Aide

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, KY 40202
S(502) 574-1112 . (502) 574-3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is
intended solely for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are
not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or
taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and
may be unlawful.

<2018 October IHNA Proposal.pdf>



