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CIF061621PW22

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
m Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Robin J. Engel District 22

[ Amount: $6,824.28 Date: 6/4/2021

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Windgate Meadows 17 Sidewalk Panel Repairs. District 22 is utilizing $6,824.28 from CIF to fund
Public Work's repair of 17 sidewalk panel repairs that are 3-5's in the Windgate Meadows
Subdivision. The goal is to restore safety for residents needing ADA complaint sidewalks.

Address: Windgate Dr: 7802, 7804, 7812, 7821, 7901, 7907, 7909, 7912, 7913, 7916, 7917, 7919,
7920., 7600 Hornbeck Dr. 7909 Niemann Dr., 11201 Meadow Breeze, 11410 Windhaven Way

City Agency: |ouisville Public Works & Assests Department
Contact Person: craig Allen, PE Sidewalk Engineer

Agency Phone: (502) 574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

22 E] Councilma&bi%&g $6,824.28 6/4/2021

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF061621PW22 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works & Assests/ Windgate Meadows 17 Sidewalk Panel Repairs

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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- Interagency Name: Public Works & Assests

Program/Project Name: Windgate Meadows 17 Sidewalk Panel Repairs

' o - ' ‘ Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) —
Appropriating Funding? Yes he
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with —
account numbers in the request form description? No e
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of _
the request exclude the matching fund amount? No b
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they ‘
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA E]
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes :,]
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful ‘
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes 3
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No 3
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? _
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No 3
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid k
estimate and description of cost? Yes 3
Submitted by: LA Jared Townes District 22 Date:  6/4/2021

Revised May 2016




Townes, Jared M.

[ M
From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 1:09 PM

To: Townes, Jared M.

Cc: Engel, Robin

Subject: RE: District 22 Sidewalk Repair Estimate

Jared,

Yes, Public Works will receive the funds for these repairs.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, PE

Engineer i

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
craig.allen@louisvilleky.gov

(502) 574 6159

From: Townes, Jared M. <Jared. Townes@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 10:57 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: District 22 Sidewalk Repair Estimate

Craig,
Councilman Engel has told me to go ahead and prepare a CIF to utilize District 22 funds to repair the sidewalks you have
quoted for our office below. Can | get your confirmation that Public Works will accept the CIF transfer from the District

22 office to repair these sidewalks in the Windgate Meadows Subdivision?

Thank you for your help on this matter.

Regards,

Jard M. Townes

Legislative Assistant to

Councilman Robin Engel

District 22

Louisville Metro Council

City Hall — 2™ Floor

601 W. Jefferson St.

Louisville, KY 40202

Phone: (502) 574-3467

Email: jared.townes@louisvilleky.gov




From: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, June 1, 2021 8:27 AM

To: Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Townes, Jared M. <Jared. Townes@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: District 22 Sidewalk Repair Estimate

Councilman Engel,

The estimated repair cost of the sidewalks listed below is $6,824.28. These are the 19 addresses for which you
requested inspections. Please note that two of the addresses have 0 ratings and so no repairs are needed at those
addresses right now. )
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Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5% Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202
craig.allen@louisvilieky.gov

{502)574-6159





