
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

^ Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)
D Municipal Aid Program (MAP]_^ LZ^3«jM.

Primary Sponsor: Councilman Glen Stuckel, District 17

Amount: $123,000.00

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of projecVprogram and any external grantee(s):

These funds would go towards resurfacing two roads in District 17: Blossom Lane (from
Langdon Drive to Hurstbourne Parkway) and Nansemond Drive (from Murphy Lane to
Pacelli Place).

Location: Blossom Lane and Nansemond Drive

City Agency: Public Works and Assets

Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 574-6789
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I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose,

^\. 0011_ G^^-^^Q ^\23,W
District # Council Member SignSfifre Amount Date

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Date

Revised July 2013
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NDF OR GIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
..l[nterag^cLNameL..^.^JZ^^^^__^^
LJPl^"n^ertNa^.^<r^^

Yes/No/NA

-^ZA__..Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding?
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description? | ^/ /

I Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
I fund amount? V/A
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in I
the request form description? I

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building
Lorequipn^lJfnot!j^j?^n^^ "I v&s
Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
not, the fund ing source is probably NDF. ---------^-.. Y^^
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000?

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

v/A

A/0

Prepared by: -f^,'[^cfe^ Dale: -7/1.3,^

Effective October 2013



Eatherly, Kip
From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Metcalfe, Andrew
Wednesday, July 23, 2014 2:23 PM
Eatherly, Kip
RE: resurfacing

Kip,
You are correct.

Street From To Cost
Nansemond Drive Murphy Lane Pacelli Place $33,000.00
Blossom Lane Hurstbourne Ln Langdon $90,000.00

Thanks,
Andrew

From: Eatherly, Kip
Sent: Wednesday, July 23, 2014 11:02 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew
Subject: resurfacing

Andrew,

I believe we have talked before about some possible resurfacing projects in District 17. Specifically, Nansemond Drive
(from Murphy Lane to Pacelli Place) and Blossom Lane (from Langdon Drive to Hurstbourne Parkway) were the two
projects you suggested based on the their ratings. These projects would cost $33,000 and $90,000 respectively if I
remember correctly. Would you please confirm this information is correct?

Thank you for all your help.

Kip Eatherly
Legislative Aide, Metro Council District 17
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202
Office: 502-574-3462
Fax: 502-574-4501



Smith, Chanelle Emily

From:
Sent:

To:
Cc:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Kennedy, Liz
Wednesday, July 23, 2014 3:16 PM
Eatherly, Kip; Blackwell, Rick
Smith, Chanelle Emily
RE: request

Follow up
Flagged

Good Afternoon Kip -

spoke with CM Blackwell and he has agreed to allow this item to be placed onto the next appropriations agenda.

Thank you,
Liz

From: Eatherly, Kip
Sent: Wednesday, July 23, 2014 11:33 AM
To: Blackwell, Rick
Cc: Kennedy, Liz
Subject: request

Councilman Blackwell,

We have a CIF request we were hoping to get working on involving resurfacing two of the lowest-rated roads in our
district. Would it be at all possible to include this on the upcoming Appropriations agenda? I am sorry to ask and .
much appreciate your consideration.

Kip Eatherly
Legislative Aide, Metro Council District 17
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202
Office: 502-574-3462
Fax:502-574-4501



Smith, Chanelle Emil

From:

Sent:

To:
Cc:
Subject:

Eatherly, Kip
Monday, August 04, 2014 3:48 PM
Smith, Chanelle Emily
Stenberg, Beth
FW: GIF

Will this do?

Kip Eatheriy
Legislative Aide, Metro Council District 17
601 West fefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202
Office: 502-574-3462
Fax: 502-574-4501

From: Glen E. Stuckel [mailto:gestuckel@)aoLdCom]
Sent: Monday, August 04, 2014 3:39 PM
To: Eatherly, Kip
Subject: Re: CIF

LherebLauthorize my Le9islative Assistant, Kip Eatherly to sign the GIF request for
$123,000 for road resurfacing in District 17. Glen E Stuckel, 17th District Louisville metro
Council

--Original Message--
From: Eatherly, Kip <KJp.Eatherlv(a)louisvillekv.aov>
To: Glen Stuckel <flestuckel(a)aol.com>
Sent: Man, Aug 4, 2014 2:34 pm
Subject: GIF

^;^ re-caJ'-^!J^.ave ^.91F,for resurfacin9 two roads in our district for a total of $123,000. The only thing we are
lacking is your signature. Would you give me permission to sign that specific request on your behalf?
Kip Eatherly
Legislative Aide, Metro Council District 17
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202
Office: 502-574-3462
Fax: 502-574-4501


