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CIF102021MP23

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
s Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: James Peden |

| Amount: $35,730 Date: 10-4-21 [

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funds will be used to selectively clear the northeast corner of Highview Park at Briscoe Lane and
Vaughn Mill Road. This will open it up and allow for this area to accessed. The trees will remain
but underbrush will be removed opening this section of the park up for visitors to enjoy.

City Agency: |ouisville Parks and Recreation

Agency Phone: 574.6086

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

23 gby $35,730 10-4-21
District # buncil Member Slgnature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF102021MP23 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Louisville Parks and Recreation/Highview Park Selective Clearning

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Lousiville Parks and Recreation |

Program/Project Name: Highview Park Selective Clearing

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) —
Appropriating Funding? Yes |~
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with —
account numbers in the request form description? NA M
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of _
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA v
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they .
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA M

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

KE

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes —v—
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than _
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No |~
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? -
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No M
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid —
estimate and description of cost? Yes s
Submitted by: Dol | c?/(j/é& Date: (¢ ~S%—Z/
7 e -

Revised May 2016



Torsg, John N

From: Canuel, Jason T

Sent: Monday, October 4, 2021 2:30 PM
To: Torsky, John N

Subject: RE: Highview Park selective clearing

Yes, Parks will accept the funding for the selective clearing project in Highview Park.

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Louicville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell}
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov

» LOUISVILLE
| PARKS

AND RECREATION

From: Torsky, John N <John.Torsky@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 4, 2021 2:26 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Highview Park selective clearing

Mr. Canuel,

Councilman Peden would like to move forward with using CIF to fund the clearing of both parts provided in the
estimate. Will Metro Parks accept $35,730 from District 23 CIF for this project?

Thank you,
John Torsky

From: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 4, 2021 12:36 PM
To: Peden, James <James.Peden@louisvilleky.gov>; Torsky, John N <John.Torsky@louisvilieky.gov>

Subject: RE: Highview Park selective clearing

Part 1 is clearing from the woodland edge for about 100 feet into the woods. Part 2 was clearing the rest of the entire

wooded area.

Jason T. Canuel

hssistant Director

Louisvilie Parks and Recrealion
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)




502/439.7694 {cell}
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov

LOUISVILLE
PARKS

AND RECREATION

Erom: Torsky, John N <John.Torsky@louisvilleky.gov> On Behalf Of Peden, James
Sent: Monday, October 4, 2021 10:31 AM

To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Highview Park selective clearing

Hey Jason thanks for getting this estimate. What section is part 1 and what is part 2?

John

From: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, September 29, 2021 8:49 AM
To: Peden, James <James.Peden@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Torsky, John N <John.Torsky@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: Highview Park selective clearing

| have attached the quote | received from our tree clearing contractor. Call me when you get a chance to talk.

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Loulsville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 {(cell)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov

LOUISVILLE
PARKS

AND RECREATION

From: Mark Cain <markc@bobrayco.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 28, 2021 12:26 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: T Ray <t.ray@bobrayco.com>

Subject: RE: Highview Park selective clearing

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Jason,

Proposal attached. If you have any questions please give me a call.
2




Thank You,

Mark Cain

Bob Ray Company
723 Lyndon Lane
Louisville, Ky 40222
(502)773-0807

www.BobRayCo.com

From: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2021 2:43 PM

To: Mark Cain <markc@bobrayco.com>

Cc: T Ray <t.ray@bobrayco.com>; Chandra Kost <ckost@bobrayco.com>

Subject: RE: Highview Park selective clearing

Can you make it Thursday at 2?

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Louisville Parks and Recrsation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell)
jason.canuei@louisvilleky.gov

m, LOUISVILLE
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From: Mark Cain <markc@bobrayco.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2021 2:38 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: T Ray <t.ray@bobrayco.com>; Chandra Kost <ckost@bobrayco.com>

Subject: RE: Highview Park selective clearing

3




CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Jason,

| can meet with you Tomorrow anytime, Thursday afternoon or Friday Morning. Let me know what works for you.

Thank you,

From: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2021 12:58 PM

To: Mark Cain <markc@bobrayco.com>

Cc: T Ray <t.ray@bobrayco.com>; Chandra Kost <ckost@bobrayco.com>
Subject: Highview Park selective clearing

Is there any way we might be able to meet at Highview Park to look at a selective clearing project? Ata minimum, we
are looking at clearing dead trees and underbrush (to open things up and make more visible/usable} about 100-feet or
so into the wooded area. | am estimating that area to be about 3 acres +/- as shown on the attached aerial image. The
councilman in this area would also like to know a price to do the same for the rest of the wooded area (approximately
8.5). The total area for the entire area is right about 11.5 acres.

The St. Anthony Church Road proposal you sent a few weeks ago looks good. | am waiting on the cemetery plan to be
approved and get access to the funds to begin. We should be able to get that project started early in the winter.

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Loulsville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell}
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov

LOUISVILLE
PARKS

AND RECREATION

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
undawful. :




‘ Bob Ray Company, Une.

“No Job Too Small, N o Tree Too Tall”

Cerﬁﬁed Arborist

Customer Name: Louisville Parks & Recreation Date:9/27/2021
Contact: Jason Canuel Ph:_502.574.6086 Cell 502.439.7694 Fax:
Address: PQ Box 37280 City: Lowsville State: KY = 7ap:40233

- Specification for Contract (or) Proposal -
Project Name: Highview Park Selective Thinning | Location: 7201 Outer Loop, Lowsville, Ky 40228
Acknowledge Addendum(s): Prevailing Wage: lyes I No
Scope of Work:

Selective Thinning/Deadwood Removal Area 1 - Approximately +/- 3 Acres

o Forestry Mow undesirable Trees & Brush approximately 8” DBIT and smaller within Area 1. All mulched

material 1o be lelt scattered in place onsite.
o Cut & Remove undesirable Dead/Declining Trees. Stumps to be lell cut approximately 1 foot above

ground level. ITaul material offsite for disposal.
Mobilization & Clearing Total Area 1 - §70,455.00

Selective Thinning/Deadwood Removal Area 2 - Approximately +/- 8.5 Acres

o Forestry Mow undesirable Trees & Brush approximately 8” DBIT and smaller within Area 1. All mulched

material to be left scattered in place onsite.
o  Cut & Remove undesirable Dead/Declining Trees. Stumps to be left cut approximately Hoot above
ground level. Haul material offsite for disposal.

Mobilization & Clearing Total Area 2 - §24,295.00

Proposal Notes / Clarification

Additional mobilizavion charge(s) - $775.00 (If GC or Owner request clearing to be performed in multiple section/stages in lieu
of one complete process, then the additional charge listed will be added per occurrence.)

Additional Clearing -~ Any clearing requested outside of the “Scope” described above will need to be review by project manager
and an additional amount to be agreed upon by both parties belore work is completed.

Exclusions: Lavout, Restoration, 1'rash Debris Removal, Permits, Temporary Stream/Creek Crossmg,
Construction signs, Pavement Damage/Failures, Fence removal/replacement, T'raflic/Pedestrian Control.

We propose herby to furnish material, labor and equipment complete in accordance with contract specifications for the sum of-

Please Review Scope of Work For Pn_g_t_),g: Acceptance of Proposal - The above price, clarilications and conditions

are satislactory and are hereby accepted. You are authorized to do the work as specified. If proposal is not accepled in 45 days’

price may he subject to change.

Representative’s Signature Pk dm Date_9/27/2021

Customer’s Signature Date

723 Lyndon Lane ¢ Louisville, KY ¢ Phone: 502.425.7654  Fax: 502.425.7657













