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NDF022322PW15A

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
s Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponser: Kevin Triplett |

| Amount: $2,512.80 Date: February 2, 2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
District 15 will add (4) type A 150 W eq LED Cobra street lights. These lights will be placed on
streetlights on Longfield Ave. 4 lights at $10.47/month x 60 months equals $2,512.80.
The lease agreement is with LG&E.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
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Request Amount: Amended Amount:
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Budget Revision #:
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Interagency Name: Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

LED Cobra Streetlights on Longfield Ave

account numbers in the request form description?

- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes
NA

NA

NA
NA

NA
No
No

Yes

Submitted by:

shughes

Date: Jan 26, 2022

Revised May 2016



D 15 Longfield Ave Street lights

4 lights @ $10

47/month x 60 months
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Hughes, Susan

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Wednesday, February 2, 2022 12:43 PM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: FW: Street Lights

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, October 1, 2021 12:46 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Lights

Public Works will accept the NDF funds for this street light lease

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Paniel Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, October 1, 2021 11:33 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <leffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Street Lights

Good morning Mr. Brown!
Our District 15 wants to proceed with this street light plan for Longfield Ave. Will you accept the $2,512.807

Also, you stated this is a NDF sent to Public Works right?

From: Brown, leffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, September 29, 2021 7:55 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel. Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Lights

Here’s a plan. | showed the location of the existing lights and the proposed locations as stars on the attached map. Let
me know if you have any questions.

Jeffrey Brown, PE



Harward, Sonya

s i T S T
From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Monday, February 7, 2022 9:13 AM
To: Harward, Sonya
Subject: RE: NDF from D-15

Yes, the funds will go to LGE but we only pay one month at a time

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, February 7, 2022 9:10 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: NDF from D-15

Jeff,
For the attached NDF, will the funds go to LG&E for the leasing of the lights?

Thanks,
Sonya

SonyYa Harwaro

601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-2704 (direct)
(502)574-3902 (ofc)
(502)500-5440 (cell)





