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CIS02032mMPRep

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
& Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Stuart Benson ]
7
| Amount: & “H2. 57, . 0B  Date: 1/7/21 ]
=y =

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Additional funding needed for the Charlie Vettiner Park Improvements including Euslt not limited to
pickieball courts, parking lot and access road improvements. An additional gb  £97eing
requested via an ordinance being heard in Budget Committee through Republican remaining
pooled funds. $180,000 was included in the FY21 capital budget (168610).

City Agency: Parks and Recreation

Contact Person: j550n Canuel

Agency Phone: 50 574-6086

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

20 [+] ¢ 1/7/2021
District # Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016

Page 1




Department/Project:
Charlie Vettiner Park Improvements

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount

District 1 Republican Caucus $42,826.08
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~_ NDF,CIF,MAP OR PAY INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name Metro Parks

- Program/Project Name: Charlie Vettiner Park Improvements

' ~ Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

- Appropriating Funding? ~ Yes B
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with .
- account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
- the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA B

- Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
- disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? . Yes

| Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

 life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes B
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than _
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA [ﬂ
;Ordinéncé Required: Is the réquest a transfer from NDF to cost center? | - ‘

~If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA B
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid -
~ estimate and description of cost? Yes B

Submitted by: Date:

Revised May 2016
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Dearing, Connie M.

From: Bell, LaTonya J.

Sent: Wednesday, February 3, 2021 2:27 PM

To: Harward, Sonya; Dearing, Connie M.; Franklin-Gray, Lisa A.
Subject: FW: Appropriations Item #14 CIF020321MPREP

Please add this email approval to item# #14 CIF020321MPREP packet. Thanks.

From: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, February 3, 2021 2:25 PM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Appropriations Item #14 CIF020321MPREP

From: Smith, Chanelle Emily <Chanelle.Smith@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, February 3, 2021 1:49 PM

To: MetroCouncilClerk <MetroCouncilClerk@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Blackwell, Rick <Rick.Blackwell@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Fox,
Mark H. <Mark.Fox@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Franklin-Gray, Lisa A. <Lisa.FranklinGray@Iouisvilleky.gov>;
McQuillen, Liz <Liz.McQuillen@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Alexander@|ouisvilleky.gov>;
Piagentini, Anthony B. <Anthony.Piagentini@I|ouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Appropriations Item #14 CIF020321MPREP

Good Afternoon,

Councilman Piagentini approves CIF020321MPREP and the changes it entails regarding the republican reallocation of
pooled funds.

Thank you and have a wonderful day.

Chanelle Smith | Legislotive Assistant

Office of Councilman Anthony Piagentini

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202

p: (502) 574-3464 p: (502) 574-1113 f: (502) 574-4501

GET SOCIAL : Please make sure to stay connected with the District 19 office via our E:Newsletter and social
media accounts. This link will take you to our website to sign up! Louisvilleky.gov/district19




Harward, Sonxa

From: Canuel, Jason T

Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 1:45 PM

To: Stenberg, Beth; Piagentini, Anthony B.

Cc: Haag, Steve; Bell, LaTonya J.; Smith, Chanelle Emily; Webster, Angela; Harward, Sonya;
Franklin-Gray, Lisa A.

Subject: RE: CIF for Charlie Vettiner

Yes, Parks will gladly accept funding for the Charlie Vettiner Park improvement project.

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Louisville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov

LOUISVILLE

PARKS
AND RECREATION

From: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 12:37 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>; Piagentini, Anthony B. <Anthony.Piagentini@louisviileky.gov>

Cc: Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Beli2@louisvilleky.gov>; Smith, Chanelle Emily
<Chanelle.Smith@louisvilleky.gov>; Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
<Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>; Franklin-Gray, Lisa A. <Lisa.FranklinGray@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: CIF for Charlie Vettiner

Jason, in reviewing the attached CIF, LaTonya has mentioned we do not an email from you stating you would accept the
additional funds for the Vettiner Park Improvements. Please confirm.

CM Piagentini, it would also complete the documentation if there was an email from you confirming the use of the
republican pool CIF for this project. You are a sponsor on the ordinance moving other republican pool funds to this
account, but we also need the acknowledgement for this document.

We need these today we at all possible.

Thank you,

Beth




Harward, Sonza

From: Stenberg, Beth

Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 4:06 PM

To: Webster, Angela; Benson, Stuart; Canuel, Jason T; Haag, Steve; Harward, Sonya
Cc: Bell, LaTonya J.

Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

And just to clarify, this is coming from the Republican pooled CIF, not D20 CIF... so the end of the CIF would be
CiFxxxxxxPWRep, not CIFxxxxxxPW20...

From: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 3:52 PM

To: Benson, Stuart <Stuart.Benson@louisvilleky.gov>; Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Canuel, Jason T
<Jason.Canuel@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
<Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Hello all,

Here is the updated information after making corrections.

Jason,

I am uploading documentation in Granicus this afternoon. An additional $42,826.08 will be transferred to Metro Parks
for the additional funding needed to convert the old tennis courts into pickle ball courts, the parking lot and access road.

Please see attached.

Angela Webster

From: Benson, Stuart <Stuart.Benson@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 3:48 PM
To: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>; Canuel,

Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
<Sonya.Harward @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Hello all,

Sonya has been gracious enough to agree to upload and enter my information into granicus since | no longer have access
after the laptop upgrades (working on getting that fixed). Be on the lookout for the corrected legislation.

Angela Webster
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From: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 19, 2021 3:48:17 PM

To: Webster, Angela <Angela. Webster@louisvilleky.gov>; Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve
<Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2 @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Angela, | sent you the wrong version of the CIF request. The CIF request at the top of page 1 should only be for
$42,826.08 (and that is the amount listed on page 3 under D20, but there is a different amount on the signature line on
page 1 -567,358.98) not $110,185.06 . The amount on the signature line should be changed as well.

The description should say there is $80,522.53 coming from the ordinance being heard in Budget Committee, not
$13,814.94. The total being added to the $180K in the FY21 budget is $123,348.61, including the $42,826.08 from CIF. |
switched gears on what was in the ordinance versus the CIF request and sent you the wrong one. Please change on the
CIF request before sending it on. | am SOOOQ sorry!! Too many moving parts on this one!

From: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 19, 2021 3:26 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

He

From: Webster, Angela

Sent: Monday, January 4, 2021 11:39 AM

To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Guys,

Just a follow up on our conversation. We are ready to move forward with rehabbing the older tennis courts to pickie
ball courts.

We already have $180,000+/- in the capital budget for Vettiner plus the $58,000 we will be putting in the budget for this
project in the upcoming weeks.

Angela Webster

From: Webster, Angela

Sent: Tuesday, December 1, 2020 4:49 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Thank you




Angela Webster
Legislative Assistant to
Councilman Stuart Benson
District 20

Louisville Metro Council
City Hall - 2" Floor

601 W. Jefferson St.
Louisville, KY 40202
Phone: (502) 574-3465

Click HERE to sign up for the District 20 E-News

From: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, December 1, 2020 4:30 PM

To: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

I have one of my engineers working on a cost for the tennis court conversions as well as the access road to get to the old
courts. | should have something to share with you in the next week or so.

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Louisville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov

LOUISVILLE
| PARKS

AND RECREATION

From: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, December 1, 2020 4:22 PM

To: Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@lIouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@I[ouisvilieky.gov>
Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Jason,

See below. What kind of monies will we need for this project?




Angela Webster
Legislative Assistant to
Councilman Stuart Benson
District 20

Louisville Metro Council
City Hall - 2™ Floor

601 W. Jefferson St.
Louisville, KY 40202
Phone: (502) 574-3465

Click HERE to sign up for the District 20 E-News

From: Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, December 1, 2020 3:51 PM

To: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Can you check in on this and see where things are on $55. We might have some pooled funds available and if
needed/helpful we might be able to ge them dedicated so that the plan can be the best it can now vs. adding to the

project at a later FY cycle.

From: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 9, 2020 2:54 PM

To: Canuel, Jason T <jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Townes, Jared M. <Jared.Townes@louisvilleky.gov>; Harrington, Scott <Scott. Harrington@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Thanks for the update.

From: Canuel, Jason T
Sent: Friday, October 9, 2020 2:53 PM

To: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>; Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Townes, Jared M. <jJared.Townes@louisvilleky.gov>; Harrington, Scott <Scott.Harrington @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

We are working on a backlog of capital projects in design right now. We will get to Vettiner as soon as we possibly can. |
am thinking we can get through design and permitting this Fall/Winter and get to late Spring/Summer construction.

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Louisville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov
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From: Webster, Angela <Angela.Webster@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 9, 2020 12:15 PM

To: Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov>; Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Townes, Jared M. <Jared. Townes@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Harrington, Scott <Scott.Harrington@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Charlie Vettiner Old Courts

Haven’t heard anything new since our summer discussion. Let’s ask Jason.

Sent from my iPhone, please excuse any typos.

On Oct 9, 2020, at 11:58 AM, Haag, Steve <Steve.Haag@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Have we heard anything on the redo of the Charlie Vettiner Courts that we funded in the budget? Just
curious what timeline / next steps / updated cost estimates are for the the project and kept forgetting
to ask.
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