MB

CIF101922PW15A
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett ‘
| Amount: $12,512.18 Date: Sep 22, 2022 B

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Driver Feed Back signs for Anna Lane and Warren Ave in District 15.

CIF AMOUT -$12, 512.18
ACCOUNT: 8102 410 8210 148613 899998-Capital Budget D-15 $5,000

The total cost for this project is $17,512.18.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502-574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Ciouncjl Member §1‘gna\‘dre Amount Date
Approved by: /

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF101922PWI15A To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
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Department/Project: ~ Public Works
Driver Feed Back Signs Anna and Warren

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Driver Feed Back Signs On Anna Lane and Warren Ave

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? No
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? No
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5.000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so. is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? —NA— No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: shughes Date: Sep 22, 20g¢

Revised May 2016
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Hughes, Susan

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 10:10 AM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: FW: Driver Feed Back Signs

The account number for the $5,000 submitted for the budget is 8102 410 8210 148613 899998.

CIF for $12,512.18

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, September 1, 2022 2:28 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Netherton, Emily <Emily.Netherion@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus,
Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Driver Feed Back Signs

Yes, Public Works will accept these funds.

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, September 1, 2022 2:28 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <leffrey Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Netherton, Emily <Emily.Netherton@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus,
Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Driver Feed Back Signs

Thank you Sir! Will you accept the funds?

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@iouisvilieky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, September 1, 2022 2:25 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Netherton, Emily <Emily.Netherton@louisvilleky.gov>; Grothaus,
Seth T <Seth.Grothaus@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Driver Feed Back Signs

Dan,
The cost to install (4) driver feedback signs is $17,512.18.
Thanks,

Stuart

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2022 9:23 AM
To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilleky.gov>




Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Driver Feed Back Signs

Good morning Stuart!
Our District 15 office would like to purchase and have installed two additional sets of Driver Feed Back Signs for the
following locations:

1.) Anna Lane in Cloverleaf between Fluhr Drive & Estate Drive.
2.) Warren Ave in the Oakdale neighborhood, with those locations to be determined.





