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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
2 Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander |

| Amount: $1,500 Date: October 24, 2017 |

Description of program/project including publiec purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Metro Public Works (MPW) for 125' of new asphalt curbing along S. Jane Street.

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Matthew Haines

Agency Phone: 502.574.3883

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

9 @ - CL W/\’ $1,500.00 10/24/2017

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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~ NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
- Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Réqhired: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

- Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

S. Jane Street New Curbing

Yes/No/NA

Yes
NA

NA

NA
Yes

Yes
No
No

Yes

Submitted by: ! é/@ dg/

Date: [6/2‘:” [7

Revised May 2016



Ethridge, Kyle

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Monday, October 9, 2017 4:21 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle; Vince Guenthner

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Brown, Jeffrey E; Deering-Smith, Kelly
Subject: RE: S. Jane Asphalt Curb Repair

Attachments: FW: S Jane St. Curb

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Please see my comments below in red.

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5" Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Monday, October 9, 2017 1:36 PM

To: Vince Guenthner; Haines, Matthew R

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Brown, Jeffrey E; Deering-Smith, Kelly
Subject: RE: S. Jane Asphalt Curb Repair

Great, thanks Vince.

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood news and
alerts!

From: Vince Guenthner [mailto:vguenthner@Iwcky.com]
Sent: Monday, October 9, 2017 1:36 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle; Haines, Matthew R

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Brown, Jeffrey E; Deering-Smith, Kelly
Subject: RE: S. Jane Asphalt Curb Repair

I'll find out where we stand on this restoration and get back with you.
Thanks,

Vince Guenthner

From: Ethridge, Kyle [mailto:Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov]
Sent: Monday, October 09, 2017 12:05 PM




To: Vince Guenthner <yguenthner@Ilwcky.com>; Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Kelley
Dearing-Smith <ksmith@iwcky.com>

Subject: S. Jane Asphalt Curb Repair

Good Afternoon Vince and Matt.

We were recently contacted by Mr. John Pacyga, 219 S. Jane Street, as a follow-up to concerns in April 2017 regarding
LWC roadwork that damaged the asphalt curb on S. Jane Street. Our office understands that LWC agreed to make
repairs to the damages that were from the contractor equipment and work along the roadway. Mr. Pacyga has measured
that to be a total of 89". Mr. Pacyga is also interested in having the remaining 125’ repaired by Louisville Metro, ideally
he'd like both projects to be coordinated at the same time. Mr. Pacyga stressed to us that they are only interested in
having a 3" replacement curb.

We have a couple questions.

1. Where is LWC on this request? Has the damaged area been identified by LWC?

2. Can LWC send funds to MPW so all repairs can be done at the same time? s that current policy for repairs by
utility companies?

3. Can MPW look at the remaining-425_and provide us with a cost estimatafizr a replacement 3’ asphalt curb? My
costs for asphalt apron curb at{$12/lf soc $1500.00 if this truly is only 125 feet,)However, | want to caution you that
3 inches of asphalt apron curb may not be sufficient and water will likely go over the curb at times.

4. Does MPW have any funding available to help in partnership with our office for curb repairs, not related to LWC’s
responsibility? We can probably help out {assuming that $1,500.00 is all it will cost) however, | would like to stress
to you that this was a LWC project and had nothing to do with Metro Public Works. This roadway is not on our list

for repaving in FY18. 1 am not sure what has transpired during the water company work but | have spoken with
John as well, had an inspector review the area and sent the attached message in late August.

Mr. Pacyga and neighbors are happy to meet onsite, if necessary. Mr. Pacyga has also taken photos of the damage and
can provide information on his measurements if necessary.

Thanks so much,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood news and
alerts!

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful,



