Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

O Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
O Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

[0 Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: BRENT ACKERSON

l Amount: $27,000.00 Date: 02/23/2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Paving of Breaux Drive from end of Urban Services District to dead end of
cul-de-sac. (Kort Springs, Section 2-C; 3317 - 3332 Breaux Drive). Account #
8126-410-8105-148947-822826

City Agency:  Public Works
Contact Person: Andrew Metcalf

Agency Phone: 502-574-6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a public purpose.
26 FL\ $27,000.00 02/23/2016

District # Cotncil Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015




CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

. Interagency Name: PUBLIC WORKS

Program/Project Name:  BREAUX DRIVE PAVING (KORT SPRINGS SECTION 2-C)

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
- Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: |If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Requést Form: If matching funds are to be used‘, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
- disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
- own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is NA
probably NDF. :
Funding Source: If CIF is bbe‘ing requested, does the project have a useful
 life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a MefrdAgency greater than
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Requiredi Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
Supborting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost? Yes
Date: 0212312018

Prepared by: JEFF NOBLE

Effective July 2015




Noble, Jeffrey T

From: Noble, Jeffrey T

Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2016 3:27 PM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T

Subject: FW: Kort Springs, Section 2-C; 3317 - 3332 Breaux Drive; Source: Jefferson County

Building Department

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2015 11:21 AM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T; Brown, Jeffrey E; Edwin Chestnut

Cc: judy.russlawhorn@yahoo.com; Twc. com

Subject: RE: Kort Springs, Section 2-C; 3317 - 3332 Breaux Drive; Source: Jefferson County Building Department

Jeff,

There has and the cost is $27,000.
Thanks,

Andrew

From: Noble, Jeffrey T

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2015 10:29 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E; Edwin Chestnut

Cc: judy.russlawhorn@yahoo.com; Twc. com; Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: RE: Kort Springs, Section 2-C; 3317 - 3332 Breaux Drive; Source: Jefferson County Building Department

Jeff, Andrew —

Has there been an estimate for paving for the section of Breaux Drive beginning at 3317 up through the dead-end (the
part not in the Urban Services District)? If not, Councilman Ackerson is requesting one please.

Thank you.

8 Jeff

Jeff T. Noble

Legislative Assistant to

26th District Councilman Brent T. Ackerson
601 W. Jefferson Street, Third Floor
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

502-574-1126




