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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Brandon Coan |

, Amount: $4,500 Date: 7.23.19 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
$4,500 to Public Works for the installation of two speed humps and two speed hump signs on
Lakeside Drive between Bardstown Road and Trevilian Way.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Greg Dow

Agency Phone: 574 3882

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

g / $4,500 Jul 23, 2019
District # Wcil Member Sipwature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works/ Lakeside Drive Speed Humps

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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__ NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Public Works | |

Program/Project Name: Lakeside Drive Speed Humps

» Yes/No/NA
Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested. does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.  Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
 Ordinance Réquired: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? ~ NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: Jasmine Weatherby Date: Jul 23,2019

Revised May 2016







DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND ASSETS
LOVISVILLE KENTUCKY

GREG FISCHER VANESSA D. BURNS

MAYUR Divoctor
TO: Councilman Brandon Coan
District 8
FROM: Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering
DATE: July 22, 2019
RE: Cost of Speed Humps for Lakeside Drive

Two (2) Speed Humps x $2,050.00 =  $4,100.00
Two (2) Speed Hump signs x $200.00 =  $4060.00
Total=  $4,500.00

Please consider this letter as our official Statement of Cost for all speed hump related work.

Each speed hump, including markings is $2,050.00 and each sign is $200.00. Based on our
Engineering Studies, a total of two (2) speed humps and two (2) speed hump signs have been proposed
for Lakeside Drive, between Bardstown Road and Trevilian Way. The total “not to exceed” cost is

$4,500.00.

Upon funding approval, the speed humps will be installed as schedule and weather permits,

Please let me know if you have any questions. You may contact me at 574-3882.

Sincerely, —
ii(&vww'w%,b)m\m«w; (% &*\x W\M‘W

"

%regory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

WY LDUISVILLERY.GOV
METRO DEVELOPMENT CENTER 444 SOUTH Y7 STREET SUITE 400 LOUIRVILLE, KENTLORY 4662
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Weatherby, Jasmine

From: Dow, Greg

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2019 3:26 PM

To: Weatherby, Jasmine

Cc: Coan, Brandon; Johnson, Pat W; Sparks, Stuart; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: Statement of Cost and speed hump/signage layout
Attachments: SOC-layout Lakeside Drive_7-22-19.pdf

Jasmine,

At your convenience, please initiate the transfer of funds. I've attached a statement of cost for you.

Greg

From: Weatherby, Jasmine
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2019 11:26 AM

To: Johnson, Pat W; Dow, Greg; Coan, Brandon
Subject: FW: Lakeside speed bump signatures

Hi Pat and Greg,

Here are the signatures for Lakeside Drive. Please let me know when | should initiate the transfer of funds and what the
total is.

Thank you

Jasmine Weatherby (she/her/hers)
Legislative Aide

Councilman Brandon Coan

District 8

601 West Jefferson St

Louisville, KY 40202

Email: jasmine.weatherby@Iouisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1108

Help your friends and neighbors stay informed! Share this link to spread the joy of District 8 eNews.

From: JEREMY BAUER <peyla52 @gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, July 21, 2019 8:25 PM

To: Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine.Weatherby@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Coan, Brandon <Brandon.Coan@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Lakeside speed bump signatures

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Jasmine,




Ok | got all the issues with the signatures clarified/re-signed:

As mentioned before in the previous email, 2109 and 2111 are the same property, Bonnie Brown is the landlord and she
singed on 2109 line. You can ignore the signature for 2111, it is the renter.

2119 - | went back over and got Cathy to sign.

2121- Leah said her and her Mom should now be listed as owners for that property, but just incase we got the mom to
sign as well (Karen Grant)

2144, Jess was the previous owner, they moved to NOLA last year and Matt is the new owner - so we are good to go for
that one as well.

| also picked up another signature from 2152, they had been of town. That puts us as 87.5% so we should be even more
good to go.

Thank you very much for helping Jasmine, | truly appreciate your time and attention. Trust me this will make a huge
difference for all of our lives on this neighborhood street - we have all been going through a bit of madness. There are a
lot of children on this street now, and I'd say from talking to the neighbors that at least 75% of us have had our cars
damaged at some point fairly recently, it was the topic that came up most after child safety concern honestly. I'm sure
in time | could get 100% - | met no opposition and everyone was very thankful of my efforts and honestly overjoyed that
action is being taken. |let everyone know it was our Councilman that is going to bat for us.

Much thanks,
Jeremy




