Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

I]/Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
N Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

O Paving Fund (PAV)

[Peimary Sponsor: (T o1 I3CYsAF Fanad [Ro~— ]

I Amount: i §€7. 5°) Date: a’? S///é

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

T Yoo ) oanl ad V“uat ran VSl
Co urian ~ S0uRNa | e torHamd duin-

wike Rzz-w)ws—.ra,bla‘c hearwve, .

City Agency: P2 w ] ng De S{j "

Contact Person: —.S-M-“o\ W" l”a,yv\. <L

Agency Phone: 57 q _ za 4 L'[ Z_

I'have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.
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District # Cotincil Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #;

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015
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CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: ':P]dt A YU and Desh 4" Servicess
Program/Project Name: L V\tj ad U@T“H&BW Y s ~tho

Courler- Soansl Yes/No/NA.

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? _— @%

Reqﬁést Form: If r;at'chinfg funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? -
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the | T
request exclude the matching fund amount? ‘ -
Request Form: [f other funds are to be used for this project, are they ;
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? P

, _ |
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will i
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is ] T
probably NDF. |
FuT1d'i'n_g Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful ; e
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source Is probably NDF. |
Ordinance Requiréd: Is the NDF r_équeSt to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. - N O
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? == V.4 0

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate

and description of cost? " %.w

Date:
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Effective July 2015



Hamilton, Cheri

“

From: Thomas, Regina

Sent: Wednesday, February 17, 2016 9:55 AM

To: Hamilton, Cheri

Ce: Williams, Julia; Reverman, Joe

Subject: FW!: Legal Ad funding for Portland Areawide Rezoning
Attachments: SKMBT_C55416021710000.pdf

Councilwornan Hamikon,
See attached the ieguested invoice for the below mentioned Legal Ad.

Bast Regards
Regina

From: Williams, Julia

Sent: Wednesday, February 17, 2016 9:39 AM

To: Thomas, Regina

Subject: FW: Legal Ad funding for Portland Areawide Rezoning

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Thursday, January 07, 2016 12:57 PM

To: Williams, Julia

Cc: Reverman, Joe

Subject: Re: Legal Ad funding for Portland Areawide Rezoning

Send the invoice for the ad, and a copy of the ad to my office and we can pay for it.
Sent from my iPad

On Jan 6, 2016, at 4:02 PM, "Williams, Julia" <Julia. Williams@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Councilwoman Hamilton,

We are finalizing the rezoning process for recommendations of the Portland Neighborhood Plan as
directed in Resolution No. 011, Series 2015, sponsored by yourself. A legal advertisement will need to be
placed in the Courier-Journal as part of the notification requirements mandated in KRS chapter

100. There is a fee associated with this legal advertisement, and our department is currently seeking
funding. We would like to ask your council district to provide the funding. The fee is calculated as
follows:

$6.75 per line (average 3-4 words per line) pius cost of affidavit ($35.00).

We expect the fee to be approximately between $500.00 and $700.00. The purpose of this email is only
to ensure we will have the funding when the time comes for the Planning Commission public

hearing. Please let us know if your office can provide this funding at your earliest convenience. If so, we
will contact you when we are ready to proceed with the legal advertisement (expected to be on January
13, 2016).

The public hearing date for the Planning Commission is January 21, 2016. Please let me know if you
would like additional information.



Thank you for your time,

Julia Williams AICP, RLA
Planner il

Planning and Design Services
444 South 5th Street Suite 300
Louisville, KY 40202
502.574.6542

Julia.williams@louisvilleky.gov
Useful Links:

Click Here to take our Customer Satisfaction Survey

Sign up to receive notices of developments in your Metro Council District:
hitps:/fpublic.govdelivery.com/accounts/KYLOUISVILL E/subscriber/new

Planning and Design’s Website: http://louisvilleky.gov/government/planning-desien

Review staff reports and supporting documents for a case: https://louisville.legistar.com/Calendar.aspx
Look up case specific information by case number:
http://portal.louisvilleky.gov/codesandregs/mainsearch

ﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this email



R AV aeand o U . \ "BILLING PERIOD T TERMS OF PAYMENT |
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PO Box 740031 « 525 West Broadway FTGTAL AMOUNT DUE AMGUNT PAID
Louisville, KY 40201-7431 287.57
* ACCOUNT ¥ > ADVERTISERICLIENT §
www.courier-journal.com 618150
RETURN THiS SECTION WITH PAYMENT .
_ . - . —
Louisville Courer-Journal
LOUISVILLE METRC PLANNING COMM O e ,
Iy I T J i 2
B 444 s 5TH ST STE 300 DALLAS, TX 75287-7353 |
LOUISVILLE K¥Y 40202-4312 5407 _ . y
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LOUISVILLE METRO PLANNING COMM
141 5000000000000000000382493L300028757L1074 . DUE DATE ‘PAGE®;
02/26/16 1
TEAR ALONG THIS LINE
RETAIN FOR YOUR RECORDS
| “DATE |  “NEWSPAPER T ET DESCR:PTEON % THAES RUN | " SAU SIZE
REFEREMNCE : Wi B P RATE YBULEDUNITS |
12728 *&*% PREVIOUS BALANCE *w*
01/13 |Classified PUBLIC HEARING the Louisv g IX 24.00= 192.00
0000983847 0014-LEGAL NOTICES (P 287,57
SALESPERSON: NELSON
STATEMENT OF - ACGCOUNT AGRG OF PAST DUE AMOUNTS UNAPPLIED AMOUNTS ARE WCLUDED :u THE TOTAL AMOUNT DuE
| #CURRENT NET ANGUNTDUE . _ ___ “30DAYS &6 DAY 2 OVER 96 DAYS APD AMOUNT DUE
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@he Concler-donenal

Order Conftrmation for Ad #: 0060983847

Cugtomar:  LOUISVILLE METRO PLANNING C
Adtiregg: 444 S 5TH 8T STE 300
LOVISVILLE Y 402024313 USA
dogh ¥ LCJ-818150
Phope: 5025745230
EMali;
Pavor; LCUISVILLE METRG PLANNING C
Ordered By: Julia Williams

OrderStart Date: 0113/2616 Order End Date: 01/49/2016
Tear Sheets ARldayits BindBox  Promo Type Materials Spacial Prici
[3 L] :
Mat Amount Tax amount  Total Amount Payment Method Bavment Amount  Amount Due
§287.57 $0.00 $287 .57 Credit Card £0.00 $287.67
Ad Order Notes;,
Saisn Rap: jrichardson2 Ordor Taker: richardson2
Product itins Star Dats £nd Date
LCJ-Cd.com 7 011132016 o1HH2018

Le)-Couriar Journal 1 pratykorligld HH3206
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PUBLIC HEARING the Louisvilie
Metro Planning Commission will
hold a public hearing on Janu-
arly 21, 2016, at 1:00 pm at the
Old Jail Buildin?, 514 W, Liberty
Street, Loubville, Kentucky for
case no. 15AREA1002, an area-
wide change in zoning on multi-
ple ﬁroperties in the Portland
Neighborhood. Said case may
be inspectad in the office of
Metro Planning and Design, 444
S 5th St., Suite 300, Louisville,
Kentucky. if special accommo-
dations will be required or addi-
tional information is needed
please contact Planning and De-
sign at 574-6230 or www.louisvi
{leky.gov/planningdesign.




Hamilton, Cheri
m

From: Williams, Julia

Sent: Wednesday, January 06, 2016 4:02 PM

To: Hamilton, Cheri

Ce: Reverman, Joe

Subject: Legal Ad funding for Portland Areawide Rezoning

Councilwoman Hamilton,

We are finalizing the rezoning process for recommendations of the Portland Neighborhood Plan as directed in Resolution
No. 011, Series 2015, sponsored by yourself. A legal advertisement will need to be placed in the Courier-Journal as part
of the notification requirements mandated in KRS chapter 100. There is a fee associated with this legal advertisement,
and our department is currently seeking funding. We would like to ask your coungil district to provide the funding. The
fee is calculated as follows:

$6.75 per line (average 3-4 words per line) plus cost of affidavit ($35.00).

We expect the fee to be approximately between $500.00 and $700.00. The purpose of this email is only to ensure we will
have the funding when the time comes for the Planning Commission pubiic hearing. Please let us know if your office can
provide this funding at your earliest convenience. If so, we will contact you when we are ready to proceed with the legal
advertisement (expected to be on January 13, 2016).

The public hearing date for the Planning Commission is January 21, 2016. Please let me know if you would like
additional information.

Thank you for your time,

Julia Williams AICP, RLA
Planner 1l

Planning and Design Services
444 South 5th Street Suite 300
Louisville, KY 40202
502.574.6942

Julia.williams@louisvilleky.gov
Useful Links:

Click Here to take our Customer Satisfaction Survey
Sign up to receive notices of developments in your Metro Counci! District:

https://public.govdelivery.com/accounts/KYLOUISVILLE/subscriber/new

Planning and Design's Website: http://louisvilleky.sov/government/planning-design

Review staff reports and supperting documents for a case: https://louisville.legistar.com/Calendar.aspx
Look up case specific information by case number: http://portal.louisvilleky.gov/codesandregs/mainsearch

g,% Please consider the environment before printing this email




