Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
¢ Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: DAVIA J AW} |

[Amount:% 4,220 Date: (¢[95 [7020 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): ﬁ/w\d S Wil e

uged ™ purchode 5 Speed MAMPS ang o speed
luwmp Signs 1oy W. Brec-nvidge st getweer,

OWie motwan U8 aind S 16™ Spreet.

City Agency: eweﬂb oow 3
Contact Person: Ww C Wries
Agency Phone:609* 5. b%g?

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # i )r;“ Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF,MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name; b\/\(_ N OY WS

Program/Project Name:% ﬂ'\AW\P 0 &‘u\hth l \N(‘Hecﬁ\s%(§%%(/

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? v

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?
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DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND ASSETS

LOUISVILLE, KENTUCK Y

GREG FISCHER VANESSA D, BURNS

RMAYUR Director
TO: Councilman David James
District 6
FROM: Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering
DATE: May 22, 2020
RE: Cost of Speed Humps for W. Breckinridge Street

Three (3) Speed Humps x $2,800.00 = $8,400.00
Two (2) Speed Hump Signs x $260.00 = $520.00
Total = $8,920.00

Please consider this letter as our official Statement of Cost for all speed hump related work.

Each speed hump, including markings is $2,800.00 and each sign is $260.00. Based on our
Engineering Studies, a total of three (3) speed humps and two ( 2) speed hump signs have been
proposed for W. Breckinridge Street between Dixie Highway and S. 15" Street. The total “not to

exceed” cost is $8,920.00.

Upon funding approval, the speed humps will be installed as schedule and weather permits.

Please let me know if you have any questions. You may contact me at 574-3882.

Sincerely,

C=H 2

Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

WWW LOUISVILLEKY GOV
METRO DEVELOPMENT CENTER 444 SOUTH S STREET SUITE 400 LOUISVILL ECKENTUCKY 40202



W WY T W WUV T W

00°0Z6‘8$ = lej0L subig dwny peadg

00°00¥‘8$ = 00°008°Z$ X €
0202 ‘9z Areniqaq sdwny poaadg

mQE—‘—I cmmnm Amv FIVIS 0L ION
p—

IM 192418,
Joans mmﬁ_hc_v_omhm M UIPIM } Le @

T

SRR

)

I»/HW,XV‘UDFZWX m

iy

T —

‘uoljesoj siyj je ysod

SALIP MaU 0} enbejd paads Atosiape
ydw G| di-gLM .81 UB Yyim peayy
dwny paadg e}-/LM ..0€ © PPY

dwny pasds e}-LLM ,0€ € PPY




Dearing, Connie M.

From: Dearing, Connie M.

Sent: Thursday, June 25, 2020 3:26 PM

To: Dearing, Connie M.

Subject: FW: Statement of Cost and speed hump/signage layout for W. Breckinridge Street

From: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, June 25, 2020 3:10 PM

To: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Tavlor@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Statement of Cost and speed hump/signage layout for W. Breckinridge Street

Shalanna,

Public Works will accept the funds in the amount of $8,920.00 for the W. Breckinridge Street speed hump/signage
project.

Greg

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Tavior@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, june 25, 2020 3:05 PM

To: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Statement of Cost and speed hump/signage layout for W. Breckinridge Street

| am getting the appropriations paperwork completed for this project.
Will public works accept the funds of $8,920.00?

Thank you,

Shalanna Taylor
Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ky 40202

| Office: 502-574-1106 |

| Direct: 502-574-3910 |

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow®@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, May 22, 2020 5:35 PM




To: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Statement of Cost and speed hump/signage layout for W. Breckinridge Street

Shalanna,

Please see attached statement of cost and speed hump/signage layout for W. Breckinridge Street. | received the ballots
from Ms. Duncan and 70% balloting has been achieved.

The reason for the $2,800.00 per speed hump is because W. Breckinridge Street is approximately 37 ft. in width. Any
street width over 30’, the cost is $2,800.00 as appose to the normal cost of $2,050.00.

Greg

Gregory A. Dow

Dept. of Public Works and Assets (Traffic Engineering)
601 W. Jefferson Street, Suite 4

Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-3882 - phone

(502) 574-3140 - fax

greg.dow®@louisvilleky.gov




Dearing, Connie M.

From: Taylor, Shalanna

Sent: Thursday, June 25, 2020 3:39 PM

To: Dearing, Connie M.

Subject: President approval for item: TMP-389
Attachments: SMCO-601-KM20062515110.pdf

Ms. Connie,

Please allow item TMP-389 to be entered into new business per President James approval.

Thank you,

Shalanna Taylor
Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisville, Ry 40202

| Office: 502-574-1106 |

l Direct: 502-574-3910 ]

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: ScantoMail@louisvilleky.gov <ScantoMail@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, June 25, 2020 3:12 PM

To: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Message from MCO-601-KM-BizHubC360i-D




