Print Form W

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
m Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler |

| Amount: $30,000.00 Date: 4-18-19 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Capital Infrastructure Fund will be directed to Public Works for completion of Section 1 of the
Ashby Lane Sidewalk Project. This project is scheduled to be done in 2 section. These funds will
be added to previous funds given to this project.

City Agency: puyplic Works & Assets

Contact Person: gieye Kurowsky

Agency Phone: (502) 574-8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

14 $30,000.00 4-18-19
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
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Department/Project:
Public Works/Ashby Lane Sidewalk Project

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will

be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Ashby Lane Sidewalk Project
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

M E E E

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Vs
funding source is probably NDF. '
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes B
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA B
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA E‘
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes lzl

Submitted by:'%%?/// %////V/ » 27 3 S Date: %/d@— /

Revised May 2016



Thieneman, Cindy L

From: Kurowsky, Steve M.

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2019 9:09 AM
To: Thieneman, Cindy L

Cc: Fowler, Cindi

Subject: Ashby Lane Sidewalk Funding

District 14 Office,

Louisville Metro Public Works (Steve Kurowsky) will accept $30,000 in CIF funding to help fund the Ashby Lane new
sidewalk project. The project is getting ready to go to construction soon.

Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government
Transportation Division
Metro Development Center
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202

Tel (0): (502) 574-8743

Tel (¢): (502) 565-7601

Steve.Kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov




Thieneman, Cindy L

R e e A o o R T
From: Kurowsky, Steve M.
Sent: Thursday, April 11,2019 9:03 AM
To: Fowler, Cindi; Thieneman, Cindy L
Cc: Stenberg, Beth
Subject: Ashby Lane Sidewalk
CW Fowler,

I have completed the following tasks regarding the Ashby Lane New Sidewalk Project:

e Tree Removal price from Bob Ray — Scheduled for the end of April
e Easement Donation from Home Owner — Completed
® Culvert Extension cost from my contractor — Received yesterday

['am ready to make PO# and give a Notice to Proceed to my contractors, however, the final projected costs are outlined
below. Beth S. has already seen these numbers:

$10,000.00
$35,000.00

$5,000.00
$48,389.96
$13,500.00
$33,581.77

$3,528.27

$55,792.27 New Appropriation
$204,792.27 Total available
$15,600.00 Design Cost

$189,192.27

Latest Construction
$215,000.00 FEstimate

$25,807.73 Still Needed

Can we still move forward now with the idea that some funds can be made available by the time | get invoiced (say
around July 1, 2019)?

Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government



Transportation Division
Metro Development Center
444 South 5% Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202

Tel (0): (502) 574-8743

Tel (c): (502) 565-7601

Steve.Kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov




Thieneman, Cindy L

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Steve,

Fowler, Cindi

Wednesday, April 17, 2019 12:56 PM

Kurowsky, Steve M.

Re: Notice to Proceed - Ashby Lane Tree & Brush Removal

I have instructed my assistant to transfer $30K for the remainder of this phase of the project. Should be on new
business this Monday. Thanks for all your work on this one!l! Cindi

Sent from my iPad

On Apr 17, 2019, at 11:12 AM, Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

NOTICE TO PROCEED

TO Bob Ray:

o

This is your Notice to Proceed for tree and brush removal on Ashby Lane. PO# 323147-220 will
be used for this work.

Trees / areas were marked in the field by Adam Palmer. There should be 3 different work zones
here.

Please find attached the Grant of Temp. Easement by the Stanchin property owner and the plan
set showing the limits of the easement. It is 20’ off the existing fence line.

The white fence (circled in the photo below) can be removed to access the tree removal

area. Please try to not damage the horizontal boards. | hope to use a few of them to repair a
different part of the fence on the homeowners property. The gate may be locked and therefore
not usable to Bob Ray.

Work can begin ASAP as weather permits.

Please let me know when your scheduled to start/complete the work.

Invoice to be paid upon completion and inspection of the work.



Please contact me if there are any questions or concerns,

Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE
Louisville Metro Government
Transportation Division
Metro Development Center
444 South 5" Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202

Tel (0): (502) 574-8743

Tel (c): (502) 565-7601

Steve.Kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov

<Grant of Temp Easement (signed).pdf>
<2019 03 22_AshbyLaneSW-Plans.pdf>



