Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
- Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: Counciman Rick Blackwell, District 12 ]

| Amount: $785.00 Date: 3/9/15 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding to remove tree at 125 Mills Drive. This property is a cemetery and the
owner is unknown.

City Agency:  Metro Public Works

Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

»

12 1\:& $785.00 ™ lp- 15

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

TETRE COUNCYL, CTrnE

Revised July 2013 REVIEWED
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~ NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Removal of tree at 125 Mills Drive

the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? n/a
Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the il
request form description?
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching -
fund amount?
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in il
the request form description?
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building i
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If n/a
not, the funding source is probably NDF,
Ordinance Required: Isthe NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? N
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for Al

 Prepared by:

Effective October 2013



Kennedy, Liz

= =
From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2015 11:34 AM
To: Damjanovic, Branka
Cc: Kennedy, Liz
Subject: RE: SR 4336609 - 125 Mills Drive

Appropriate the funds and then we’ll get a Purchase Order for the contractor to complete the work.

Jeff Brown, PE, PTOE

From: Damjanovic, Branka

Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2015 10:44 AM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E

Cc: Kennedy, Liz

Subject: RE: SR 4336609 - 125 Mills Drive

Good Morning, Mr. Brown,
| just wanted to confirm that Public Works would accept funding for this tree to be removed.

Thanks,
Branka

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2015 9:52 AM
To: Damjanovic, Branka

Subject: FW: SR 4336609 - 125 Mills Drive

$768 to remove the tree at 125 Mills Dr

Jeff Brown, PE, PTOE

From: Barnett, Joe

Sent: Monday, March 09, 2015 4:49 PM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E

Cc: Maier, Tim

Subject: FW: SR 4336609 - 125 Mills Drive

Price from Bob Ray. Told her I would let her know tomorrow.

From: Charlotte Dawson [mailto:cdawson@bobrayco.com]
Sent: Monday, March 09, 2015 4:48 PM

To: Barnett, Joe

Subject: RE: SR 4336609 - 125 Mills Drive

Joe,
The price on the tree @ 125 Mills Drive will be $768.00.

Thanks



Charlotte

From: Barnett, Joe [mailto:Joe.Barnett@louisvilleky.gov]
Sent: Monday, March 9, 2015 12:10 PM

To: Charlotte Dawson

Subject: RE: SR 4336609 - 125 Mills Drive

Thanks

Sent from my Verizon Wireless 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: Charlotte Dawson

Date:03/09/2015 12:09 PM (GMT-05:00)
To: "Barnett, Joe"

Subject: RE: SR 4336609 - 125 Mills Drive

Joe,
Tee going to send one of the guy’s to look @ the tree, so we will be to tell you later today or tomorrow.

Thanks
Charlotte

From: Barnett, Joe [mailto:Joe.Barnett@Iouisvilleky.gov]
Sent: Monday, March 9, 2015 11:50 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E; Barnett, Joe
Cc: Maier, Tim; Damjanovic, Branka; Charlotte Dawson
Subject: Re: SR 4336609 - 125 Mills Drive

Jeff, I will copy Ms. Dawson at Bob Ray Company with the size of this tree that Council wants removed and
she may, with size be able to tell Council the price of removal.

Ms. Dawson if you have any other questions you can call me at 379-9323 thanks ‘

VL
et

Sent from my iPad

On Mar 9, 2015, at 8:16 AM, Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.cov> wrote:

Joe,

Can you get an estimate from Bob Ray to remove the tree at 125 Mills Dr? The lot is a cemetery and the
owner is unknown so CM Blackwell will appropriate funds for the removal but needs a cost estimate to
proceed. You might have taken care of this in late January so check your records.

Jeff Brown, PE, PTOE

From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Wednesday, January 28, 2015 7:06 AM
To: Kennedy, Liz



