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CIF042022PW13

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
- Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
» Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)

{ Primary Sponsor: Councilman Mark Fox

| Amount: $8864.30 Date: 4/5/2022

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

brackets, batteries and mstaliatlon

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

D-13 requests a CIF in the amount of $8864.30 to fund 2 solar feedback signs to be placed on
roadways in an effort to curb speeding. Cost wu!! include solar speed signs; universal mounting

City Agency: Public Works/Streets and Markings

Contact Person: Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502-574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

13 DT, $8864.30 4/5/2022
District # " Council Member Sigriag e AN __: Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #:  CIF042022PW13 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #;
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works/Signs and Markings - Solar Driver Feedback Signs

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dellars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works/Signs and Markiggs

Program/Project Name:

Solar Driver Feedback Speed Signs

estimate and description of cost?

UUUUUU Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid v
es

eth-Alexander

Date: 04/05/2022

Revised May 2016




Harward, Sonza

From: Fox, Mark H.

Sent: Thursday, April 7, 2022 11:37 AM
To: Alexander, Elizabeth; Harward, Sonya
Subject: RE: Approval Request Reminder

Madam Clerk,

Approved.

Respectfully,
Mark

————— Original Message-----

From: Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Alexander@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, April 7, 2022 11:14 AM

To: Fox, Mark H. <Mark.Fox@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Nichols, Barbara J <Barbara.Nichols@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: Approval Request Reminder

Mark will you please send an email that allows me to sign your NDF and CIF for the Fairdale parking
lot money and speed signs? THANKS

————— Original Message-----

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@!louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, April 7, 2022 11:11 AM

To: Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Alexander@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Approval Request Reminder

Sorry, one more thing. Can you include an email about CM Fox allowing you to sign for him?

Thanks,
Sonya

Sonya Harward
Louisville Metro Council Clerk
601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-2704 (direct)
(502)574-3902 (ofc)
(502)500-5440 (cell)



Harward, Sonya

L ]
From: Alexander, Elizabeth
Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2022 9:11 AM
To: Harward, Sonya
Subject: FW: Driver feedback speed limit signs

FYl

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, April 11, 2022 10:08 AM

To: Fox, Mark H. <Mark.Fox@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Alexander@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Driver feedback speed limit signs

Public Works will accept funds for the purchase and installation of driver feedback speed limit signs in District 13.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director of Public Works
444 S 5™ St, 4* Floor

Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-0065

Cell (502)773-3222
Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov




From: Lindsey Mueller <lindsey.mueller@tapconet.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 11:35 AM

To: Alexander, Elizabeth; Sparks, Stuart

Subject: RE: speed signs

Attachments: Sales-Quote Q22001101.pdf

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unfess you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Hi Elizabeth,
| have attached the quote with an updated expiration.

Thanks,
Lindsey

Lindsey Mueller
Account Manager

Office: (262) 649-4466

lindsey musller@tanconet.com
Visit ug at TAPCOnet.com

From: Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Alexander@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 10:14 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@louisvilieky.gov>; Lindsey Mueller <lindsey.mueller@tapconet.com>
Subject: RE: speed signs

Good morning,
| was working on the request for speed signs and realized the expiration date is 4/7/2022. Can | use the quote we

received or do ! need a new one? Thanks in advance, elizabeth

From: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart Sparks@louisvilieky.gov>
Sent: Friday, March 4, 2022 2:13 PM




To: Lindsey Mueller <lindsey.mueller@tapconet.com>
Cc: Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth. Alexander @loulsvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: speed signs

Lindsey,

I would like a quote for (2) EV12 driver feedback signs, 90 or 100 watt solar panels, universal mounting brackets (for
mounting on (2) 2”7 x 2" square posts) and (2) batteries for each unit.

Thanks,

Stuart

From: Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Alexander@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, March 3, 2022 2:24 PM

To: Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@touisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Nichols, Barbara J <Barbara. Nichels@louisvilleky . gov>; Fox, Mark H. <Mark, Fox@louisvillaky, gov>
Subject: FW: speed signs

Hi Stuart,
Dan Luckett sent me your contact about the “drivers feedback signs” they ordered for D- 15. We would like to order
some and are locking for direction. Appreciate your assistance. THANKS

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, March 3, 2022 2:19 PM

To: Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth. Alexander@louisvilleky.gov>; Hughes; Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Nichols, Barbara | <Barbara.Nichols@louisvilleky gov>

Subject: RE: speed signs

Call/Email Stuart Sparks’

Subject: RE: driver feedback signs

$8,152.00 + $345.70 + $366.60 = $8,864.30 PLUS $265 X TWO for installation of two poles = $530.00 + $8,864.30 = 9,394.30 EV MOUNTING IS
WHAT WE GOT.

139276 EV 12" Radar Feedback Sign,90 Watt Solar
Panel,White HIP Face,1 Year Cloud Service

2 EA 4,076.00 $8,152.00

142059 Battery, 18Ah, Lead Acid, Radar Feedback Sign 2 EA 172.85 $345.70
1485-00075 Universal Mounting 2-Part Full
Set,MountingBracket ,LockingPlate&Key,Pole-
Mount Plate,Mrdw incld

2 EA 183,30 $366.60

Please specify which model this is mounting EV

or

1

TAPCO OMNIA Pariners Contract # 2020-200
Thank you! - Lindsey Mueller at TAPCQO
262-649-4466

lindsey.muslisr@lapconelcom

From: Alexander, Ellzabeth <E! zabeth Alexaﬂder@mmswi!eky gov>
Sent: Thursday, March 3, 2022 2:09 PM
To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Lucketi@louisvilleky.eov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
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Cc: Nichols, Barbara J <Barbara.Nichols@louisvilleky gov>
Subject: speed signs

Hey, can you all tell about the speed signs that flash and encourage people to slow down that you all purchased for your
district? Mark wants some.

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action In relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be

uniawful.




TAPCO SALES QUOTE

Safe travels.

Q22001101
121/2022

Traffic and Parking Control Ce.,, Inc.

5100 West Brown Deer Road
Brown Deer, Wisconsin 53223

Phone (800) 236-0112 « TAPCOnet.com « Fax (800) 444-0331

i Louisvilie Metro Public Works
| Stuart Sparks

601 W Jefferson St, Rm 10
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202
USA

Louisville Metro Public Works
Stuart Sparks

601 W Jefferson St, Rm 10
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202
USA

DRIVER FEEDBACK |5/5/2022  |Lindsey Musller Net 30 DAYS INCLUDED

Item Description anti UM Price Extension

139276 EV 12" Radar Feedback Sign,90 Watt Solar 2 EA 4,076.00 $8,152.00
Panel,White HIP Face,1 Year Cloud Service

142059 Battery, 18Ah, Lead Acid, Radar Feedback Sign 2 EA 172.85 $345.70

1485-00075 Universal Mounting 2-Part Full 2 EA 183.30 : $366.60
Set,MourtingBracket ,LockingPiate&Key,Pole- . .
Mount Plate,Hrdw Incld
Please specify which model this is mouniing EV
or
5P

TAPCO OMNIA Partners Contract # 2020-200
Thank youl - Lindsey Muelter at TAPCO
262-549-4466

lindsey.mueller@tapconet.com

Shipment within
Acceptance By
Date

By

All prices are listed in US Dollars (USD}
For terms and conditions, please visil: hitps:/fwww.tapconet.com/terms-conditions

$8,864.30 . $8,864.30






