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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
® Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Brandon Coan |

| Amount: $16,744.00 Date: 8.9.18 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

28 new litter bins to be placed on Bardstown Road, Barret Avenue, Baxter Avenue, Newburg
Road and Taylorsville Road.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502 574 0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

B @

$16,744.00 8.9.18

District # unci{ Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works/ Litter Bins for District 8 Commercial Corridors

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpese.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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- NDF,CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Litter Bins for District 8 Commercial Corridors
‘ Yes/No/NA

Request Form: s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

- Appropriating Funding? Yes [ﬂ
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with ‘ ;
account numbers in the request form description? NA

- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of .
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA B
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they _
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF. =
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes H

- Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? _
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes B
Submitted by: Jasmine Weatherby Date: 8.9.18

Revised May 2016




Weatherby, Jasmine

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Wednesday, June 13,2018 1:18 PM

To: Coan, Brandon; Fenster, Steve A; Baldon, Antonio J Sr; nseivers@ridetarc.org

Cc: Hackett, Keith; Allen, Craig L; Flood, Pete C.; Adams, Mark; acopic@ridetarc.org;
Weatherby, Jasmine; Robert Kahne; Pennington,Sarah Morgan

Subject: RE: Request for New Litter Bins

Attachments: Litter Bin Placement.xIsx; Request for New Litter Bins - 2.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

The attached pdf is the result of the inspection for bin locations.
Locations 10, 13, 14, 24, 25, 26, 27 & 28 will probably need concrete pads poured.

Location 16 at Barret and Goddard doesn’t have a spot for a bin but we can reevaluate after the multiuse path project is
complete.

Location 18 at 1001 Baxter is too narrow for a bin.
Location 19 on the cemetery side of Baxter across from Lucia is not a good spot.

Location 22 at 2209 Taylorsville Rd is too narrow for a bin.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Coan, Brandon

Sent: Monday, June 4, 2018 5:04 PM

To: Fenster, Steve A <Steve.Fenster@louisvilleky.gov>; Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>;
nseivers@ridetarc.org

Cc: Hackett, Keith <Keith.Hackett@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Allen, Craig L
<Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>; Flood, Pete C. <Pete.Flood@louisvilleky.gov>; Adams, Mark <madams@ridetarc.org>;
acopic@ridetarc.org; Weatherby, Jasmine <Jasmine.Weatherby@louisvilleky.gov>; Robert Kahne <rkahne@gmail.com>;
Pennington,Sarah Morgan <sarah.pennington@louisville.edu>

Subject: Request for New Litter Bins

Folks,
As some of you will recall, | surveyed my District 8 last year to identify gaps in our public litter bin system:

https://louisvilleky.gov/government/metro-council-district-8/keep-district-8-clean-beautiful#17

Finally, after a lot of work, | have a list of 28 new litter bins (and money to pay for them) that | would like to be deployed
pending everyone’s approval. Please see attached and let me know your thoughts. It appears that 11 of the 28 new
bins would be at TARC locations — so are those to be treated differently in terms of type of litter bin/TARC's
responsibility to help pay for them/etc.?
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Helton, Jessamyn

= e e == DT
From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Monday, August 27, 2018 1:20 PM
To: Weatherby, Jasmine
Subject: District 8 - 8/24/18 Appropriations Committee Comments

Public Works will accept $16,744 for the installation of 28 new litter bins at the locations attached. The cost per bin is
$598 installed and includes one plastic liner. Additional liners are available for $140 each if necessary.

leffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director of Public Works
444 s 5™ St, 4™ Floor

Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-0065

Cell (502)773-3222
Jeffrey.brown@Iouisvilleky.gov




